## CITY OF FORT WORTH 15-0284 CITY EQUIPMENT AND VEHICLE TOWING BID TABULATION

INVITATION TO BID 18-0290	UNIT	Unit	Sterling Tow	terling Towing & Recovery LLC.		Texas Towing Inc.	
CITY EQUIPMENT AND VEHICLE TOWING	QTYS		UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	
Class A service within 30 miles, up to and including 30 minutes of extra work in all tows. Price to be quoted per each tow.		EA		\$343,200.00		\$257,400.00	
Class A service exceeding 30 miles, up to and including 30 minutes of extra work in all tows		EA		\$300.00		\$150.00	
Class A additional labor charges. Shall not include travel time, waiting time, cleanup time and other items until the 30 minutes of extra work included in all tows expires		HR		\$2,875.00		\$2,300.00	
Class B service within 30 miles, up to and including 45 minutes of extra work in all tows. Include pulling of axles and drive-lines.		EA		\$0.00		\$66,600.00	
Class B service exceeding 30 miles, up to and including 45 minutes extra work in all tows. Include pulling of axles and drive-lines.		EA		\$0.00		\$180.00	
Class B additional labor charges. Shall not include travel time, waiting time, cleanup time and other items until the 45 minutes of extra work included in all tows expires		HR		\$0.00		\$3,800.00	
Class C service within 30 miles, up to and including 60 minutes extra work in all tows. Include pulling of axles and drive-lines.		EA	NO BID	\$0.00		\$68,250.00	
Class C service exceeding 30 miles, up to and including 60 minutes extra work in all tows. Price must include pulling of axles and drivelines.		EA	NO BID	\$0.00		\$204.00	
Class C additional labor charges. Shall not include travel time, waiting time, cleanup time and other items until the 60 minutes of extra work included in all tows expires.		HR	NO BID	\$0.00		\$9,540.00	
Trailer service to transport vehicles and equipment up to 85,000 pounds within 30 miles, up to and including 60 minutes of extra work in all tows. Excludes vehicles that can be towed under lines 1 through 6 of this bid.		EA	NO BID	\$0.00		\$157,500.00	
Trailer service to transport vehicles and equipment up to 85,000 pounds exceeding 30 miles, up to and including 60 minutes of extra work in all tows. Excludes vehicles that can be towed under lines 1 through 6 of this bid.		F.4	NO PID	<b>#0.00</b>		<b>#240.00</b>	
ulis biu.		EA	NO BID	\$0.00 \$346,375.00		\$340.00 \$566,264.00	

## CITY OF FORT WORTH 15-0284 CITY EQUIPMENT AND VEHICLE TOWING BID TABULATION

INVITATION TO BID 18-0290	UNIT	Unit	Sterling Towing & Recovery LLC.		Texas Towing Inc.	
CITY EQUIPMENT AND VEHICLE TOWING	QTYS		UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST