Bid Tabulation for Asphalt - Hot and Cold Lay

ITB NO. 18-0160

Buyer: John Padinjaravila Baby

Bid Opening Date : April 5, 2017

\ \ \ \
NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Reynolds Asphalt The Lane Construction |Austin Asphalt JLB Contracting Asphalt Patch | | 5% of
Euless, Texas Justin, Texas Irving, Texas Fort Worth, Texas NB, Texas | | Lowest
bidder
Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
Description Quantity | Unit| Price Total| Price Total| Price Total| Price Total| Price Total
1|Asphalt, Hot Mix, Cold Lay 225 Ton | No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Asphalt, Hot Mix, Hot Lay, Type B, .
2|Picked up at vendor's plant 1,125 Ton | $54.00 $60,750.00 $57.00 $64,125.00| $56.00 $63,000.00| No Bid $46.99
Asphalt, Hot Mix, Hot Lay, Type B, .
3|Delivered to the job site 9,000 Ton | $62.50| $562,500.00 $66.50 $598,500.00| $61.00 $549,000.00( No Bid $59.06
Asphalt, Hot Mix, Hot Lay, Type D, .
4|picked up at the vendor plant 22,500 | Ton| $57.00( $1,282,500.00 $57.00| $1,282,500.00| $58.00{ $1,305,000.00( No Bid $50.14
Asphalt, Hot Mix, Hot Lay, Type D, .
5|Delivered to job site 45,000 | Ton | $65.50| $2,947,500.00 $66.50| $2,992,500.00| $63.00| $2,835,000.00| No Bid $62.21
High Performance Asphaltic Concrete . N
6|Pothole Patching 2,250 Ton | No bid $105.00 $236,250.00 No Bid $102.38
7|Tack Coat/Tack Emulsion 600 EA | No bid No Bid No Bid
High Performance Asphaltic Concrete . . . )
8|Pothole Patching Mix, 60-Lbs Bags. 200 EA | No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.46| $3,492.00
High Performance Asphaltic Concrete . . . .
Pothole Patching Mix, 50-Lbs Bags. 200 EA | Nobid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $4,853,250.00 $4,297,218.75 $5,157,000.00 $4,991,050.00 $3,492.00
All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to
evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual
award by the City until contract information is posted.




