BID TABULATION FOR TRASH CAN LINERS

BID NO. 18-0025 BID OPENING DATE: 12/7/2017
NAME OF BIDDER Interboro Packaging Corp Unipak Sysco North Texas Interline Brands, Inc All American Poly
Montgomery, NY 12549 Brooklyn, NY 11230 Lewisville, TX 75056 Fort Worth, TX 76155 Piscataway, NJ 08854
Unit of
Iltem # Quantity | Issue | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total | | Unit Price Total | | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 35x56, 100 bags per box, 1.8 mil, black 2,154 Box $14.84 $31,965.36 $17.90 $38,556.60 $24.85 $53,526.90 $25.15 $54,173.10 $15.45 $33,279.30
2 |33x40, 100 bags per box, 2 mil, Clear 500 Box $12.72 $6,360.00 $16.50 $8,250.00 No bid $0.00 $17.61 $8,805.00 $13.99 $6,995.00
3 |43x47, 100 bags per box, 2 mil, Clear 1,600 Box $20.84 $33,344.00 $24.80 $39,680.00 $24.40 $39,040.00 $27.30 $43,680.00 $21.44 $34,304.00
4 43x37, 100 bags per box, 2 mil, Clear 500 Box $15.24 $7,620.00 $19.70 $9,850.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $16.87 $8,435.00
5 33x39, 100 bags per box, 1 mil, Blue transparent 150 Box $8.18 $1,227.00 $10.95 $1,642.50 No bid $0.00 $24.45 $3,667.50 $10.71 $1,606.50
6 |39x46, 100 bags per box, 1.8 mil, clear 1,685 Box $16.82 $28,341.70 $19.70 $33,194.50 No bid $0.00 $24.44 $41,181.40 $19.03 $32,065.55
7 139x46, 50 bags per roll, 1.8 mil, clear with 20" black recycle label on bag 150 Roll $10.32 $1,548.00 $13.40 $2,010.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $9.36 $1,404.00
8 [30x37 100 bags per box, 1.5 mil, yellow with printed 100 Box $11.98 $1,198.00 $14.50 $1,450.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $11.17 $1,117.00
9 |33x39, 250 bags per box, 1 mil, clear 50 Box $15.84 $792.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 $15.39 $769.50 $26.05 $1,302.50 $21.86 $1,093.00
10 |33x39, 200 bags per box, 2 mil, black 75 Box $19.82 $1,486.50 $27.50 $2,062.50 $14.57 $1,092.75 $16.05 $1,203.75 $22.20 $1,665.00
11 |30x36, 100 bags per box, 1.5 mil, mint green with printed text and logo 300 Box $10.24 $3,072.00 $13.25 $3,975.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $10.96 $3,288.00
12 |36x56, 50 bags per roll with center core, 1.8 mil, black 150 Roll $9.98 $1,497.00 $9.60 $1,440.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $9.35 $1,402.50
13 |36x56, 100 bags per box, 1.8 mil, black 250 Box $15.74 $3,935.00 $18.70 $4,675.00 $22.70 $5,675.00 $25.91 $6,477.50 $15.89 $3,972.50
Estimated Total Cost: $122,386.56 $147,786.10 $100,104.15 $160,490.75 $130,627.35
NAME OF BIDDER Film-Pack Inc Country Maid Services The Baldie Corp
Crowley, TX 76036 Arlington, TX 76001 Cincinnati, OH 45227
Unit of
Iltem # Quantity | Issue | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total| | Unit Price Total
1 |35x56, 100 bags per box, 1.8 mil, black 2,154 Box No Bid $0.00 $29.65 $63,866.10 $21.31 $45,901.74
2 |33x40, 100 bags per box, 2 mil, Clear 500 Box No Bid $0.00 $27.95 $13,975.00 $16.95 $8,475.00
3 |43x47, 100 bags per box, 2 mil, Clear 1,600 Box No Bid $0.00 $41.79 $66,864.00 $23.83 $38,128.00
4 43x37, 100 bags per box, 2 mil, Clear 500 Box No Bid $0.00 $32.91 $16,455.00 $19.61 $9,805.00
5 |33x39, 100 bags per box, 1 mil, Blue transparent 150 Box No Bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $10.31 $1,546.50
6 |39x46, 100 bags per box, 1.8 mil, clear 1,685 Box No Bid $0.00 $33.51 $56,464.35 $20.55 $34,626.75
7 |39x46, 50 bags per roll, 1.8 mil, clear with 20" black recycle label on bag 150 Roll No Bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $17.85 $2,677.50
8 30x37 100 bags per box, 1.5 mil, yellow with printed message 100 Box $28.11 $2,811.00 No bid $0.00 $12.17 $1,217.00
9 33x39, 250 bags per box, 1 mil, clear 50 Box No Bid $0.00 $39.41 $1,970.50 $19.78 $989.00
10 |33x39, 200 bags per box, 2 mil, black 75 Box No Bid $0.00 $21.64 $1,623.00 $32.70 $2,452.50
11 |30x36, 100 bags per box, 1.5 mil, mint green with printed text and logo 300 Box $27.09 $8,127.00 No bid $0.00 $11.95 $3,585.00
12 |36x56, 50 bags per roll with center core, 1.8 mil, black 150 Roll No Bid $0.00 $16.25 $2,437.50 $11.90 $1,785.00
13 |36x56, 100 bags per box, 1.8 mil, black 250 Box No Bid $0.00 $30.27 $7,567.50 $21.80 $5,450.00
Estimated Total Cost: $10,938.00 $231,222.95 $156,638.99

All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until agreement information is posted.
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