PHONE #: (817392 - 8387

ITB 17-0469 Laboratory Analytical Services

SGS Accutest Labs Armstrong Forensic A&B Labs Test America Xenco Lab Ana- Lab Corporation Pace Analytical
Ttem Class-ltem Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Total Quantity | Unit P‘i‘:; Total Quantity | Unit | UnitPrice|  Total | Quantity| Unit P‘i‘:; Total | Quantity | Unit P‘i‘;‘; Total |Quantity| Unit P‘i‘:; Total | Quentity| Unit P‘i‘:; Total
Provide pricing for 200.8 Metal Testing for Drinking Water, Waste
‘Water and Solids. Aluminom, Antimony, Arsenic, Barinm,
1 |, Berlium, Cadmiun, Ch"”‘”“m Cﬁfjcucry%kg"‘{,ofgm 100 | BA [$ 17500 §  17,500.00 100 EA | $19500 § 19,50000 100 EA |$ 10000| $ 1000000 100 | EA | $10000| $ 1000000| 100 | EA | $100.00| § 10,00000( 100 | EA | $28000| $ 2890000 100 | EA |$ 800|$ 800,00
Selenjum, Silver, Sodium, Strontium, Thallium, Tin, Titanium,
Vanadinm, Zinc.
2 Drinking and Waste Water SM9223B Total Coliform 0 | EA[$  s000|$ 250000 50 EA |$4500|$ 225000 50 EA |$ 2000[$ 100000 50 EA | $2731|$ 136550 50 EA | $2000($ 100000 50 | EA |$2500|$ 125000 50 EA |$2500|$  1,25000
3 Drinking and Waste Watet - SMS222D Fecel Coliform 0 | EA [$  ss00|$ 275000 50 EA |$4500|$ 225000 50 EA |$ 2000($ 100000 50 EA | $2731|$ 136550 50 EA | $2000($ 100000 50 | EA |$5000|$ 250000 50 EA |$2500|$  1,25000
4 | Drinking and Wasto Water ngﬁ?m [Mewonophic Plate | g0 | gy |5 so00$ 250000 50 EA |$4500|$ 225000 50 EA |$ 25008 125000 50 EA |$4412|$ 220600] 50 | EA |$4000|$ 2000000 S0 | EA |$6000[$ 30000 50 EA |$2500|$ 125000
5 | Drinking and Waste Weter SMS020B Tnhibitory Residue Test 0 | EA[$ 14600|$ 730000 50 EA | $ $ . 50 EA |$ 10000[$ 500000 50 EA | $ $ - s EA [ $2500[$ 125000( 50 | EBa | $ $ -l S0 EA |$8000|$ 400000
6 Drinking and Waste Water SM2320B Alkalinity [Totall 0 | EA[$  2000]$  1,00000 50 EA |$4500|$ 225000 50 EA | $ $ -l s EA |$ 700§ 35000 50 EA |$1800[$ 90000 50 | EA |$2000|$ 100000 50 EA |$1000|$ 50000
7 |Drinking and Wasto Water EP:};;%?, Allalinity [discrote aualyzer]) g | gy | Nopig No bid 50 EA | $ $ . 50 EA |$ 1500[$  75000| 50 EA |$ 700§ 35000 50 | EA |$1500($ 75000 S0 | EA |$21.00($ 105000 50 EA |$1000)$ 50000
8 Dﬂm“‘iw’mw;;gff‘*m 8038 Ammonia 0 | EA | NoBid No bid 50 EA |$4500( 8% 225000 50 EA | $ $ -l s EA | $ $ -] S0 EA | $1800[$ 90000| 50 EA |$2500($% 125000] 50 EA |$1500($ 750.00
9 Dﬁmﬁ%‘?m Water smasoo-ﬁggﬁ-oggkm 50 | EA | NoBid No bid 50 EA | § $ 5 50 EA |$  800[$ 40000 50 EA |$ 300|§ 15000 50 EA |$100|$ 50000 50 | EA |S$2200($ 110000 50 EA |s1000|8 50000
Drinking and Waste Water SM#500-CIE Chloride [discrete
10 S}\ﬁ?()ygecr}_,c 50 | EA | NoBid NoBid 50 EA | $ $ . 50 EA | $ $ -l s EA |$ 800|$ 40000 50 EA | $1200($ 60000 50 | EA [$3500[$ 175000 50 EA |$1000[$ 50000
j |  Drinkine and Wasto Wasterssrggsco&cm Chloride [itzarion] 0 | EA | NoBid No Bid 50 EA |$4500( 8% 225000 50 EA |$ 1500($ 75000 50 EA |$ 800|$ 40000 50 EA | $1200($ 60000| 50 EA |$7500|§ 375000| 50 EA | $1000($ 500.00
jp | Drinking and Westo Wams}szggoooucngcmride Residul [Towll | 5y | gy | NoBid No Bid 50 EA |$4500( 8% 225000 50 EA |$ 1300($ 65000 50 EA |$ 800§ 40000 50 EA | $1200($ 60000| 50 EA |$4000|$ 200000] 50 EA | $1000($ 500.00
13 Drinking and Waste Water SM2510B Conductivity 0 | BA | $2000 $1000.00 50 EA |$2500|$ 125000 50 EA |s 1300[$ 65000 50 EA |$ 700§ 35000 50 EA |$ 7.00[$ 35000 50 | EA |$1300|$ 65000 50 EA |$1000[$ 50000
in Driaking and Waste v?ﬁi%?ém7 Cyaide Modificd 0 | EA | NoBid No Bid 50 EA |$6500($% 325000 50 EA | $ $ -l s EA | $ $ -] S0 EA | $2300{$ L15000| 50 EA |$3700( % 185000 50 EA |$2800($ 140000
15 Driaking and Waste wa;ﬁga;goo-pc Fluoride - Probe 0 | EA | NoBid No Bid 50 EA | § $ - 50 EA |$ 1300($ 65000 50 EA |$ 700|$ 35000 50 EA | $1200($ 60000| 50 EA | $ $ -l s EA | $ 1000 $ 500.00
16 Drinking and Wasto WS%%ACBOJ - Total Hardacss 0 | EA | NoBid No Bid 50 EA |$4500($% 225000 50 EA |$ 1800($ 90000 50 EA |$ 800§ 40000 50 EA |$1500[$ 75000 50 EA | $ $ -l s EA |$ 1200 $ 600.00
17 | Drinking and Waste Water SM2340C Hardness [Titration] 0 | BA | $17.00 $ 850.00 50 EA |$4500|$ 225000 50 EA |s 1800[$ 90000 50 EA |$ 800|$ 40000 50 EA |$1500(8 75000 50 | EA |$2100$ 105000 50 EA | $1600|$ 800,00
18 Dri“h“gﬁyz“e’f]m Waer SM45°%’$§%§§‘3’§;““‘“ 50 | EA | NoBid Nobid 50 EA |$6500|$ 325000 50 EA |$ 220008 110000 50 EA |$§ 700s 35000 s0 | EA |$12000$ 0000 S0 | EA | $ -l 50 EA |$1000)§ 50000
Drinking and Waste Water EPA 353.2 Nitrite [discrete analyzer] | 50 | EA |  $25.00 Nobid 50 EA |$6500|$ 325000 50 EA |$ 20008 110000 50 EA |$ 700$ 35000 50 EA |$1200(8 60000 50 | EA |$ $ -l S0 EA |$1000)$ 50000
Driaking mﬂ‘f:g;f]’m”“ﬁ‘l %ﬁﬁ‘;&"gh"w ldiserete | gy | Ba | NoBid NoBid 50 EA |$4500|$ 225000 50 EA |$ 20008 10000 50 EA |$1400|s 70000 S0 | EA |$1200($ 60000 50 | EA | $ -l 50 EA |$1000)§ 50000
2 Drinking and Waste Water SM4S00HB Ph Electrode O | BA[$  s00[$ 25000 50 EA |$1500)§ 75000 50 EA |$  700[$ 35000 50 EA |$ 500§ 25000 50 EA |$ 500[$ 25000 50 | EA |$1000|$ 50000 50 EA |$ s500/$ 25000
22 | Drinking and Waste Water SM2320B Phenolphthalein Allalinity | 50 | EA |$  2000|§  1,000.00 50 EA | $ $ . 50 EA |s 1s00[$ 75000 50 EA |$ 700§ 35000 50 EA |$1800[$ 90000 50 | EA |$2100$ 105000 50 EA |$1000[$ 50000
3 Dﬁm“ﬁh“ﬁ;ﬁw’mmmBlsss'l;g;gg’hmei“ 0 | EA | NoBid No Bid 50 EA |$7500($ 375000 50 EA | $ $ -l s EA | $ $ -] S0 EA | $1800[$ 90000| 50 EA | $ $ -l s EA | $ 1000 $ 500.00
24 | Drinkine and Wasto Wa'“EP‘;O%?g""S“lfm disoreto analyzer] | g | gy | NoBig NoBid 50 EA |$9500|$ 475000 50 EA |$ 1800$  90000| 50 EA |$ 700§ 35000 50 | EA |$1200($ 60000] S0 | EA |$2200{$ 110000 50 EA |$1000|$ 50000
g5 | Drinkine and Wastc Wa'f‘g?ﬁﬁfl'“’w Dissolved Solids 0 | BA[$ 150008 75000 50 EA |$4500($% 225000 50 EA |$ 1000($ 50000 50 EA |$ 700|$ 35000 50 EA | $1000($ 50000 50 EA |$2000|$ 1,00000] 50 EA | $1000($ 500.00
26 | Drinking and Waste Water EPA 3512 - Total Kieldshl Nitrogen | 50 | EA |$  2500|§  1,250.00 50 EA | $ $ . 50 EA |$ 3000[$ 150000 50 EA |$1500|$ 75000 50 EA |$1800[$ 90000 50 | EA |$3100$ 155000 50 EA |$1500$ 75000




SGS Accutest Labs Armstrong Forensic A&B Labs Test America Xenco Lab Ana- Lab Corporation Pace Analytical
27 D““kmg“dw””w;{zifoi’\;?"*'T"mph"sph"“’s 50 | EA | NoBid No Bid 50 EA |$4500|8 225000 50 EA |$ 2000|$ 100000 50 EA |$ 800|$ 40000 50 EA |$1800|$ 90000 50 EA [$3100|$ 15500 50 EA |$2000|8  1,000.00
28 Drinking and Waste Water SM2130B - Turbidity 50 | EA | NoBid No Bid 50 EA |$4500|$ 225000 50 EA |$ 1000[s 50000 50 EA |5 600|s 30000 50 EA |$1000)8 50000 50 EA |s1400|s 70000 50 EA |5 1000|8 500.00
Drinking and Waste Water EPA 300.1 - Bromate, Bromide
2 Eurobos Brouaie by 3. 3000 100 | EA |$ 133.00)§ 1330000 100 EA |$9500|$ 950000 50 EA |$ 2500[$ 12500 100 | BA |$1600[$ 160000] 100 | EA |$4000|$ 40000 100 | EA |S$10200($ 1020000 100 | EA |$3500|$ 350000
30 Dm“gw“‘egizgéw'cm’"yls 50 | BA [$ 25000|§ 12,500.00 50 EA [$ -|$ 5 50 EA | -|s -l s EA [$ |8 - 50 EA | $15000| $ 7,50000| 50 EA | $20000| § 1000000 50 EA |$8000|$  4000.00
Drinking and Waste Water EPA 551.1 - CHLORAL DYDRATE,
31 [HAN 0 | EA [$ 15000|$ 750000 50 EA |$ -|$ - 50 EA | $ s ) EA |$ -|$ -] S0 EA | $15000| § 7.50000| 50 | EA | $23000|$ 1150000 50 EA | $12400|$ 620000
Eurofins
32 | Drinking and Waste Water SM5310B- Dissolved Organic Carbon | 50 | EA |$ 2500 § 125000 50 EA [$ -|s - 50 EA |$ 1800[$s 90000 50 EA |s1400|s 70000 50 EA |$1800)8 90000| 50 EA |$3300|8 165000 50 EA |$2500|§ 125000
33 D"ma“dw’s‘e‘g{‘.ﬁf‘o 0D - Geosmin/MIB 0 | EA [$ 15000|$ 750000 50 EA |sws00|s 1375000 50 EA |s 20000 § 1000000| 50 EA |$ -|s .| s EA | $20000| $ 1000000 50 EA |s$2000| s 11,0000 50 EA |sms00|s 1175000
Drinking and Waste Water EPA 300.0, FLUORIDE, NITRATE,
3 mmE’ORmo'nggiﬂsﬁEsbg%?TE 100 | EA |$ 10000)§ 10000.00 100 EA | $12500| 8 12,50000 100 EA |$ 7500($ 750000 100 | BA |$4200($ 420000] 100 | EA |$5000|$ 50000 100 | EA |$11000( $ 11,0000 100 | EA |$1000|$  1,00000
35 Drinking Water EPA 552.2 - HAA 100 | EA [$ 15000 § 1500000 100 EA | $ -|$ - 100 EA |$ 17500| $ 1750000 100 | EA |$6000($ 600000 100 | EA |$7000$ 7.00000[ 100 | EA |$12000($ 1200000( 100 | EA |$5500|$ 550000
Drinking Water EPA 525.2 - Semi-Volatile Organics
Carbamates - LCS31CARPEST :Diquat - LCS49DIQ 3
36 | EDB/DBCP - VS04STD; Endothal ~ PS48ENDO - Herbicides | 50 | EA | § L12500| §  56250.00 50 EA [$ -|s - 50 EA |s 250008 1375000 50 EA |$8800(S 440000| 50 EA | $22500| $ 11,2500 50 EA | $3000| § 1500000 50 EA |$17500| s 875000
~ HS15STD; Pesticides PSOSPDW; SOC+OPP -
AB525S0C+OPP
3 D““kmg“dw””w“‘eg::‘ggg}a'T"“’lorg"mcmhde 50 | EA | NoBid No Bid 50 EA | $12500|$ 625000 50 EA | § s -l s EA |$ -|$ -l s EA | $15000| $ 7,50000| 50 EA | $17500| $ 875000 50 EA [$9000|§  4500.00
WASTE WATER EPA 16644 - SGT - HEM Non-Polar Matetial,
38 Oil & Grease [gravimetric] s0 | EA [$ 45008 225000 50 EA |$9500|$ 475000 50 EA S 4000]$ 200000 50 EA |$2200|$ 10000 50 EA | $4500) 8 22500 50 EA |s40|s 22000 50 EA |$3000|$ 150000
0il & Grease
39 Waste Water EPA 16574 - OP Pesticdes in Waste Water 50 | EA [$ 220000 § 1000000 50 EA[$ -|s . 50 EA |$ 12500($ 625000 0 | EA | $ -|$ -] so | EA |si2s00$ 62000 s0 | Ea [s1%000($ 650000| S0 | EA |$10000(§ 500000
© WASTEWATEREPAsos'igg.:][orm"cm"mmmm& 0 | EA [$ 10000$ 500000 50 EA |$9500|$ 475000 50 EA |s 500§ 375000 50 EA | $4500|$ 225000 50 EA [ $9000[$ 450000] 50 | EA [$800[$ 400000 50 EA |$6000|$ 300000
4 WASTE WATER EPA 625 - Semi-Volatile Organics 0 | EA [$ 15000|$ 750000 50 EA | $19500|$ 975000 50 EA |$ 13000($ 650000 50 EA | $8800|$ 440000 50 EA | $12500| § 625000| 50 | EA |$30000|$ 1500000| 50 EA | $13000|$ 650000
2 Drinking Water - EPA 524.2 - Volatiles 0 | EA[$ 145008 725000 50 EA |$ -|$ - 50 EA |$ 11000($ 550000 50 EA |$4500|$ 225000 50 EA | $5000($ 250000] 50 | EA |s$4500|8 725000 50 EA |$7000|$ 350000
3 WASTE WATER EPA 624 - Volatiles Organics 0 | EA [$  ss00|$ 275000 50 EA |$9500|$ 475000 50 EA |$ 5500($ 275000 50 EA | $4500|$ 225000 50 EA | $5500[$ 275000 50 | EA |s$u4500|$ 725000 50 EA |$6500|$ 325000
" SOLID WASTE EPA 8141A - OP Pesticides 0 | EA [$ 11000)$ 550000 50 EA | $19500|$ 975000 50 EA |$ 9000 $ 450000 50 EA | $6500|$ 32500 50 EA | $11000| § 550000{ 50 | EA | $25000|$ 1250000| 50 EA | $10000|$ 500000
45 SOLID WASTE EPA 8081A - Organochlorine Pesticides 0 | EA [$ 85008 425000 50 EA | $19500|$ 975000 50 EA |$ 8500|$ 425000 50 EA | $9000|$ 450000 50 EA | $7500[$ 375000| 50 | EA |$13000|$ 650000 50 EA |$9500|$ 475000
% SOLID WASTE EPA 8082 - PCB's 0 | EA [$ 45008 225000 50 EA |$7500|$ 375000 50 EA |$ 4000 $ 200000 50 EA | $4500|$ 225000 50 EA | $4000($ 200000{ 50 | EA |$8000|$ 400000 50 EA |$5000|$ 250000
a SOLID WASTE EPA 8270B - Semi-Volatiles Organics 0 | EA [$ 15000|$ 750000 50 EA | $19500|$  9750.00 50 EA |$ 13000($ 650000 50 EA | $8800|$ 440000 50 EA | $12500| § 625000| 50 | EA |$30000|$ 1500000| 50 EA | $13000|$ 650000
8 SOLID WASTE EPA 8260B - Volatiles Organics 0 | EA [$  ss00|$ 275000 50 EA |$9500|$ 475000 50 EA |$ 6000|$ 300000 50 EA | $4500|$ 225000 50 EA | $5000($ 250000] 50 | EA |s$4500|$ 725000 50 EA |$6500|$ 325000
© D““kmWa'“’waswwmfégis"hdﬂp“zo‘l'Phe“"ls 0 | EA | NoBid No Bid 50 EA |$6500|$ 325000 50 EA |$ 2500($ 125000 50 EA |$1500($ 75000 50 EA | $3000{$ 150000| 50 EA |$37.00|§ 185000 50 EA |$3000|$ 150000
Drinking Water, Wastewater and Solids EPA 615, EPA 604, EPA
so | 63%orequivalent [state the equivalent mefhod] - Herbicid 50 | EA s s2500|5 2625000 50 EA | § $ 50 EA |$ 95008 47500 50 EA | § $ 50 EA | $35000| $ 17,5000 50 EA |$15000|$ 750000 50 EA |$10000|§ 500000
Ana-Lab for 615, 632. Substitute 625 for 604 to be analyzed by - »220. : - h 10 : - - ~00: - =00 - -000.
SGS
51 Drinking Water, Wastowaer and Solids EPA 166 - s0 | BA | NoBid NoBid 50 EA |8 -|$ - 50 EA | $ |8 -l oo | Ba s -] -| 50 | BA |$80000|$ 4000000 50 | BA |$25000|$ 125000 S0 | EBA |$20000(§ 1000000
sp. | Prinking Water, Westowater and Solids EPA B140 - Pestcides, OP| -y | g | Nopia NoBid 50 EA[$ -|s . 50 EA |$ 13000($ 65000 50 | EA | $ -|$ -| so | EA |sw0000|$ s00000] s0 | Ea [s1%000($ 650000 50 | EA |$10000|$ 500000
53 | Drinking Water, Wastewater and Solids EPA 8260 Volatile 0 | EA [$  ss00|$ 275000 50 EA |$9500|$ 475000 50 EA |$ 5500($ 275000 50 EA | $4500|$ 225000 50 EA | $5000($ 250000] 50 | EA |s$4500|$ 725000 50 EA |$6500|$ 325000




SGS Accutest Labs Armstrong Forensic A&B Labs Test America Xenco Lab Ana- Lab Corporation Pace Analytical
54 Dm]“gwm’w”‘e"’“'eé:’fpfs::;EpAg27°'va"mﬂe 50 | EA 150.00| §  7,500.00 50 EA | $19500|$  9,750.00 50 EA |$§ 13000|$ 650000| 50 EA |$88.00|§ 440000 50 EA | $125.00| $ 625000 50 EA | $30000| § 1500000| 50 EA |$13000($  6500.00
55 Dm]“gwm’w”‘ewmﬁ?)’;%ﬁ&hgm%m‘s'TCLPMe“’]S 50 | EA 8500 §  4,250.00 50 EA [$ -|$ 5 50 EA |$ 9000|$ 45000 50 EA |$47.00|8 23500 50 EA |$900|$ 45000 50 EA | $17900| $ 895000 50 EA |$9000|§  4500.00
56 D““kmgwm’wm"’;:iiz‘:ess"h“EPAsosl'TCLP 50 | EA 11500( §  5750.00 50 EA | $24500| $ 12,250.00 50 EA |$ 10000|$ 500000 50 EA |$6500)8 325000 50 EA | $10000| $ 500000 50 EA |$7000|8 35000 50 EA | $11000|$  5500.00
57 ?,““f“ﬁwm’W”W“‘emds"hdsEPAsls'g%f 50 | EA 13500 §  6,750.00 50 EA [$ -|$ 5 50 EA |$ 10500|$ 525000 50 EA |$8500|§ 425000 50 EA | $11500| $ 575000 50 EA [$9800|8 490000| 50 EA | $11000|§  5500.00
sg. | Drinking Water, Wastewater and Solids EPA 8260 - TCLP Volatle| g | ga 000§ 4,000.00 50 EA | S14500§  7,25000 50 EA |§ 9500|$ 47500| 50 | EBA |$6500(§ 325000 S50 | EA |$7500($ 375000 50 | EA |SI1500($ 575000| 50 | EA | $10000($ 500000
59 D““kmgW“’“’w”’f}:faﬁ:‘éi;‘:;ﬂiim827°TCLPS°““' 50 | EA 17500( §  8750.00 50 EA | $24500| § 12,250.00 50 EA |$ 14000($  7,00000] 50 EA | $10800| $ 5400.00| 50 EA | $13500| § 675000| 50 EA | $22500| § 11,2000 50 EA | $15000|$  7,500.00
oo |Prinking Water, Wastowater and Solids EPA 82608 Pharmacentical| g | gy | o 3ig No Bid 50 EA [$ -|$ - 50 EA [ $  -|$ -l 50 | BA|S -|s -| s | EA |$s000|$ 25000 50 | BA [§ -|S§ -| 50 | EA |su000($ 1050000
61 GEL LABS s -|s - s -|s - s -|s - s -|s - s -|s - s -|s -
IRadionuclide Testing D
Radiological Analysis Methods
A). Gross Alpha
B). Radium - 226/228 0.
Beta Particle D).
Uranium 2)
Subcontracting: If you do not perform the work and subcontract,
the City Fort Worth Lab must be advised [1] who the 3rd Party Lab
62 |11 bo haadling tho teting [2] Proof of NELAP Accreditaten (31 | 25 | EA 40000 §  10,000.00 2 EA |$ -|$ 5 2 EA |$ 40000| § 1000000 25 EA | $39500|$ 987500 25 EA | $25000| § 625000| 25 EA | $50400| § 1260000 25 EA | $2500|$  5875.00
3rd Party Lab's list of Accreditations prior to Samples being
released. 3) Pricing must
be inclusive all charges and detailed 4) All Laboratories|
shall comply with the quality assurance procedures and quality
control reqi ding to applicable NELAC Institne [TNI]
quality systems standards and/or federal or state regulatory
63 w”‘e"'“’“g)dfmmm 50 | EA | NoBid No Bid 50 EA |$ -|8$ - 50 EA |$§ 1500($ 75000 50 EA |$ 800|$ 40000| 50 EA |$1800|$ 90000 50 EA |$ -|8$ -l s EA |$1500|8$ 750.00
64 Wastewater SM4500-NHJB,D - Ammonis Distilled Probe 50 | EA | NoBid No Bid 50 EA [$6500|8 325000 50 EA |$ 1800|$  90000| 50 EA |$ 800|$ 40000 50 EA |$1800|$ 90000 50 EA [$ -|$ -l s EA |$1500($ 750.00
SM4500 NH3H / 350.1
65 Wastewater SM5210B- BOD 5 day 50 | EA 3000(§  1,500.00 50 EA |$4500|$ 225000 50 EA |§ 1500|§ 75000 50 EA |$1400|$ 70000| 50 EA | $2000|$ 100000 50 EA |$2000|8 1,000 50 EA |$1500($ 750.00
66 Wastewater SM5210B- BOD 5 day [Carbonaceons] 50 | EA 3000(§  1,500.00 50 EA |$4500|$ 225000 50 EA |§ 1500|§ 75000 50 EA |$1400|$ 70000| 50 EA |$2200|8 110000 50 EA |$2000|$ 1,0000 50 EA |$1500($ 750.00
Wastewater SM5210B- BOD 7 day
61 eport o be Toct noted “incubation 7 days” 50 | EA 3000(§  1,500.00 50 EA |$4500|$ 225000 50 EA |§ 1500|§ 75000 50 EA |$ -|S$ -l s EA | $2000|$ 1,0000 50 EA |$2000|$ 1,0000 50 EA |$1500($ 750.00
68 | Drinking and Waste Water SM5310B- Total Organic Carbon s0 | EA 2000 $  1,00000 50 EA |$ -|$ - 50 EA |§ 1800($ 90000 50 EA |$1400($ 70000| 50 EA | $1500|8 75000 50 EA |$3300|8 16500 50 EA |$2000($ 100000
6 D““kmg“dw”wvg:?i'EPAm'ZMe‘m 50 | EA 2500(§  1,250.00 50 EA |$4500|$ 225000 50 EA |§ 1800($ 90000 50 EA |$1200($ 60000 50 EA | $1500|$ 75000 50 EA |$27.00|$ 13500 50 EA |$1800($ 900.00
Other Water Analytes Testing Purchased @ Vendor's List Price
70 Less % discount. ‘Vendor will submit a "List $ -
Price" for analytes not listed within the bid to be kept on file
TOTAL: |$ 300,850.00 TOTAL:| $ 234,500.00 TOTAL: | § 19445000 TOTAL:| § 107,712.00 TOTAL:| $ 249,750.00 TOTAL:| § 340,650.00 TOTAL:| §  194,575.00
Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
ool § 22115000 o Total | $ 19445000 Total | $107.712.00 T | 25110000 Mol | § 34065000 Tl | § 19457500
Variance $  79,700.00 Variance $ 234,500.00 Variance  $ - Variance $ (1,350.00) $ -
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