FORT WORTH.

ITB 17-0345 Construction Aggregates
Bid Opening Date: June 8, 2017, 1:30 P.M.

Item Vendor Big City Crushed TexGlobal Contractors Inc Earth Haulers Inc CJA Enterprises LLP
# Concrete
Description Qty [ UOM | UnitPrice Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
De-Ici Manufactured Sand), . .
1 g;??fefed e-lcing Sand (Manufactured Sand). | oo | ToN | NoBid | NoBid | $ 2110|$ 10550000 $ 21.97|$ 109,850.00| $ 18.50|$ 92,500.00
2 |#1 Crushed Rock - (1"X1"), Delivered 1000 | TON No Bid No Bid $ 2825|% 28,250.00)$ 2745|$ 27,450.00] $ 25.50| $ 25,500.00
Crushed Li t Flexible Base, Type A . .
3 |Gt Delioreg e PER 19200 | TON | NoBid | NoBid |$ 2125|$ 4675000 $ 2290|$ 50,380.00 $ 1850 | $ 40,700.00
4 |Crushed Concrete Flexible Base, Delivered [ 2200 | TON [ $ 13.50| $29,700.00| $ 17.75]|$ 39,050.00) $ 1350| $ 29,700.00] No Bid No Bid
5 |Rip Rap 12 x 18, Delivered 1250 | TON No Bid No Bid $ 3400|$ 4250000] $ 3095| % 3868750| $ 27.50| $ 34,375.00
6 |Rip Rap 18 x 24, Delivered 1400 | TON No Bid No Bid $ 3400|$ 47,600.00| $ 3195|$ 44,730.00] $ 2750| $ 38,500.00
7 |Rip Rap 24 x 36, Delivered 475 | TON No Bid No Bid $ 3925|% 18,643.75| $ 3245|$ 15413.75| $ 32.00| $ 15,200.00
8 |Rip Rap 4 x 8, Delivered 2000 [ TON No Bid No Bid $ 2575|% 51500.00) $ 3095| % 61,900.00] $ 22.00] $ 44,000.00
9 |Rip Rap 8 x 12, Delivered 1650 | TON No Bid No Bid $ 3120|$ 51,480.00) $ 3145| % 51,89250| $ 2750| $ 45,375.00
3/4 Utility Rock/ Crushed Limestone for . .
10 |Embedment (Not Flexible Base), Delivered 1000 | TON No Bid No Bid $ 2225|$% 2225000| $ 2495| % 2495000 $ 20.25($ 20,250.00
TOTAL $ 29,700.00 $ 453,523.75 $ 454,953.75 $ 356,400.00
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Miscellaneous Materials at Catalog List
Price Less___ % Discount. Note: Please
specify applicable discount percentage (%)

0%

3%

All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until
agreement information is posted.
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