
BID OPENING DATE: 06.09.2016
BID NO. 16-0145    

 
Buyer: Brandie Harris-Bingham

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Taylor's Rentals Peerless Events and Tents AM Linen Service, LLC
Ft Worth, TX 76107 Arlington, TX 76011 Dallas, TX 75229

Item #  Quantity
Unit of 

Measure Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 TENT 10 FEET BY 10 FEET 50 DAY $125.00 $6,250.00 $112.50 $5,625.00 NO BID
2 TENT 10 FEET BY 20 FEET 1 DAY $250.00 $250.00 $175.50 $175.50 NO BID
3 TENT 20 FEET BY 20 FEET 1 DAY $300.00 $300.00 $261.50 $261.50 NO BID
4 TENT 20 FEET BY 40 FEET 20 DAY $500.00 $10,000.00 $468.00 $9,360.00 NO BID
5 TENT 30 FEET BY 30 FEET 1 DAY $600.00 $600.00 $553.50 $553.50 NO BID
6 TENT 40 FEET BY 40 FEET 1 DAY $1,280.00 $1,280.00 $972.00 $972.00 NO BID
7 TENT DOOR - FRENCH 20 DAY $350.00 $7,000.00 NO BID NO BID

8
TENT SIDEWALL - FRENCH WIND 7 
FEET 120 DAY $35.00 $4,200.00 NO BID NO BID

9 TENT SIDEWALL - 8 FEET 4 DAY $35.00 $140.00 $18.00 $72.00 NO BID
10 STAGE 12 FOOT BY 16 FOOT 1 DAY $450.00 $450.00 $400.50 $400.50 NO BID
11 STAGE 12 FOOT BY 24 FOOT 1 DAY $675.00 $675.00 $601.20 $601.20 NO BID
12 STAGE 16 FOOT BY 20 FOOT 1 DAY $750.00 $750.00 $667.80 $667.80 NO BID
13 STAGE T SHAPE EXTENSION 1 DAY $150.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID
14 STAGE SKIRT 15 INCH HIGH 1 DAY $15.00 $15.00 NO BID $1.00 $1.00
15 STAGE SKIRT 24 INCH HIGH 1 DAY $20.00 $20.00 NO BID $1.00 $1.00
16 STAGE SKIRT 30 INCH HIGH 1 DAY $20.00 $20.00 $13.00 $13.00 $1.00 $1.00
17 STAGE STEP WITH HANDRAIL 1 DAY $75.00 $75.00 $50.00 $50.00 NO BID
18 STAGE CANOPY 1 DAY $300.00 $300.00 NO BID NO BID
19 AIR CONDITIONING UNIT 10 TON 20 DAY $950.00 $19,000.00 NO BID NO BID
20 HEATER FOR TENTS 5 DAY $175.00 $875.00 NO BID NO BID
21 INDUSTRIAL FAN 5 DAY $35.00 $175.00 $40.00 $200.00 NO BID
22 PEDESTAL FAN 2 DAY No Bid $30.00 $60.00 NO BID
23 PROPANE BOTTLE 5 DAY $95.00 $475.00 $40.00 $200.00 NO BID
24 BANQUET TABLE 4 FOOT 20 DAY $7.00 $140.00 $7.65 $153.00 NO BID
25 BANQUET TABLE 6 FOOT 200 DAY $7.50 $1,500.00 $6.75 $1,350.00 NO BID
26 BANQUET TABLE 8 FOOT 25 DAY $8.00 $200.00 $7.20 $180.00 NO BID
27 ROUND TABLE 30 INCHES 10 DAY $7.00 $70.00 $11.25 $112.50 NO BID
28 ROUND TABLE 36 INCHES 10 DAY $7.50 $75.00 $17.78 $177.80 NO BID
29 ROUND TABLE 48 INCHES 10 DAY $8.00 $80.00 $6.98 $69.80 NO BID
30 ROUND TABLE 60 INCHES 10 DAY $9.00 $90.00 $8.51 $85.10 NO BID
31 ROUND TABLE 72 INCHES 10 DAY $11.00 $110.00 $10.80 $108.00 NO BID

BID TABULATION FOR SPECIAL EVENT EQUIPMENT RENTAL



32

BANQUET TABLE LINEN 90 INCHES 
BY 108 INCHES (RECCOMENDED 
FOR 4 FOOT TABLE) 20 DAY $15.00 $300.00 $10.80 $216.00 $12.00 $240.00

33

BANQUET TABLE LINEN 90 INCHES 
BY 132 INCHES (RECCOMENDED 
FOR 6 FOOT TABLE) 50 DAY $17.50 $875.00 $15.30 $765.00 $12.00 $600.00

34

BANQUET TABLE LINEN 90 INCHES 
BY 156 INCHES (RECCOMENDED 
FOR 8 FOOT TABLE) 10 DAY $20.00 $200.00 $15.62 $156.20 $13.00 $130.00

35

ROUND TABLE LINEN 90 INCHES 
(RECCOMENDED FOR 30 INCH 
TABLE) 10 DAY $9.00 $90.00 $9.90 $99.00 $6.30 $63.00

36

ROUND TABLE LINEN 96 INCHES 
(RECCOMENDED FOR 36 INCH 
TABLE) 10 DAY $10.00 $100.00 $9.90 $99.00 $7.20 $72.00

37

ROUND TABLE LINEN 108 INCHES 
(RECCOMENDED FOR 48 INCH 
TABLE) 10 DAY $15.00 $150.00 $12.29 $122.90 $7.20 $72.00

38 ROUND TABLE LINEN 120 INCHES 10 DAY $16.00 $160.00 $14.94 $149.40 $8.10 $81.00
39 ROUND TABLE LINEN 132 INCHES 10 DAY $20.00 $200.00 $15.59 $155.90 $9.90 $99.00

40
BANQUET TABLE SKIRTING FOR 4 
FOOT TABLE 10 DAY $40.00 $400.00 $11.70 $117.00 $13.00 $130.00

41
BANQUET TABLE SKIRTING FOR 6 
FOOT TABLE 50 DAY $40.00 $2,000.00 $11.70 $585.00 $17.00 $850.00

42
BANQUET TABLE SKIRTING FOR 8 
FOOT TABLE 10 DAY $40.00 $400.00 $24.08 $240.80 $21.00 $210.00

43 TABLE LINEN CLIPS 650 DAY $0.10 $65.00 NO BID NO BID

44
SAMSONITE WHITE FOLDING 
CHAIR 200 DAY $1.25 $250.00 $1.05 $210.00 NO BID

45 GARDEN CHAIR 500 DAY $3.00 $1,500.00 $2.48 $1,240.00 NO BID
46 WATER BARRELS 185 DAY $10.00 $1,850.00 NO BID NO BID
47 TENT ANCHORS 53 DAY NO BID NO BID NO BID
48 CABLE RAMP 1 DAY $10.00 $10.00 NO BID NO BID

49
PIPE AND DRAPE SECTIONS 10 
FEET X 20 FEET X 8 FEET 1 DAY $120.00 $120.00 $45.00 $45.00 NO BID

50 MASKING DRAPE 40 FEET 1 DAY NO BID $80.00 $80.00 NO BID
51 BALLOONS - REGULAR 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
52 BALLOONS - MYLAR 100 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
53 HELLIUM TANK 1 DAY NO BID NO BID NO BID

54 BOUNCE HOUSE & ACCESSORIES 1 DAY NO BID NO BID NO BID

55
DELIVERY CHARGE IN SERVICE 
AREA 1 EA $60.00 $60.00 $80.00 $80.00 $75.00 $75.00

56
DELIVERY CHARGE OUTSIDE OF 
SERVICE AREA 1 EA NO BID $5.00 $5.00 $200.00 $200.00



57
LABOR FOR SET UP AND TEAR 
DOWN 1 EA $0.90 $0.90 $2.00 $2.00
TABLES $2.00
CHAIRS $1.00

58 FUEL SURCHARGE - PER MILE 1 MILE $5.50 $5.50 NO BID NO BID

59

RUSH ORDER CHARGE - LESS 
THAN 5 BUSINESS DAYS UNTIL 
EQUIPMENT REQUIRED 1 EA NO BID $300.00 $300.00 NO BID

Annual Estimated Total: $64,001.40 $26,114.40 $2,827.00
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