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Bid No: 16-0102

Open Date: 03/03/16

(0000003099) WHITMORE & SONS INC
<Quote: 00003244>

(0000002423) SCOTT LANDSCAPE
MAINTENANCE INC <Quote: 00003245>

Open Time: 01:30 BEDFORD TX 76095 FORT WORTH TX 76110
Delivery Date: Delivery Date:
ltem Quantity UOM Delivery Days: 0 Delivery Days: 0
Terms: Destination, Prepaid & Allowed Terms:
<001> Grounds Maintenance 1.00 EA $11755.15 $11755.15 $13050.00 $13050.00
<002> Grounds Maintenance 1.00 EA $3283.00 $3283.00 $4500.00 $4500.00
<003> Grounds Maintenance 1.00 EA $2177.50 $2177.50 No Bid , NB
<005> Grounds Maintenance 1.00 EA $119364.00 $119364.00 $222320.00 $222320.00
<006> Grounds Maintenance 1.00 EA $79678.50 $79678.50 $75530.00 $75530.00
<007> Grounds Maintenance 1.00 EA $8442.00 $8442.00 $10290.00 $10290.00
Totals: $ Vendor Gross Total: $224,700.15 $325,690.00
$Vendor Discount: $0.00 $0.00
$Vendor Net Total: $224,700.15 $325,690.00
$Preferance Discount: $0.00 $0.00
$Evaluation Total: $224,700.15 $325,690.00
$Awarded: $0.00 $0.00

Eval Codes: NI
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Bid No: 16-0102

Open Date: 03/03/16
Open Time: 01:30

(0000013686) LAWN PATROL SERVICE INC
<Quote: 00003248>

FORT WORTH TX 76163

(0000030261) MEAN GREEN <Quote:
00003250>

6080 S. Hulen 360 Box 197FORT WORTH TX

Delivery Date: 76132
ltem Quantity UOM Delivery Days: 0 Delivery Date:
Terms: Delivery Days: 0
Terms: Destination, Prepaid & Allowed
<001> Grounds Maintenance 1.00 EA $20265.00 $20265.00 $16720.00 $16720.00
<002> Grounds Maintenance 1.00 EA $8500.00 $8500.00 $6600.00 $6600.00
<003> Grounds Maintenance 1.00 EA No Bid , NB $5200.00 $5200.00
<005> Grounds Maintenance 1.00 EA $136150.00 $136150.00 No Bid , NB
<006> Grounds Maintenance 1.00 EA $65625.00 $65625.00 No Bid , NB
<007> Grounds Maintenance 1.00 EA $20650.00 $20650.00 $16730.00 $16730.00
Totals: $ Vendor Gross Total: $251,190.00 $45,250.00
$Vendor Discount: $0.00 $0.00
$Vendor Net Total: $251,190.00 $45,250.00
$Preferance Discount: $0.00 $0.00
$Evaluation Total: $251,190.00 $45,250.00
$Awarded: $0.00 $0.00
Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI
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*Evaluation Code Description
NB = No Bid

NI = Did Not Bid All ltems

Eval Codes: NI
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Eval Codes: NI Eval Codes: NI



