BID TABULATION FOR TRAFFIC SIGNAL POLES AND MAST ARMS

Buyer: Brandie Harris ITB NO. 15-0‘260 \TE: 10/01/2015
NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Structural & Steel Products Inc. Union Metal Corp
Fort Worth, TX 76107 Pipe Creek, TX
Unit of
Item # Quantity| Measure | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

TYPE 41 SIGNAL STD-27.5ft. TALL GALVANIZED
(INCLUDES #44 DOUBLE BOLT SIMPLEX HEEL PLATE
WELDED TO POLE) AND ALL ASSOCIATED

1 [HARDWARE 10 EA $2,349.00 $23,490.00 $1,650.00 $16,500.00
TYPE 43 SIGNAL STD.-27ft. TALL GALVANIZED
(INCLUDES #44 DOUBLE BOLT SIMPLEX HEEL PLATE
WELDED TO POLE) AND ALL ASSOCIATED

2 |HARDWARE. 8 EA $2,716.00 $21,728.00 $1,975.00 $15,800.00
TYPE 45 SIGNAL STD-27.5ft. TALL GALVANIZED
(INCLUDES #44 DOUBLE BOLT SIMPLEX HEEL PLATE
WELDED TO POLE) AND ALL ASSOCIATED

3 |HARDWARE. 6 EA $4,228.00 $25,368.00 $2,450.00 $14,700.00
TYPE 42 SIGNAL STD-21ft. TALL GALVANIZED AND

4  |ALL ASSOCIATED HARDWARE. 8 EA $2,282.00 $18,256.00 $1,230.00 $9,840.00
TYPE 44 SIGNAL STD-21ft. TALL GALVANIZED AND

5 |ALL ASSOCIATED HARDWARE. 5 EA $2,524.00 $12,620.00 $1,525.00 $7,625.00
TYPE 46 SIGNAL STD-21ft. TALL GALVANIZED AND

6 |ALL ASSOCIATED HARDWARE. 5 EA $4,059.00 $20,295.00 $1,920.00 $9,600.00
16ft. MONOLEVER ARM AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

7 |[GALV. 3 EA $572.00 $1,716.00 $470.00 $1,410.00
20ft. MONOLEVER ARM AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

8 |[GALV. 6 EA $616.00 $3,696.00 $500.00 $3,000.00
24ft. MONOLEVER ARM AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

9 [GALV. 6 EA $771.00 $4,626.00 $750.00 $4,500.00
28ft. MONOLEVER ARM AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

10 |GALV. 8 EA $803.00 $6,424.00 $950.00 $7,600.00
32ft. MONOLEVER ARM AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

11 |GALV. 4 EA $882.00 $3,528.00 $975.00 $3,900.00
36ft. MONOLEVER ARM AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

12 |GALV. 4 EA $1,080.00 $4,320.00 $1,270.00 $5,080.00
40ft. MONOLEVER ARM AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

13 |GALV. 4 EA $1,322.00 $5,288.00 $1,375.00 $5,500.00
44ft. MONOLEVER ARM AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

14 |GALV. 4 EA $1,401.00 $5,604.00 $1,675.00 $6,700.00
48ft. MONOLEVER ARM AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

15 |GALV. 6 EA $1,671.00 $10,026.00 $1,750.00 $10,500.00
52ft. MONOLEVER ARM AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

16 |GALV. 3 EA $3,185.00 $9,555.00 $1,975.00 $5,925.00
56ft. MONOLEVER ARM AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

17 |GALV. 4 EA $3,425.00 $13,700.00 $2,400.00 $9,600.00
60ft. MONOLEVER ARM AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

18 |GALV. 4 EA $3,620.00 $14,480.00 $2,700.00 $10,800.00




TYPE 41 SIGNAL STD-27.5ft. TALL POWDER COATED
(INCLUDES #44 DOUBLE BOLT SIMPLEX HEEL PLATE
WELDED TO POLE) AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE.

19 6 EA $2,659.00 $15,954.00 $1,900.00 $11,400.00
TYPE 43 SIGNAL STD-27.5 TALL POWDER COATED
(INCLUDES #44 DOUBLE BOLT SIMPLEX HEEL PLATE

20 [WELDED TO POLE) AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 5 EA $3,029.00 $15,145.00 $2,280.00 $11,400.00
TYPE 45 SIGNAL STD-27.5ft. TALL POWDER COATED
(INCLUEDES #44 DOUBLE BOLT SIMPLEX HEEL
PLATE WELDED TO POLE) AND ALL ASSOC.

21 |HARDWARE. 5 EA $4,681.00 $23,405.00 $2,835.00 $14,175.00
TYPE 42 SIGNAL STD-21ft. TALL POWDER COATED

22 |AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 8 EA $2,530.00 $20,240.00 $1,435.00 $11,480.00
TYPE 44 SIGNAL STD-21ft. TALL POWDER COATED

23 |AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 5 EA $2,778.00 $13,890.00 $1,775.00 $8,875.00
TYPE 46 SIGNAL STD-21ft. TALL POWDER COATED

24 |AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 5 EA $4,441.00 $22,205.00 $2,230.00 $11,150.00
16ft. MONOLEVER ARM POWDER COATED AND ALL

25 |ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $682.00 $2,728.00 $580.00 $2,320.00
20ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM POWDER COATED

26 |AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $717.00 $2,868.00 $620.00 $2,480.00
24ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM POWDER COATED

27 |AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $871.00 $3,484.00 $875.00 $3,500.00
28ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM POWDER COATED

28 |AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE 4 EA $952.00 $3,808.00 $1,120.00 $4,480.00
32ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM POWDER COATED

29 |AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $1,084.00 $4,336.00 $1,145.00 $4,580.00
36ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARMS POWDER COATED

30 |AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $1,284.00 $5,136.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00
20ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM POWDER COATED

31 |AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $1,782.00 $7,128.00 $1,700.00 $6,800.00
24ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM POWDER COATED

32 |AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $1,888.00 $7,552.00 $1,900.00 $7,600.00
28ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM POWDER CAOTED

33 |AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 6 EA $2,209.00 $13,254.00 $1,990.00 $11,940.00
52ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM POWDER COATED

34 |AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $3,996.00 $15,984.00 $2,210.00 $8,840.00
56ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM POWDER COATED

35 |AND ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $4,164.00 $16,656.00 $2,300.00 $9,200.00
60ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM POWDER COATED

36 |AND ALL ASSOC.HARDWARE. 4 EA $4,546.00 $18,184.00 $3,110.00 $12,440.00
ANCHOR BOLT ASSEMBLY FOR TYPE 41 AND TYPE

37 |42 SIGNAL POLES. 20 EA $300.00 $6,000.00 $285.00 $5,700.00
ANCHOR BOLT ASSEMBLY FOR TYPE 43 AND TYPE

38 |44 SIGNAL POLES. 15 EA $481.00 $7,215.00 $445.00 $6,675.00
ANCHOR BOLT ASSEMBLY FOR TYPE 45 AND 46

39 |SIGNAL POLES 15 EA $549.00 $8,235.00 $560.00 $8,400.00
FLUTED SIGNAL POLES FOR 207t SMA GALV. WITH
ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE AND ANCHOR BOLT

40 |ASSEMBLY. 5 EA $4,142.00 $20,710.00 $3,550.00 $17,750.00




41

FLUTED SIGNAL POLES FOR 20ft. SMA POWDER
COATED WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE AND
ANCHOR BOLTS ASSEMBLY.

EA

$4,529.00

$22,645.00

$4,250.00

$21,250.00

42

FLUTED SIGNAL POLES FOR 28ft. SMA GALV. WITH
ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE AND ANCHOR BOLT
ASSEMBLY.

EA

$4,618.00

$23,090.00

$3,550.00

$17,750.00

43

FLUTED SIGNAL POLES FOR 28ft. SMA POWDER
COATED WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE AND
ANCHOR BOLT ASSEMBLY.

EA

$4,967.00

$24,835.00

$4,250.00

$21,250.00

44

FLUTED SIGNAL POLES FOR 32ft. SMA GALV. WITH
ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE AND ANCHOR BOLT
ASSEMBLY.

EA

$4,857.00

$24,285.00

$3,800.00

$19,000.00

45

FLUTED SIGNAL POLES FOR 32ft. SMA POWDER
COATED WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE AND
ANCHOR BOLT ASSEMBLY.

EA

$5,133.00

$25,665.00

$4,625.00

$23,125.00

46

FLUTED SIGNAL POLES FOR 40ft. SMA GALV. WITH
ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE AND ANCHOR BOLT
ASSEMBLY.

EA

$5,438.00

$21,752.00

$4,200.00

$16,800.00

47

FLUTED SIGNAL POLES FOR 40ft. SMA POWDER
COATED WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE AND
ANCHOR BOLT ASSEMBLY.

EA

$5,817.00

$23,268.00

$5,125.00

$20,500.00

48

FLUTED SIGNAL POLES FOR 44ft. SMA GALV. WITH
ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE AND ANCHOR BOLT
ASSEMBLY.

EA

$5,502.00

$22,008.00

$4,600.00

$18,400.00

49

FLUTED SIGNAL POLES FOR 44ft. SMA POWDER
COATED WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE AND
ANCHOR BOLT ASSEMBLY

EA

$5,886.00

$23,544.00

$5,775.00

$23,100.00

50

FLUTED SIGNAL POLES FOR 56ft. SMA GALV. WITH
ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE AND ANCHOR BOLT
ASSEMBLY.

EA

$7,475.00

$29,900.00

$5,025.00

$20,100.00

51

FLUTED SIGNAL POLES FOR 56ft. SMA POWDER
COATED WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE AND
ANCHOR BOLT ASSEMBLY.

EA

$7,925.00

$31,700.00

$6,250.00

$25,000.00

52

16ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL
POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE.

EA

$1,757.00

$10,542.00

$900.00

$5,400.00

53

16ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL
POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE.

EA

$1,884.00

$11,304.00

$1,025.00

$6,150.00

54

20ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL
POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

EA

$1,870.00

$7,480.00

$950.00

$3,800.00

55

20ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL
POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE

EA

$2,032.00

$8,128.00

$1,100.00

$4,400.00

56

24ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL
POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE.

EA

$1,961.00

$11,766.00

$1,200.00

$7,200.00

57

24ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL
POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE.

EA

$2,223.00

$13,338.00

$1,425.00

$8,550.00




28fT. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL
POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE.

58 4 EA $2,546.00 $10,184.00 $1,250.00 $5,000.00
28fT. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL

59 |POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $2,912.00 $11,648.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00
32ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL

6o |POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $2,837.00 $11,348.00 $1,425.00 $5,700.00
32ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL

g1 |POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $3,315.00 $13,260.00 $1,700.00 $6,800.00
36ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL

g2 |POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 8 EA $3,177.00 $25.416.00 $1,800.00 $14.400.00
36ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL

63 |POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 6 EA $3,777.00 $22.662.00 $2,125.00 $12,750.00
40ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL

g4 |POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 6 EA $3,924.00 $23,544.00 $1,875.00 $11,250.00
40ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL

65 |POLE GALV. WITHALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 10 EA $4,665.00 $46,650.00 $2,200.00 $22,000.00
44ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL

66 |POLE GAV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $4,567.00 $18,268.00 $2,125.00 $8,500.00
44ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL

g7 |POLE GAV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $5,030.00 $20,120.00 $2,550.00 $10,200.00
48ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL

68 |POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE 5 EA $4,856.00 $24,280.00 $2,250.00 $11,250.00
287 MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL
POLE POWDER COATED WITH ALL ASSOC.

69 |HARDWARE 5 EA $5,352.00 $26,760.00 $2,700.00 $13,500.00
52ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL

70 |POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $5,609.00 $22.436.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00
52ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL
POLE POWDER COATED WITH ALL ASSOC.

71 |HARDWARE. 4 EA $5,393.00 $21,572.00 $3,100.00 $12,400.00
56ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL

72 |POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $5,252.00 $21,008.00 $2,650.00 $10,600.00
56ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL
POLE POWDER COATED WITH ALL ASSOC.

73 |HARDWARE. 4 EA $5,520.00 $22,080.00 $3,250.00 $13,000.00
60ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL

74 |POLE GALV. WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $5,333.00 $21,332.00 $2,900.00 $11,600.00




60ft. MONOLEVER SIGNAL ARM FOR FLUTED SIGNAL
POLE POWDER COATED WITH ALL ASSOC.

75 |HARDWARE 4 EA $5,984.00 $23,936.00 $3,650.00 $14,600.00
CAST ALUM. DECORATIVE BASE FOR FLUTED POLE
76 (20ft. THRU 36ft ARMS) WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE 4 EA $2,157.00 $8,628.00 $1,850.00 $7,400.00
CAST ALUM. DECORATIVE BASE POWDER COATED
FOR (20ft THRU 36ft ARMS) WITH ALL ASSOC.
77 |HARDWARE 4 EA $2,217.00 $8,868.00 $2,000.00 $8,000.00
CAST ALUM. DECORATIVE BASE FOR (40ft THRU 56ft
78 |POLES) WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 4 EA $3,182.00 $12,728.00 $2,425.00 $9,700.00
CAST ALUM. DECORATIVE BASE POWDER COATED
FOR (40ft THRU 56ft POLE) WITH ALL ASSOC.
79 |HARDWARE. 4 EA $3,234.00 $12,936.00 $2,675.00 $10,700.00
ALUM CONTOUR BASE CN27AC FOR ROUND TAPER
80 POLES (41 & 42) WITH ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 5 EA $1,440.00 $7,200.00 No Bid
ALUM CONTOUR BASE CN27AC POWDER COATED
FOR ROUND TAPER POLES (41 &42) WITH ALL
81 [ASSOC. HARDWARE 5 EA $1,581.00 $7,905.00 No Bid
ALUM. CONTOUR BASE CN34AC FOR ROUND TAPER
POLES (43 THRU 46 POLES) WITH ALL ASSOC.
82 |HARDWARE. 5 EA $1,553.00 $7,765.00 No Bid
ALUM. CONTOUR BASE CN34AC FOR ROUND TAPER
POLES POWDER COATED (43 THRU 46 POLES) WITH
83 |ALL ASSOC. HARDWARE. 5 EA $1,703.00 $8,515.00 No Bid
WELDING CHARGES FOR SPECIAL PROJECTS (PER
84 |HOUR CHARGES) 300 HR $120.00 $36,000.00 No Bid
POWDER COATING OF SPECIAL PROJECTS UP TO
85 |40ft. (SQUARE FT. CHARGE) 3,000 SQFT $4.75 $14,250.00 No Bid
POWDER COATING OF SPECIAL PROJECT OVER 40ft.
86 |(SQUARE FT. CHARGE) 3,000 SQFT $6.75 $20,250.00 No Bid
Annual Estimated Total: $1,325,636.00 $832,890.00




	Line Item Reward

