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 BID NO. 15-0268   BID OPENING DATE: 08/27/15
 

Buyer: Jane Rogers

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION  Frank Clark Associates
Irving, TX 75062 Dallas, TX 75243  Stafford, TX 77477 Lewisville, TX 75057 Fort Worth, TX 76132 Plano, TX 75074

Item #  Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1

Instrumentation Field Services Regular 
Hourly Rate, 8:00 am to 5:00 pm, Monday 
thru Friday 100 HR No Bid $0.00 $45.00 $4,500.00 $125.00 $12,500.00 $90.00 $9,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $115.00 $11,500.00

2

Instrumentation Field Services Overtime 
Hourly Rate, 5:01 pm to 7:59 am, Monday 
thru Friday, and anytime on Saturday, 
Sunday and Holidays 10 HR No Bid $0.00 $60.00 $600.00 $175.00 $1,750.00 $120.00 $1,200.00 $0.00 $0.00 $172.50 $1,725.00

3

Instrumentation Shop Services Regular 
Hourly Rate, 8:00 am to 5:00 pm, Monday 
thru Friday 50 HR No Bid $0.00 $35.00 $1,750.00 $125.00 $6,250.00 $85.00 $4,250.00 $150.00 $7,500.00 $85.00 $4,250.00

4

Instrumentation Shop Services Overtime 
Hourly Rate, 5:01 pm to 7:59 am, Monday 
thru Friday, and anytime on Saturday, 
Sunday and Holidays 5 HR No Bid $0.00 $45.00 $225.00 $175.00 $875.00 $115.00 $575.00 $150.00 $750.00 $127.50 $637.50

5

Instrumentation Equipment and Parts @ 
Manufacturer Cost Plus Percentage 
Markup. Quantity Listed is Estimated 
Annual Cost. Example: $300,000 x 10% 
Markup = $30,000, $300,000 + $30,000 = 
$330,000. Please State Percentage 
Markup 300,000 EA

0% to 45% 
Discount 

(depends on 
product) $270,000.00 10% Discount $270,000.00

10% to 30% 
Discount $270,000.00 0% $300,000.00 10% Markup $330,000.00   10% Markup $330,000.00

6
Instrumentation Equipment Onsite Pickup 
and Delivery Rate per Mile 100 EA No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $1.00 $100.00 $0.80 $80.00

Annual Estimated Total: $270,000.00 $277,075.00 $291,375.00 $315,025.00 $338,350.00 $348,192.50
Percentage difference from the low bid to 

the higher bids: 2.62% 7.92% 16.68% 25.31% 28.96%
Did not submit 
Consideration of 
Location of 
Bidder's 
Principal Place 
of Business

Did not submit 
Consideration of 
Location of 
Bidder's 
Principal Place 
of Business

Did not submit 
Consideration of 
Location of 
Bidder's 
Principal Place 
of Business

Did not submit 
Consideration of 
Location of 
Bidder's 
Principal Place 
of Business

Did submit 
Consideration of 
Location of 
Bidder's 
Principal Place 
of Business

Did not submit 
Consideration of 
Location of 
Bidder's 
Principal Place 
of Business

BID TABULATION FOR INSTRUMENTATION EQUIPMENT, PARTS AND SERVICES

Process Solutions Corp
Murray Energy dba Alpha 
Process Sales Prime Controls, LP Vector Controls and Automation

Brands: ATI, Autrol US, 
Contegra, Dylix, Eastech, 
Magnetrol, Primary Flow Signal

Cole Parmer Corp LLC dba 
Davis Instruments

Brands: Aalborg, Burket, 
Flowline, Kobold, Krohne, 
Sierra Instruments, Signet, 
Dynasonics, Great Plains 
Industries, Hedland, Dwyer, 
RCM Industries, Oakton, Hach, 
United Elecric, Ashcroft

Brands: Siemens, BW 
Technologies/Honeywell, Fluid 
Components, RKI

Brands: ABB, Nivelco, Kayden, 
Dehn, AST

Brands: Endress+Hauser, 
Scott Safety
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 BID NO. 15-0268   BID OPENING DATE: 08/27/15
 

Buyer: Jane Rogers

BID TABULATION FOR INSTRUMENTATION EQUIPMENT, PARTS AND SERVICES

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION  
Webster, TX 77598 Arlington, TX 76018  

Item #  Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total  

1

Instrumentation Field Services Regular 
Hourly Rate, 8:00 am to 5:00 pm, Monday 
thru Friday 100 HR $120.00 $12,000.00 No Bid $0.00  

2

Instrumentation Field Services Overtime 
Hourly Rate, 5:01 pm to 7:59 am, Monday 
thru Friday, and anytime on Saturday, 
Sunday and Holidays 10 HR No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

3

Instrumentation Shop Services Regular 
Hourly Rate, 8:00 am to 5:00 pm, Monday 
thru Friday 50 HR $120.00 $6,000.00 No Bid $0.00

4

Instrumentation Shop Services Overtime 
Hourly Rate, 5:01 pm to 7:59 am, Monday 
thru Friday, and anytime on Saturday, 
Sunday and Holidays 5 HR No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00

5

Instrumentation Equipment and Parts @ 
Manufacturer Cost Plus Percentage 
Markup. Quantity Listed is Estimated 
Annual Cost. Example: $300,000 x 10% 
Markup = $30,000, $300,000 + $30,000 = 
$330,000. Please State Percentage 
Markup 300,000 EA 15% Markup $345,000.00 33% Markup $399,000.00

6
Instrumentation Equipment Onsite Pickup 
and Delivery Rate per Mile 100 EA $120.00 $12,000.00 No Bid $0.00

Annual Estimated Total: $375,000.00 $399,000.00
Percentage difference from the low bid to 

the higher bids: 38.89% 47.78%
Did not submit 
Consideration of 
Location of 
Bidder's 
Principal Place 
of Business

Did not submit 
Consideration of 
Location of 
Bidder's 
Principal Place 
of Business

Macaulay Controls Company Andon Specialties, Inc.

 All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract information is posted.

Brands: Emerson/Rosemount, 
ProMinent, Telog, McCrometer, 
RKI, Hach

Brands: Ametek-Drexelbrook, 
Foxboro Field Device, RC 
Systems, Regal Chlorinators, 
King, Noshok, GO Regulator
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