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Pollock Paper Distributors
1 Pollock Place

Grand Prairie, TX 75050
972-263-0205

JanPak

3101 High River Rd, Suite 101
Fort Worth, TX 76155
817-785-0234

XERON Industrial
6125 Luther Lane, #382
Dallas, TX 75225
469-232-2000

Central Poly-Bag Corp
2400 Bedle Place
Linden, NJ 07036
908-862-7570

Interboro Packaging Corp
114 Bracken Rd
Montgomery, NY 12549
845-457-2700

Empire Paper

2708 Central Freeway
Wichita Falls, TX 76301
940-766-3216

All American Poly

40 Turner Place
Piscataway, NJ 08854
732-752-3200

Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price| Total Unit Price| Total Unit Price, Total Unit Price, Total
to City to City to City to City to City to City to City

KC Standard Bathroom Tissue 300 cs $32.58 $9,774.00 $39.51 $11,853.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $35.31 | $10,593.00 No Bid $0.00
KC Giant Roll Toilet Tissue 120 cs $61.43 $7,371.60 $33.74 $4,048.80 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $26.32 $3,158.40 No Bid $0.00
KC Single Fold Towels 200 cs $16.08 $3,216.00 27.51 $5,502.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $26.08 $5,216.00 No Bid $0.00
KC Roll Towels 200 cs $16.25 $3,250.00 $53.70 $10,740.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $49.13 $9,826.00 No Bid $0.00
GPS Multi Fold Towels 200 cs $14.13 $2,826.00 $18.35 $3,670.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $22.28 $4,456.00 No Bid $0.00
White Single Fold Towels 100 cs $15.43 $1,543.00 $27.51 $2,751.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $26.08 $2,608.00 No Bid $0.00
Workhorse White Rags 75 cs $22.25 $1,668.75 $24.86 $1,864.50 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $18.91 $1,418.25 No Bid $0.00
Palmolive Dish Soap 30 cs $41.08 $1,232.40 $46.12 $1,383.60 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $29.93 $897.90 No Bid $0.00
Dial Antimicrobial Hand Soap 15 cs $41.73 $706.96 $49.22 $738.30 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $50.54 $758.10 No Bid $0.00
Phenominal Disenfecant Spray 10 cs $37.73 $377.30 $38.38 $383.80 $82.60 $826.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $72.90 $729.00 No Bid $0.00
Dart Small Drink Cup 10 cs $22.68 $226.80 $26.36 $263.60 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $25.69 $256.90 No Bid $0.00
Dart Big Drink Cup 10 cs $34.47 $344.70 $38.09 $380.90 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $37.12 $371.20 No Bid $0.00
Ultra Color Guard Cheer 80 cs $65.33 $5,322.40 $38.47 $3,077.60 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $35.23 $2,818.40 No Bid $0.00
Cascade Dishwashing Powder 100 cs $40.55 $4,055.00 $58.94 $5,894.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $45.68 $4,568.00 No Bid $0.00
Graffitti Wipes 40 cs $55.92 $2,236.80 $48.18 $1,927.20 $99.79 $3,991.60 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $54.53 $2,181.20 No Bid $0.00
Trash Can Liners 24 x 33 100 cs $27.75 $2,775.00 $23.25 $2,325.00 No Bid $0.00 $14.30 | $1,430.00 $13.48 | $1,384.00 $24.73 $2,473.00 $29.24 $2,924.00
Trash Can Liners 40 x 46 100 cs $13.85 $1,385.00 $13.15 $1,315.00 No Bid $0.00 $14.90 | $1,490.00 $8.98 $898.00 $12.13 $1,213.00 $13.56 $1,356.00
Spic -N-Span 20 cs $32.31 $646.20 $33.40 $668.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $34.50 $690.00 No Bid $0.00
Cleaner, Armorall Shine 320 cs $56.46 $18,067.20 $78.53 $25,129.60 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $54.41 | $17,411.20 No Bid $0.00
Inset Repellant, Deep Woods Off, 10 oz 40 cs No Bid $0.00 $69.55 $2,782.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $61.39 $2,455.60 No Bid $0.00
Inset Repellant, Deep Woods Off, 6 0z 470 cs $58.86 $27,664.20 $63.33 $29,765.10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $58.04 | $27,278.80 No Bid $0.00
Wasp & Hornet Spray 220 cs $58.17 $12,797.40 $52.51 $11,552.20 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $41.08 $9,037.60 No Bid $0.00
Ant & Roach Spray 175 cs No Bid $0.00 $50.31 $8,804.25 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $48.11 $8,419.25 No Bid $0.00
Bleach 175 cs $9.00 $1,575.00 $9.31 $1,629.25 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $11.29 $1,975.75 No Bid $0.00
Pine Disinfectant 200 cs $32.58 $6,516.00 $27.91 $5,582.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $34.39 $6,878.00 No Bid $0.00
Lemon Disinfectant 130 cs $26.22 $3,408.80 $29.95 $3,893.50 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $43.61 $5,673.20 No Bid $0.00
TOTAL $118,986.51 $147,924.20 $4,817.60 $2,920.00 $2,282.00 $133,361.75 $4,280.00




	Sheet1

