BID TABULATION FOR SAW BLADES Page 1 of 2
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BID NO. 15-0103 BID OPENING DATE: MAY 7, 2015
Buyer: Jane Hughes
HD Supply Construction and
NAME OF BIDDER & National Diamond Enterprises, Industrial dba White Cap
LOCATION Diamond Blade Warehouse LLC Desert Diamond Industries MK Diamond Products, Inc. Simba Industries Hilti, Inc. Arco Contractors Supply Co. Construction Supply
Vernon Hills, IL 60061 Pompano Beach, FL 33069 Las Vegas, NV Torrance, CA 90501 Grapevine, TX 76051 Tulsa, OK 74146 Fort Worth, TX 76105 Fort Worth, TX 76103
Alternate Brand Bid Alternate Brand Bid Alternate Brand Bid Alternate Brand Bid
Item # Quantity| Unit | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Saw Blade for Asphalt 12" x 250 x 1"
1 |Diamond Tip Husavarna P# 580231 15 EA $128.05 $1,920.75 $216.00 $3,240.00 No Bid $0.00 $197.58 $2,963.70 $331.00 $4,965.00 $350.00 $5,250.00 $319.50 $4,792.50 $290.40 $4,356.00
‘Saw Blade for Concrete Diamond Tip
14" x 125" x 1" Vanguard Series Il
Model: Gold 150V Husqvarna P#
2 |773211,5.4 hp 1 EA $34.50 $34.50 $108.00 $108.00 $160.00 $160.00 $46.24 $46.24 $178.00 $178.00 $248.77 $248.77 $164.50 $164.50 $149.60 $149.60
Saw Blade for Cured Concrete 24" x
.155" x 1" Diamond Tip Vanguard
Series Il Model: Blue 250V
3 |Husavarna P# 773227 20 EA $197.60 $3,952.00 $238.00 $4,760.00 $350.00 $7,000.00 $313.20 $6,264.00 $371.00 $7,420.00 $425.00 $8,500.00 $352.75 $7,055.00 $322.00 $6,440.00
Saw Blade for Asphalt 24" x .155" x
1" Diamond Tip Vanguard Series |1
Model: Black 500VR Husquarna P#
4 |77321 8 EA $185.90 $1,487.20 $241.77 $1,934.16 $550.00 $4,400.00 $265.00 $2,120.00 $401.00 $3,208.00 $425.00 $3,400.00 $384.25 $3,074.00 $350.00 $2,800.00
Saw Blade for Green Concrete;
Asphalt over Concrete 18" x .125 x 1"
D.P. Model: Red 450 VR Vanguard
5 __|Series Il Husavarna P# 773222 30 EA $75.40 $2,262.00 $173.00 $5,190.00 $250.00 $7,500.00 $167.14 $5,014.20 $249.00 $7,470.00 $375.00 $11,250.00 $234.75 $7,042.50 $215.45 $6,463.50
Saw Blade for Green Concrete;
Asphalt over Concrete 20" x .125 x 1"
D.P. Model Red 450 VR Vanguard
6 |Series Il Husavarna P# 773221 1 EA $88.40 $88.40||  $210.00 $210.00||  $250.00 $250.00||  $192.00 $192.00||  $279.00 $279.00||  $393.07 $393.07||  $253.60 $253.60||  $232.00 $232.00
Saw Blade for Cured Concrete (Wet
Cut) 20" x .125 x 1" D.P. Model: Blue
250 V Vanguard Il Series Husqvarna
7 __|P#773216 1 EA $88.40 $88.40 $205.00 $205.00 $220.00 $220.00 $256.41 $256.41 $248.00 $248.00 $358.87 $358.87 $233.60 $233.60 $213.00 $213.00
‘Saw Blade for Cured Concrete (Wet
Cut) 24" x .155 X 1" D.P. Model: Blue
200 B Banner Line Husquarna P#
8 |773264 1 EA $197.60 $197.60 $238.00 $238.00 $500.00 $500.00 $358.04 $358.04 $359.00 $359.00 $488.10 $488.10 $469.00 $469.00 $431.00 $431.00
Saw Blade for Cured Concrete (Wet
Cut) 18" x .125 x 1" D.P. Model: Blue
250 V Vanguard Il Series Husqvarna
9 |P#773217 1 EA $75.40 $75.40 $167.76 $167.76 $210.00 $210.00 $105.44 $105.44 $219.00 $219.00 $324.69 $324.69|| $218.75 $218.75 $200.00 $200.00
Diamond Saw Blade 20" C155 C-446
10 [Concrete, 7 hp 1 EA $88.40 $88.40 No Bid $0.00 $150.00 $150.00 $190.78 $190.78 $431.00 $431.00 No Bid $0.00 $411.50 $411.50 $376.00 $376.00
Diamond Saw Blade ICC 24" C155 C
11 |446 Concrete, 6 hp 1 EA $197.60 $197.60 No Bid $0.00 $260.00 $260.00 $258.46 $258.46 $421.00 $421.00 No Bid $0.00 $529.75 $529.75 $512.50 $512.50
Diamond Saw Blade ICC 18" C140 C
12 |44 Concrete, 7 hp 25 EA $75.40 $1,885.00 No Bid $0.00 $95.00 $2,375.00 $158.00 $3,950.00 $264.00 $6,600.00 No Bid $0.00 $336.00 $8,400.00 $307.00 $7,675.00
Diamond Saw Blade ICC 14" C140-
13 |C-44 Concrete, 5.4 hp 40 EA $34.75 $1,390.00 No Bid $0.00 $50.00 $2,000.00 $85.00 $3,400.00 $238.80 $9,552.00 No Bid $0.00 $274.00 $10,960.00 $250.00 $10,000.00
14 | Concrete Grinding Disk, 7 hp 20 EA $72.80 $1.456.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $95.00 $1.900.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
15 _|Asphalt Grinding Disk, 7 hp 20 EA $72.80 $1.456.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $95.00 $1.900.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
16 _|Concrete Saw Blade 14", 7 hp 50 EA $34.75 $1,737.50 $72.68 $3,634.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $86.00 $4,300.00 $41.48 $2,074.00 $75.00 $3,750.00 $39.11 $1,955.50 $31.05 $1,552.50
17 _|Asphalt Cutting Blade 14", 7 hp 50 EA $41.60 $2,080.00 $69.30 $3.465.00 $62.00 $3,100.00 $86.00 $4,300.00 $65.92 $3,296.00 $100.00 $5.000.00 $63.30 $3,165.00 $47.50 $2,375.00
2 172" Diamond Tipped Coring Bit
18 |Asphalt 1 EA $67.60 $67.60 $143.00 $143.00 $60.00 $60.00 $93.55 $93.55 $139.80 $139.80 $95.00 $95.00 $144.62 $144.62 $131.60 $131.60
6 1/2" Diamond Tipped Coring Bit
19 |Asphalt 1 EA $101.40 $101.40 $296.10 $296.10 $102.00 $102.00 $150.60 $150.60 $217.00 $217.00 $225.00 $225.00 $203.95 $203.95||  $236.00 $236.00
8 1/2" Diamond Tipped Coring Bit
20 __|Asphalt 1 EA $281.00 $281.00 $412.84 $412.84 $132.00 $132.00 No Bid $0.00 $296.00 $296.00 No Bid $0.00 $274.29 $274.29 $299.00 $299.00
66 HP Saw 20" X .155 X .410 X1"-
21 |PH P#1S1CC20C155C512 Concrete 20 EA $214.50 $4,290.00 No Bid $0.00 $150.00 $3,000.00 $306.25 $6,125.00 $351.00 $7,020.00 $325.00 $6,500.00 $413.63 $8,272.60 $376.40 $7,528.00
66 HP Saw Blade 26"X .155 X .410
X1"- PH P# 1CC26C155C512
22 _|Concrete 20 EA $316.05 $6,321.00 No Bid $0.00 $275.00 $5,500.00 $527.00 $10,540.00 $481.00 $9,620.00 $500.00 $10,000.00 $562.64 $11,252.80 $512.00 $10,240.00
‘Saw Blade for Cured Concrete 14" x
1/4" x 1" Abrasive Model: Gold RTC
23 _|Husavarna P# 3RF214 70 EA $8.35 $584.50 No Bid $0.00 $12.00 $840.00 No Bid $0.00 $9.93 $695.10 No Bid $0.00 $8.97 $627.90 $8.80 $616.00
Saw Blade for Metal 12" x 1/8" x 1"
Abrasive Model: Blue QHS-MS
24 _|Husavarna P# 23023 140 EA $3.70 $518.00 $6.12 $856.80 $5.08 $711.20 No Bid $0.00 $3.88 $543.20 $4.90 $686.00 $3.39 $474.60 $3.25 $455.00
‘Saw Blade for Ductile Iron / Cast Iron
12" x 1/8" x 1" Abrasive Model: Green
25 _|QHS-DI P# 23027 850 EA $3.70 $3,145.00 $6.12 $5,202.00 $5.08 $4,318.00 No Bid $0.00 $3.99 $3,391.50 $5.20 $4,420.00 $3.71 $3,153.50 $3.55 $3,017.50
Saw Blade for Concrete / Masonry
14" x 1/8" x 1 Abrasive Model: Red
26 | QHS-CM Husavarna P# 23021 250 EA $5.45 $1,362.50 $7.16 $1,790.00 $7.36 $1,840.00 No Bid $0.00 $6.04 $1,510.00 No Bid $0.00 $5.80 $1,450.00 $5.55 $1,387.50
12" X 1/8" X 1" Concrete Pipe Saw|
Blade National Diamond p/n
27 _|ABMASS 140 EA $3.70 $518.00 $6.12 $856.80 $45.00 $6,300.00 $92.00 $12,880.00 $3.59 $502.60 $50.00 $7,000.00 $3.38 $473.20 $3.25 $455.00
14" X125 x 1 -20mm Vacuum
Brazed Safety Blade, Desert
28 | Diamond pt # 103-14A 100 EA $79.20 $7,920.00 $166.68 $16,668.00 $225.00 $22,500.00 $89.45 $8,945.00 $116.80 $11,680.00 $110.00 $11,000.00 $112.09 $11,209.00 $209.50 $20,950.00
Concrete Diamond Tip Blade 30" x
29 |.155"x.410"x1" 4 EA $389.00 $1,556.00 $368.51 $1,474.04 $487.00 $1,948.00 $724.25 $2,897.00 $599.00 $2,396.00 $600.00 $2,400.00 $707.69 $2,830.76 $644.00 $2,576.00
‘Asphalt Diamond Tip Blade 30" x
31 |.155"x.410"x1" 4 EA $496.60 $1,986.40 $376.00 $1,504.00 $510.00 $2,040.00 $776.00 $3,104.00 $589.00 $2,356.00 $738.00 $2,952.00 $805.00 $3,220.00 $732.40 $2,929.60
Miscellaneous Saw Blades @
Manufacturer List Price Less
32 % Discount. 30,000 | EA 40% $18,000.00 40% $18,000.00 55% $13,500.00 60% $12,000.00 56% $13,200.00 45% $16,500.00 51% $14,700.00 50% $15,000.00
Total: $67.048.15 $70.355.50 $93.416.20 $94,254.42 $100,287.20 $100,741.50 $107,012.42 $109,597.30
Percentage difference from the low|
bid to the higher bids: 4.93% 39.33% 40.58% 49.57% 50.25% 59.61% 63.46%
Did not submit Did not submit Did not submit
Consideration Consideration Consideration Did not submit Submitted Did not submit Submitted Did not submit
of Location of Location of Location Consideration of Consideration of Consideration of Consideration of Consideration of
Bidder's Bidder's Bidder's Location Bidder's Location Bidder's Location Bidder's Location Bidder's Location Bidder's
Principal Place Principal Place Principal Place Principal Place Principal Place Principal Place Principal Place Principal Place
of Business of Business of Business of Business of Business of Business of Business of Business
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BID NO. 15-0103 BID OPENING DATE: MAY 7, 2015
Buyer: Jane Hughes
NAME OF BIDDER & Mar-teK Contractor Supply,
LOCATION LLC Simba Industries Protech Diamond USA Kirby Smith Machinery Bearing Disributors, Inc. Elite Diamond Tools Discount Contractor Warehouse
Austin, TX 78745 Grapevine, TX 76051 Grand Prairie, TX 76050 Fort Worth, TX 76106 Dallas, TX 75247 Jefferson, LA 70121 Weymouth, MA 02189
Alternate Brand Bid
Item # Quantity| Unit | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Saw Blade for Asphalt 12" x 250 x 1"
1 _|Diamond Tip Husavarna P# 580231 15 EA $377.52 $5,662.80 $331.00 $4,965.00 $88.00 $1,320.00 $367.00 $5,505.00 $407.60 $6,114.00 $125.00 $1,875.00 $95.97 $1,439.55
‘Saw Blade for Concrete Diamond Tip
14" x 125" x 1" Vanguard Series Il
Model: Gold 150V Husqvarna P#
2 [773211,5.4 hp 1 EA $198.48 $198.48 $178.00 $178.00 $110.00 $110.00 $195.00 $195.00 $228.69 $228.69 $178.50 $178.50 $155.97 $155.97
Saw Blade for Cured Concrete 24" x
.155" x 1" Diamond Tip Vanguard
Series Il Model: Blue 250V
3 |Husavarna P# 773227 20 EA $418.60 $8,372.00 $371.00 $7,420.00 $345.00 $6,900.00 $408.00 $8,160.00 $506.37 $10,127.40 $295.14 $5,902.80 $399.97 $7,999.40
Saw Blade for Asphalt 24" x 155" X
1" Diamond Tip Vanguard Series |1
Model: Black 500VR Husquarna P#
4 |7731 8 EA $455.52 $3,644.16||  $401.00 $3,208.00||  $440.00 $3,520.00||  $444.00 $3,552.00||  $585.69 $4,685.52||  $728.88 $5,831.04||  $399.97 $3,199.76
Saw Blade for Green Concrete;
Asphalt over Concrete 18" x .125 x 1"
D.P. Model: Red 450 VR Vanguard
5 __|Series Il Husavarna P# 773222 30 EA $279.24 $8,377.20 $249.00 $7,470.00 $290.00 $8,700.00 $272.00 $8,160.00 $299.52 $8,985.60 $510.00 $15,300.00 $759.97 $22,799.10
Saw Blade for Green Concrete;
Asphalt over Concrete 20" x .125 x 1"
D.P. Model Red 450 VR Vanguard
6 __|Series Il Husavarna P# 773221 1 EA $301.05 $301.05 $279.00 $279.00 $331.00 $331.00 $299.00 $299.00 $338.38 $338.38|| $668.10 $668.10 $825.97 $825.97
Saw Blade for Cured Concrete (Wet
Cut) 20" x .125 x 1" D.P. Model: Blue
250 V Vanguard Il Series Husqvarna
7 __|P#773216 1 EA $277.16 $277.16 $364.00 $364.00 $190.00 $190.00 $286.00 $286.00 $383.71 $383.71 $259.19 $259.19 $299.97 $299.97
Saw Blade for Cured Concrete (Wet
Cut) 24" x .155 X 1" D.P. Model: Blue
200 B Banner Line Husquarna P#
8 |773264 1 EA $560.04 $560.04 $518.00 $518.00 $299.00 $299.00 $559.00 $559.00 $506.37 $506.37 $295.25 $295.25 $449.97 $449.97
Saw Blade for Cured Concrete (Wet
Cut) 18" x .125 x 1" D.P. Model: Blue
250 V Vanguard Il Series Husqvarna
9 |P#773217 1 EA $260.00 $260.00 $238.00 $238.00 $179.00 $179.00 $276.00 $276.00 $343.24 $343.24 $185.40 $185.40 $299.97 $299.97
Diamond Saw Blade 20" C155 C-446
10 [Concrete, 7 hp 1 EA $357.76 $357.76 $431.00 $431.00 $285.00 $285.00 $486.00 $486.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Diamond Saw Blade ICC 24" C155 C
11 |446 Concrete, 6 hp 1 EA $560.04 $560.04 $556.00 $556.00 $345.00 $345.00 $619.00 $619.00 $565.05 $565.05 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Diamond Saw Blade ICC 18" C140 C
12 |44 Concrete, 7 hp 25 EA $320.86 $8,021.50 $349.00 $8,725.00 $225.00 $5,625.00 $389.00 $9,725.00 $343.24 $8,581.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Diamond Saw Blade ICC 14" C140-
13 |C-44 Concrete, 5.4 hp 40 EA $250.64 $10,025.60 $440.00 $17,600.00 $187.00 $7,480.00 $317.00 $12,680.00 $228.69 $9,147.60 $162.20 $6,488.00 No Bid $0.00
14 | Concrete Grinding Disk, 7 hp 20 EA No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $199.00 $3,980.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
15 _|Asphalt Grinding Disk, 7 hp 20 EA No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $199.00 $3,980.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
16 |Concrete Saw Blade 14", 7 hp 50 EA $45.76 $2,288.00 $41.48 $2,074.00 $65.00 $3,250.00 $54.00 $2,700.00 $32.38 $1.619.00 $95.63 $4.781.50 $79.97 $3,998.50
17 _|Asphalt Cutting Blade 14", 7 hp 50 EA $74.88 $3,744.00 $65.92 $3,296.00 $65.00 $3,250.00 $79.00 $3,950.00 $60.71 $3,035.50 $160.65 $8,032.50 $85.97 $4,298.50
2 1/2" Diamond Tipped Coring Bit
18 |Asphalt 1 EA $171.08 $171.08 $156.80 $156.80 $130.80 $130.80 $173.00 $173.00 $163.98 $163.98|| $214.20 $214.20 $159.97 $159.97
6 1/2" Diamond Tipped Coring Bit
19 |Asphalt 1 EA $241.28 $241.28|| $217.00 $217.00 $191.50 $191.50 No Bid $0.00 $278.38 $278.38||  $331.50 $331.50 $299.97 $299.97
8 1/2" Diamond Tipped Coring Bit
20 _|Asphalt 1 EA $324.48 $324.48 $296.00 $296.00 $293.40 $293.40 No Bid $0.00 $465.38 $465.38||  $382.50 $382.50 $349.97 $349.97
66 HP Saw 20" X .155 X .410 X1"-
21 |PH P#1S1CC20C155C512 Concrete 20 EA $489.32 $9,786.40 $428.00 $8,560.00 $355.00 $7,100.00 $476.00 $9,520.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $499.97 $9,999.40
66 HP Saw Blade 26'X .155 X .410
X1" - PH P# 1CC26C155C512
22 _|Concrete 20 EA $665.60 $13,312.00 $581.00 $11,620.00 $525.00 $10,500.00 $639.00 $12,780.00 No Bid $0.00 $1,115.60 $22,312.00 $599.97 $11,999.40
‘Saw Blade for Cured Concrete 14" x
1/4" x 1" Abrasive Model: Gold RTC
23 |Husavarna P# 3RF214 70 EA $10.80 $756.00 $9.93 $695.10 No Bid $0.00 $12.00 $840.00 $13.04 $912.80 $122.40 $8,568.00 $15.97 $1,117.90
Saw Blade for Metal 12" x 1/8" x 1"
Abrasive Model: Blue QHS-MS
24 |Husavarna P# 23023 140 EA $3.26 $456.40 $3.88 $543.20 No Bid $0.00 $4.00 $560.00 $4.26 $596.40 $107.10 $14,994.00 $12.97 $1,815.80
Saw Blade for Ductile Iron / Cast Iron
12" x 1/8" x 1" Abrasive Model: Green
25 _|QHS-DI P# 23027 850 EA $3.26 $2,771.00 $3.99 $3,391.50 No Bid $0.00 $5.00 $4,250.00 $4.54 $3,859.00 No Bid $0.00 $13.97 $11,874.50
Saw Blade for Concrete / Masonry
14" x 1/8" x 1 Abrasive Model: Red
26 _|QHS-CM Husavarna P# 23021 250 EA $4.42 $1,105.00 $6.04 $1,510.00 No Bid $0.00 $7.00 $1,750.00 $7.13 $1,782.50 No Bid $0.00 $15.97 $3,992.50
12" X 1/8" X 1" Concrete Pipe Saw
Blade National Diamond p/n
27 _|ABMASS 140 EA No Bid $0.00 $3.59 $502.60 $98.00 $13,720.00 $4.00 $560.00 $80.39 $11,254.60 No Bid $0.00 $79.97 $11,195.80
14" X125 x 1 -20mm Vacuum
Brazed Safety Blade, Desert
28 | Diamond pt # 103-14A 100 EA $132.60 $13,260.00 $116.80 $11,680.00 $155.00 $15,500.00 $129.00 $12,900.00 $310.30 $31,030.00 $220.00 $22,000.00 $169.97 $16,997.00
Concrete Diamond Tip Blade 30" x
29 |.155"x.410"x1" 4 EA $772.20 $3,088.80 $743.00 $2,972.00 $665.00 $2,660.00 $817.00 $3,268.00 $708.74 $2,834.96 No Bid $0.00 $699.97 $2,799.88
‘Asphalt Diamond Tip Blade 30" x
31 |.155"x.410"x1" 4 EA $952.12 $3,808.48 $841.00 $3,364.00 $645.00 $2,580.00 $928.00 $3,712.00 $745.98 $2,983.92 No Bid $0.00 $749.97 $2,999.88
Miscellaneous Saw Blades @
Manufacturer List Price Less
32 % Discount. 30,000 EA 48% $15,600.00 51% $14,700.00 25% $22,500.00 25% $22,500.00 25% $22,500.00 30% $21,000.00 15% $25,500.00
Total: $117,330.71 $117,530.20 $124,919.70 $129,965.00 $133.322.98 $139,599.48 $146.868.63
Percentage difference from the low|
bid to the higher bids: 74.99% 75.29% 86.31% 93.84% 98.85% 108.21% 119.05%
Did not submit Submitted Did not submit
Consideration Consideration Consideration Submitted Did not submit Did not submit Did not submit
of Location of Location of Location Consideration of Consideration of Consideration of Consideration of
Bidder's Bidder's Bidder's Location Bidder's Location Bidder's Location Bidder's Location Bidder's
Principal Place Principal Place Principal Place Principal Place Principal Place Principal Place Principal Place
of Business of Business of Business of Business of Business of Business of Business

All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract inf

formation is posted.
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