
 BID NO. 14-0253   BID OPENING DATE: 10/16/2014
 

Buyer: Cristina Camarillo

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Ad A Staff  Romulus Staffing Abacus Service Corporation Resource Personnel Consultan P.I.E. Management, LLC TX Premier Staffing JAG Professional Resources Ask IT Consulting Kelly Services
Arlington, TX 76011  Dallas, TX 75247 Farmington Hills, MI 48331 Fort Worth, TX 76244 Fort Worth, TX 76112 Lanham, MD 20706 Fort Worth, TX 76244 Fort Worth, TX 76112 Fort Worth, TX 76107

Unit of 

Item #  Quantity Issue
Unit 
Price Total Unit Price Total

Unit 
Price Total

Unit 
Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1
Risk Management Analyst, per 
attached specifications. 2,080 HR $26.00 $54,080.00 $33.25 $69,160.00 $27.88 $57,990.40 $37.00 $76,960.00 $29.71 $61,796.80 $34.05 $70,824.00 $40.50 $84,240.00 $53.33 $110,926.40 $49.17 $102,273.60

2
Senior Risk Management Analyst, 
per attached specifications. 2,080 HR $32.50 $67,600.00 $42.25 $87,880.00 $41.81 $86,964.80 $42.50 $88,400.00 $37.54 $78,083.20 $39.45 $82,056.00 $45.50 $94,640.00 $55.00 $114,400.00 $71.52 $148,761.60

3
Administrative Assistant, per 
attached specifications. 2,080 HR $15.93 $33,134.40 $21.15 $43,992.00 $15.32 $31,865.60 $16.80 $34,944.00 $18.18 $37,814.40 $17.35 $36,088.00 $23.40 $48,672.00 $33.18 $69,014.40 $16.92 $35,193.60

4
Assistant Director, per attached 
specifications. 2,080 HR $30.94 $64,355.20 $42.25 $87,880.00 $59.24 $123,219.20 $30.00 $62,400.00 $57.70 $120,016.00 $54.42 $113,193.60 $58.50 $121,680.00 $88.88 $184,870.40 $29.80 $61,984.00

5 Auditor, per attached specifications. 1,040 HR $19.50 $20,280.00 $30.40 $31,616.00 $29.27 $30,440.80 $30.00 $31,200.00 $29.21 $30,378.40 $31.74 $33,009.60 $35.10 $36,504.00 No Bid $0.00 $56.62 $58,884.80

6
Accountant, per attached 
specifications. 1,040 HR $32.50 $33,800.00 $24.00 $24,960.00 $27.88 $28,995.20 $29.75 $30,940.00 $26.67 $27,736.80 $28.97 $30,128.80 $26.00 $27,040.00 $47.40 $49,296.00 $35.76 $37,190.40

7
Senior Accountant, per attached 
specifications. 1,040 HR $39.00 $40,560.00 $30.40 $31,616.00 $41.81 $43,482.40 $36.45 $37,908.00 $31.43 $32,687.20 $41.28 $42,931.20 $29.90 $31,096.00 $59.25 $61,620.00 $42.46 $44,158.40

8 Buyer, per attached specifications. 1,040 HR $27.30 $28,392.00 $26.85 $27,924.00 $16.71 $17,378.40 $30.50 $31,720.00 $29.81 $31,002.40 $25.76 $26,790.40 $29.77 $30,960.80 No Bid $0.00 $43.21 $44,938.40

9 Chemist, per attached specifications. 2,080 HR $33.75 $70,200.00 $26.65 $55,432.00 $30.66 $63,772.80 $28.40 $59,072.00 $34.29 $71,323.20 $27.93 $58,094.40 $27.17 $56,513.60 No Bid $0.00 $25.33 $52,686.40

10
Water Systems Sampler, per 
attached specifications. 2,080 HR $40.63 $84,510.40 $20.05 $41,704.00 $20.90 $43,472.00 $29.20 $60,736.00 $24.96 $51,916.80 $23.90 $49,712.00 $20.80 $43,264.00 No Bid $0.00 $17.88 $37,190.40

11
Microbiologist, per attached 
specifications. 2,080 HR $29.38 $61,110.40 $26.65 $55,432.00 $26.47 $55,057.60 $30.20 $62,816.00 $31.75 $66,040.00 $28.81 $59,924.80 $27.11 $56,388.80 No Bid $0.00 $25.33 $52,686.40

12
Customer Service Representative II, 
per attached specifications. 2,080 HR $16.90 $35,152.00 $16.00 $33,280.00 $15.32 $31,865.60 $19.60 $40,768.00 $17.89 $37,211.20 $17.64 $36,691.20 $18.20 $37,856.00 $26.07 $54,225.60 $16.92 $35,193.60

13
Quality Control Specialist, per 
attached specifications. 2,080 HR $20.80 $43,264.00 $26.65 $55,432.00 $25.08 $52,166.40 $27.50 $57,200.00 $25.40 $52,832.00 $25.71 $53,476.80 $26.85 $55,848.00 $47.40 $98,592.00 $25.38 $52,790.40

14
Library Assistant II, per attached 
specifications. 1,040 HR $13.00 $13,520.00 $20.25 $21,060.00 $13.93 $14,487.20 $23.10 $24,024.00 $24.84 $25,833.60 $19.69 $20,477.60 $20.48 $21,299.20 $26.07 $27,112.80 $19.74 $20,529.60

15
Librarian, per attached 
specifications. 1,040 HR $16.90 $17,576.00 $26.85 $27,924.00 $24.38 $25,355.20 $33.25 $34,580.00 $34.29 $35,661.60 $29.60 $30,784.00 $33.67 $35,016.80 $39.11 $40,674.40 $31.02 $32,260.80

Annual Estimated Total: $667,534.40 $695,292.00 $706,513.60 $733,668.00 $760,333.60 $744,182.40 $781,019.20 $810,732.00 $816,722.40

 All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract information is posted.

BID TABULATION FOR TEMPORARY PROFESSIONAL EMPLOYMENT SERVICES 



 

 

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION One Source Staffing  Makro Romack Staffing International Ariespro Cornerstone Staffing 22nd Century Staffing Primus Global Services
Grand Prairie, TX 75050  Newark, NJ 07102 Irving, TX 75038 Sugar Land, TX 77479 Fort Worth, TX 76102 Leesburg, VA 20175 Irving, TX 75038

Unit of 

Item #  Quantity Issue
Unit 
Price Total Unit Price Total

Unit 
Price Total

Unit 
Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1
Risk Management Analyst, per 
attached specifications. 2,080 HR $45.21 $94,036.80 $38.07 $79,185.60 $28.00 $58,240.00 $37.53 $78,062.40 $39.20 $81,536.00 $75.00 $156,000.00 $45.31 $94,244.80

2
Senior Risk Management Analyst, 
per attached specifications. 2,080 HR $56.17 $116,833.60 $43.17 $89,793.60 $35.00 $72,800.00 $41.41 $86,132.80 $63.26 $131,580.80 $85.00 $176,800.00 $60.90 $126,672.00

3
Administrative Assistant, per 
attached specifications. 2,080 HR $20.55 $42,744.00 $22.56 $46,924.80 $19.60 $40,768.00 $20.70 $43,056.00 $24.10 $50,128.00 $30.00 $62,400.00 $23.20 $48,256.00

4
Assistant Director, per attached 
specifications. 2,080 HR $41.10 $85,488.00 $59.22 $123,177.60 $63.00 $131,040.00 $91.87 $191,089.60 $47.12 $98,009.60 $45.00 $93,600.00 $87.15 $181,272.00

5 Auditor, per attached specifications. 1,040 HR $37.68 $39,187.20 $39.48 $41,059.20 $34.30 $35,672.00 $38.82 $40,372.80 $42.74 $44,449.60 $55.00 $57,200.00 $42.05 $43,732.00

6
Accountant, per attached 
specifications. 1,040 HR $35.62 $37,044.80 $32.43 $33,727.20 $35.00 $36,400.00 $41.41 $43,066.40 $41.06 $42,702.40 $30.00 $31,200.00 $31.90 $33,176.00

7
Senior Accountant, per attached 
specifications. 1,040 HR $43.84 $45,593.60 $36.66 $38,126.40 $42.00 $43,680.00 $50.47 $52,488.80 $45.76 $47,590.40 $45.00 $46,800.00 $47.85 $49,764.00

8 Buyer, per attached specifications. 1,040 HR $24.66 $25,646.40 $38.07 $39,592.80 $26.60 $27,664.00 $51.76 $53,830.40 $34.33 $35,703.20 $25.00 $26,000.00 $38.43 $39,967.20

9 Chemist, per attached specifications. 2,080 HR $36.99 $76,939.20 $31.02 $64,521.60 $49.00 $101,920.00 $29.76 $61,900.80 $35.00 $72,800.00 $30.00 $62,400.00 $41.83 $87,006.40

10
Water Systems Sampler, per 
attached specifications. 2,080 HR $21.92 $45,593.60 $42.30 $87,984.00 $28.00 $58,240.00 $27.17 $56,513.60 $56.53 $117,582.40 $30.00 $62,400.00 $26.10 $54,288.00

11
Microbiologist, per attached 
specifications. 2,080 HR $34.25 $71,240.00 $31.02 $64,521.60 $67.00 $139,360.00 $42.70 $88,816.00 $34.06 $70,844.80 $35.00 $72,800.00 $37.51 $78,020.80

12
Customer Service Representative II, 
per attached specifications. 2,080 HR $17.81 $37,044.80 $22.56 $46,924.80 $21.00 $43,680.00 $20.70 $43,056.00 $24.11 $50,148.80 $20.00 $41,600.00 $20.30 $42,224.00

13
Quality Control Specialist, per 
attached specifications. 2,080 HR $36.31 $75,524.80 $31.02 $64,521.60 $49.00 $101,920.00 $40.11 $83,428.80 $39.52 $82,201.60 $45.00 $93,600.00 $27.55 $57,304.00

14
Library Assistant II, per attached 
specifications. 1,040 HR $23.29 $24,221.60 $23.97 $24,928.80 $19.60 $20,384.00 $16.82 $17,492.80 $22.40 $23,296.00 $30.00 $31,200.00 $25.74 $26,769.60

15
Librarian, per attached 
specifications. 1,040 HR $30.14 $31,345.60 $33.84 $35,193.60 $25.20 $26,208.00 $37.53 $39,031.20 $33.64 $34,985.60 $40.00 $41,600.00 $40.60 $42,224.00

Annual Estimated Total: $848,484.00 $880,183.20 $937,976.00 $978,338.40 $983,559.20 $1,055,600.00 $1,004,920.80

BID TABULATION FOR TEMPORARY PROFESSIONAL EMPLOYMENT SERVICES 

 All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract information is posted.
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