
 BID NO. 14-0021   BID OPENING DATE: 02/13/2014

 

Buyer: Sheila Baker

NAME OF BIDDER & 

LOCATION Trinity ESC  Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc Cleveland Asphalt Heartland Asphalt Materials, Inc. Crafco Texas, Inc Wright Asphalt Products Co.
Arlingotn, TX 76011  Austin, TX 78738 Shepherd, TX 77371 Hurst, TX 76054 San Antoino, TX 78232 Houston, TX

Item 

#  Quantity

Unit of 

Measure Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1

Asphalt Crack Sealer/Brand 

Crafco Poly Flex Type 3 or 

approved equal 200,000 LB NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO_BID $0.00 No-BID $0.00 $0.48 $96,000.00 NO-BID $0.00

2

Emulsified Liquid Asphalt 

Table  8, Catonic Slow Setting 

CSS-1 Pick-up 20,000 GAL NO-BID $0.00 $2.25 $45,000.00 $2.20 $44,000.00 No-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

3

Emulsifies Liquid Asphalt, 

Table 8, Cationic Slow Setting, 

CSS-1 Delivered 30,000 GAL NO-BID $0.00 $2.43 $72,876.00 $2.43 $72,813.00 No-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

4

Emulsifies Liquid sphalt, Table 

8, Cationic Rapid Setting, 

CRS-2 Picked-up 20,000 GAL NO-BID $0.00 $2.25 $45,000.00 $2.20 $44,000.00 $2.10 $42,000.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

5

Emulsifies Liquid sphalt, Table 

8, Cationic RapidSetting, CRS-

2 Delivered 70,000 GAL NO-BID $0.00 $2.39 $167,454.00 $2.43 $169,897.00 $2.22 $155,050.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

6

Pre-coated, Light Weight 

Expanded Shale Aggregate, 

TY PL, Grade 4 Delivered to 

2500 Brennan St 2,500 CUYD $64.50 $161,250.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00 No-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

7

CSS-1H 30/70 (30% Product/ 

70% Water) 20,000 GAL NO-BID $0.00 0.78 $15,600.00 $0.76 $15,200.00 $0.95 $19,000.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

9

Emulisified Liquid Asphalt, 

Table 8 Cationic Rapid 

Setting, CRS-2H, Delivered 

James Ave 70,000 GAL NO-BID $0.00 2.4292 170,044.00$    $2.43 $169,897.00 $2.22 $155,050.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

10

Emulsified Liquid Asphalt, 

Table 8, Cationic, Slow 

Setting, CSS-1H, Delivered-

James Ave 30,000 GAL NO-BID $0.00 2.3922 71,766.00$      $2.43 $72,813.00 $2.22 $66,450.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

11

Emulsified Liquid Asphalt, 

Table 8, Cationic, Slow 

Setting, CSS-1H, Picked-up 20,000 GAL NO-BID $0.00 $2.25 45,000.00 $2.20 $44,000.00 $2.10 $42,000.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

12

Emulsified Liquid Asphalt, 

Table 8, Cationic, 

RapidSetting, CRS-2H, Picked-

up 20,000 GAL NO-BID 0  $2.25 45,000.00 $2.20 $44,000.00 $2.10 $42,000.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

13

Pre-coated, Light Weight 

Expanded Shale Aggregate, 

TY PL, Grade 4 Delivered 

4100 Columbus Trail 2500 CUYD $64.50 $161,250.00  NO-BID 0.00 NO-BID $0.00 No-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

14

CSS-1H 30/70 Delivered to 

locations
2000 GAL NO-BID 0.00 $1.17 $2,342.20 $1.33 $2,655.60 $1.07 $2,130.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

15

Pump Charge

100 EA NO-BID 0.00 $80.00 $8,000.00 None $0.00 $80.00 $8,000.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

16

Federal Enviroment Fee

100 EA NO-BID 0.00 Included in Price None $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO-BID $0.00 NO-BID $0.00

17

18

19

Annual Estimated Total: $322,500.00 $688,082.20 $679,275.60 $531,680.00 $96,000.00
Minimum order:

BID TABULATION FOR ASPHALTIC ROAD AND HIGHWAY

None None

 All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract information is posted.
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