
 BID NO. 13-0117   BID OPENING DATE: 05/30/2013
 

Buyer: Jane Hughes

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION HD Supply Waterworks, LTD  Ferguson Enterprises John Deere Landscapes
Richland, Texas 76118  Fort Worth, Texas 76177 Cleveland, Ohio  44114

Item #  Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 PVC to PVC  4” x 3” 300 EA $2.63 $789.00 $4.01 $1,203.00 $8.83 $2,650.20
2 PVC to PVC 3” 40 EA $2.23 $89.20 $4.47 $178.80 NO BID $0.00
3 PVC to PVC 4” 1500 EA $2.63 $3,945.00 $3.72 $5,580.00 $2.95 $4,423.50
4 PVC to PVC 6” 300 EA $5.80 $1,740.00 $10.72 $3,216.00 $9.32 $2,796.00
5 PVC to PVC 8” 100 EA $8.50 $850.00 $15.69 $1,569.00 $17.41 $1,740.60
6 PVC to PVC 10” 20 EA $11.89 $237.80 $18.38 $367.60 $82.31 $1,646.20
7 PVC to PVC 12” 15 EA $13.97 $209.55 $21.45 $321.75 $109.65 $1,644.81
8 PVC to PVC 15” 10 EA $18.33 $183.30 $35.26 $352.60 NO BID $0.00
9 PVC to PVC 18” 10 EA $66.83 $668.30 $78.06 $780.60 $338.67 $3,386.71
10 PVC to PVC 24” 10 EA $89.67 $896.70 $104.74 $1,047.40 $649.59 $6,495.86
11 Concrete to PVC 4” 800 EA $3.18 $2,544.00 $4.02 $3,216.00 NO BID $0.00
12 Clay to PVC 4” 250 EA $2.79 $697.50 $4.68 $1,170.00 NO BID $0.00
13 Concrete to Concrete 4” 10 EA $2.96 $29.60 $12.66 $126.60 NO BID $0.00
14 Clay to Clay 4” 10 EA $2.96 $29.60 $6.04 $60.40 NO BID $0.00
15 Concrete to PVC 6” 200 EA $6.61 $1,322.00 $8.80 $1,760.00 NO BID $0.00
16 Clay to PVC 6” 100 EA $6.28 $628.00 $9.68 $968.00 NO BID $0.00
17 Concrete to Concrete 6” 10 EA $6.43 $64.30 $27.99 $279.90 NO BID $0.00
18 Concrete to PVC 8” 50 EA $9.96 $498.00 $17.07 $853.50 NO BID $0.00
19 Clay to PVC 8” 40 EA $9.25 $370.00 $15.75 $630.00 NO BID $0.00
20 Concrete to Concrete 8” 10 EA $9.25 $92.50 $42.93 $429.30 NO BID $0.00
21 Clay to Clay 8” 10 EA $9.04 $90.40 $22.43 $224.30 NO BID $0.00
22 Clay to PVC 10” 10 EA $13.73 $137.30 $31.17 $311.70 NO BID $0.00
23 Concrete to PVC 10” 20 EA $14.73 $294.60 $21.56 $431.20 NO BID $0.00
24 Concrete to Concrete 10” 10 EA $14.73 $147.30 $61.31 $613.10 NO BID $0.00
25 Clay to Clay 10” 10 EA $14.73 $147.30 $31.17 $311.70 NO BID $0.00
26 Clay to PVC 12” 25 EA $15.03 $375.75 $21.45 $536.25 NO BID $0.00
27 Concrete to PVC 12” 25 EA $17.59 $439.75 $36.38 $909.50 NO BID $0.00
28 Concrete to Concrete 12” 10 EA $47.55 $475.50 $71.23 $712.30 NO BID $0.00
29 Clay to Clay 12” 10 EA $17.59 $175.90 $36.38 $363.80 NO BID $0.00
30 Clay to PVC 15” 10 EA $27.35 $273.50 $35.26 $352.60 NO BID $0.00
31 Concrete to PVC 15” 10 EA $42.11 $421.10 $49.19 $491.90 NO BID $0.00
32 Clay to Clay 15” 10 EA $30.19 $301.90 $60.84 $608.40 NO BID $0.00
33 Concrete to PVC 18” 50 EA $66.83 $3,341.50 $84.50 $4,225.00 NO BID $0.00
34 Clay to PVC 21” 10 EA $78.26 $782.60 $96.40 $964.00 NO BID $0.00
35 Concrete to PVC 21” 10 EA $223.23 $2,232.30 $353.06 $3,530.60 NO BID $0.00
36 Clay to PVC 24” 10 EA $89.67 $896.70 $110.00 $1,100.00 NO BID $0.00
37 Concrete to PVC 24” 10 EA $261.51 $2,615.10 $400.24 $4,002.40 NO BID $0.00
38 RSPG ASTM-C-654 Gasket 1-1/2” 10 EA $1.72 $17.20 $2.00 $20.00 NO BID $0.00
39 RSPG ASTM-C-654 Gasket 2” 10 EA $1.72 $17.20 $2.62 $26.20 NO BID $0.00
40 RSPG ASTM-C-654 Gasket 4” 100 EA $2.90 $290.00 $3.47 $347.00 NO BID $0.00
41 RSPG ASTM-C-654 Gasket 6” 50 EA $4.62 $231.00 $5.51 $275.50 NO BID $0.00
42 RSPG ASTM-C-654 Gasket 8” 15 EA $18.05 $270.75 $12.21 $183.15 NO BID $0.00
43 RSPG ASTM-C-654 Gasket 10” 200 EA $25.33 $5,066.00 $18.63 $3,726.00 NO BID $0.00
44 RSPG ASTM-C-654 Gasket 12” 15 EA $35.60 $534.00 $23.41 $351.15 NO BID $0.00
45 RSPG ASTM-C-654 Gasket 15” 15 EA $41.87 $628.05 $28.01 $420.15 NO BID $0.00
46 Flex Rubber Saddle Tee W/LGE Clamp 

(DFW4TC) 4”
300

EA $18.34 $5,502.00 $30.93 $9,279.00 NO BID $0.00

Percentage off Book Price:
50% 

discount
25% 

discount 0% discount

Annual Estimated Total: $41,589.05 $58,427.35 $24,783.88
Percentage difference from the low bid to 

the higher bids: Item #1 52.47% Item #1 120.30%

BID TABULATION FOR FLEXIBLE PIPE COUPLINGS AND ADAPTERS

 All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract information is posted.
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