
 BID NO. 13-0066   BID OPENING DATE: 2/21/2013

 

Buyer: Cristina Camarillo

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Ad-A-Staff, Inc.  TBey Consulting Group, Inc TS Staffing Services, Inc Makro Technologies, Inc P.I.E. Management, LLC Resource Personnel Consultants
Arlington, TX 76011  Desoto, TX 75115 New York, NY 10038 Newark, NJ 07102 Fort Worth, TX 76112 Addison, TX 75244

Unit of 

Item #  Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

2 ACCOUNTANT 1,040 HR $25.00 $26,000.00 $26.03 $27,071.20 $24.24 $25,209.60 $33.75 $35,100.00 $26.67 $27,736.80 $37.70 $39,208.00

3 SENIOR ACCOUNTANT 1,040 HR $30.00 $31,200.00 $34.50 $35,880.00 $29.39 $30,565.60 $36.45 $37,908.00 $30.01 $31,210.40 $47.85 $49,764.00

4 BUYER 1,040 HR $25.00 $26,000.00 $27.33 $28,423.20 $29.99 $31,189.60 $38.28 $39,811.20 $29.81 $31,002.40 $29.00 $30,160.00

6 CHEMIST 2,080 HR No Bid $0.00 $26.68 $55,494.40 $28.40 $59,072.00 $27.20 $56,576.00 $35.74 $74,339.20 $27.55 $57,304.00

7 SENIOR CHEMIST 2,080 HR No Bid $0.00 $32.55 $67,704.00 $36.42 $75,753.60 $31.28 $65,062.40 $50.98 $106,038.40 $47.85 $99,528.00

8 MICROBIOLOGIST 2,080 HR No Bid $0.00 $26.03 $54,142.40 $28.40 $59,072.00 $27.20 $56,576.00 $33.20 $69,056.00 $33.35 $69,368.00

9 SENIOR MICROBIOLOGIST 2,080 HR No Bid $0.00 $33.85 $70,408.00 $36.47 $75,857.60 $31.28 $65,062.40 $38.28 $79,622.40 $47.85 $99,528.00

10 QUALITY CONTROL SPECIALIST 2,080 HR No Bid $0.00 $29.50 $61,360.00 $28.00 $58,240.00 $31.28 $65,062.40 $26.85 $55,848.00 $29.00 $60,320.00

11 LIBRARY ASSISTANT II 1,040 HR $20.00 $20,800.00 $17.40 $18,096.00 $22.10 $22,984.00 $20.55 $21,372.00 $24.84 $25,833.60 $26.10 $27,144.00

12 LIBRARIAN 1,040 HR $25.00 $26,000.00 $26.25 $27,300.00 $27.30 $28,392.00 $33.75 $35,100.00 $34.29 $35,661.60 $34.80 $36,192.00

13 AUDITOR 1,040 HR $30.00 $31,200.00 $30.00 $31,200.00 $28.60 $29,744.00 $39.60 $41,184.00 $29.21 $30,378.40 $37.70 $39,208.00

Annual Estimated Total: $161,200.00 $477,079.20 $496,080.00 $518,814.40 $566,727.20 $607,724.00

BID TABULATION FOR TEMPORARY PROFESSIONAL EMPLOYMENT SERVICES 

 All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract information is posted.


