TRAFFIC SIGNAL PARTS BID 13-0057
TABULATED BY: La'Kita Slack-Johnson, Buye
VENDORS
1 2 3 4 5 6
Traffic Parts Inc General Traffic Equipment Inc. Siemens Industrial, Inc. McCain Consolidated Traffic Paradigm Traffic Systems
Spring, TX 77383 Newburgh, NY, 12550 Grand Prarie, TX 75050 League City, TX 77573 Arlington, TX 76015 Arlington, TX 76011
UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM | UNIT DESCRIPTION QTY PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
*ESTIMATED QUANTITIES
TRAFFIC SIGNAL 1-WAY 3 SECTION 8"
WITH VISORS (DETACHED) AND LED
1 Ea |INSERT 50 $ 230.99( $11,549.50| $ 200.00( $ 10,000.00| $ 214.00( $ 10,700.00( $ 249.00( $ 12,450.00| § 252.41 $ 12,620.50( $ 387.00 [ $ 19,350.00
TRAFFIC SIGNAL 1-WAY 3 SECTION 12"
WITH VISOR (DETACHED) AND LED
2 Ea |INSERT 75 $ 264.21( $19,815.75| $ 245.00( $ 18,375.00| $ 264.00( $ 19,800.00( $ 283.50( $ 21,262.50| § 314.620| $ 23,596.50 | § 418.00|$ 31,350.00
3 Ea |REPLACEMENT LED 12" RED BALL 50 $ 43.75| $ 2,187.50| $ 38.00| $ 1,900.00| $ 29.00( $ 1,450.00( § 37.50| $ 1,875.00| $ 41580 $ 2,079.00($ 33.00| $ 1,650.00
4 Ea |REPLACEMENT LED 12" GREEN BALL 50 $ 45.00| $ 2,250.001 $§  40.00( $ 2,000.00( $ 33.00/ $ 1,650.00| $ 48.00( $ 2,400.00( § 47340 $ 2,367.00( $ 34.00| $ 1,700.00
5 Ea |REPLACEMENT LED 12" YELLOW BALL 50 $ 48.12| $ 2,406.00| $ 35.00| § 1,750.00| $ 33.00( $ 1,650.00( § 43.00( $ 2,150.00( § 4460 $ 2,230.00($ 37.00| $ 1,850.00
TRAFFIC SIGNAL ARROW LED GREEN 12"
6 Ea |BALL 25 $ 52.18| § 1,304.50( $ 40.00| § 1,000.00| $ 47.00( $ 1,175.00( § 48.00( $ 1,200.00( $ 4765 % 1,191.35]§ 45.00| $ 1,125.00
TRAFFIC SIGNAL ARROW LED RED 12"
7 Ea |BALL 25 $ 46.25| $ 1,156.25| §$ 35.00| $ 875.00| $ 42.00( $ 1,050.00( $ 39.00| § 975.00( ¢ 41.89($ 1,047.25]§ 36.00 | § 900.00
TRAFFIC SIGNAL ARROW LED YELLOW 12"
8 Ea |BALL 25 $ 46.87| $ 1,171.75| § 32.00| § 800.00( $ 38.00| $ 950.00( $ 45.00( $ 1,125.00( $ 45.00( $ 1,125.00]$ 36.00 | § 900.00
9 Ea |REPLACEMENT 8" LED RED BALL 20 $ 42.50| § 850.00| $ 25.00| $ 500.00( $ 27.00| § 540.00| $ 39.00| § 780.00( ¢ 3565| $ 713.00 | $ 32.00| § 640.00
10 Ea |REPLACEMENT 8" LED YELLOW BALL 20 $ 46.87| $§ 937.40| $ 22.00| $ 440.00| $ 29.000( $ 580.00| $ 51.00] $ 1,020.00| ¢ 4012 § 802.40 | $ 36.00 | § 720.00
11 Ea |REPLACEMENT LED 8" GREEN BALL 20 $ 43.75| $§ 875.00| $ 25.00| § 500.00( $ 26.000| $ 520.00| $ 45.00( $ 900.00( § 4018 | § 803.60 | § 33.00| § 660.00
TRAFFIC SIGNAL ARROW 8" LED GREEN
12 Ea |BALL 15 $ 55.12| $ 826.80| $ 35.00| $ 525.00( $ 46.00( § 690.00| § 71.50| § 1,072.50| § 45.00 | $ 675.00 | $ 44.00| $ 660.00
TRAFFIC SIGNAL ARROW 8" LED YELLOW
13 Ea |BALL 15 $ 41.87| § 628.05| $ 40.00| $ 600.00( $ 44.00| $ 660.00| $ 66.00| $ 990.00( § 4471 § 670.65 | $ 31.00| § 465.00
14 Ea TRAFFIC SIGNAL ARROW 8" LED RED BALL 15 $ 41.87| $ 628.05 $ 40.00| $ 600.00| $ 41.00| $ 615.00| $ 71.50( $ 1,072.50| § 40.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 31.00| $ 465.00
REPLACEMENT VISOR 8" UNIVERSAL
15 Ea |TUNNEL 30 $ 17.78 $ 533.40| § 12.00( $ 360.00( $ 7.00| $ 210.00( $ 5.50( $ 165.00| $ 10.00| § 300.00 | $ 12.50 | $ 375.00
REPLACEMENT VISOR 12" UNIVERSAL
16 Ea |TUNNEL 50 $ 22.24| $ 1,112.00| $ 17.00( $ 850.00( $ 10.00| $ 500.00| $ 12.50( $ 625.00( § 16.88 | § 844.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 650.00
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ITEM | UNIT DESCRIPTION QTY PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

MAST ARM MOUNT SIGNAL BRACKET 1-

17 Ea |WAY CABLE MOUNT CLAMP ASSEMBLY 60 No Bid NoBid| $  82.00| $ 4,920.00| $ 142.00( $ 8,520.00( $ 116.00( $ 6,960.00 13238 $  7,942.80| § 124.00 | $ 7,440.00
MAST ARM MOUNT SIGNAL BRACKET 2-

18 Ea |WAY CABLE MOUNT 50 No Bid No Bid| § 144.00| $ 7,200.00| $ 231.00( $ 11,550.00| $ 198.00( $ 9,900.00 145.00 | $ 7,250.00 | § 197.00| $§ 9,850.00
INTERNATIONAL PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL
HOUSING WITH LED COUNT DOWN

19 Ea |INSERT 50 $ 248.62| $12,431.00f $ 272.00( $ 13,600.00| $ 215.00( $ 10,750.00( $ 287.00( $ 14,350.00 364.69 | $ 18,234.50 | § 269.00 [ $ 13,450.00
INTERNATIONAL PEDESTRIAN INSERT LED

20 Ea |COUNT DOWN 50 $ 139.58| § 6,979.00( $ 125.00| $ 6,250.00| $ 122.00( $ 6,100.00( $§ 159.00| $ 7,950.00 202.13 [ $ 10,106.50 | $ 125.00| $ 6,250.00
INTERNATIONAL PEDESTRIAN INSERT LED

21 Ea |HAND/MAN 50 $ 94.58| $ 4,729.001 $§ 85.00( $ 4,250.00( $ 79.00( $ 3,950.00| § 98.00| $ 4,900.00 106.71 | $ 5,335.50| § 81.00| $ 4,050.00
PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL HEAD MOUNTING

22 Ea |HARDWARE 50 $ 55.33| § 2,766.50( $ 36.00| $ 1,800.00( $ 39.00( $ 1,950.00| § 46.00( $ 2,300.00 62.50| $ 3,125.00( $ 57.00| $ 2,850.00
PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY FOR
PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL 9 X 15 WITH

23 Ea |FOREVER 2" PLUNGER BUTTON 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| $ 172.00( $ 6,880.00( $ 222.25| § 8,890.00 14594 | $ 583760 $ 235.00 [ $ 9,400.00
PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY FOR
PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL 5 X 7 WITH

24 Ea |FOREVER 2" PLUNGER BUTTON 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| $ 141.00[ $ 3,525.00( $ 125.25| § 3,131.25 119.69| $ 2,992.25( § 140.00| $ 3,500.00
SIGN FOR PEDESTRIAN STATION 9 X 15
FRONT AND BACK PRINTED RIGHT OR

25 Ea |LEFT ARROW 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid| $ 23.00( $ 1,150.00| $ 25.50( $ 1,275.00 19.69 | $ 984.50 | $ 37.00| $ 1,850.00
SIGN FOR 9 X 15 2 WAY ARROW FOR

26 Ea MIDDLE OF STREET PEDESTRIAN 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| $ 23.00( $ 575.00| § 25.50| $ 637.50 19.69| $ 492.25 | $ 37.00| $ 925.00
SIGN FOR PEDESTRIAN 5 X 7 PRINTED ON

27 Ea FRONT AND BACK RIGHT OR LEFT ARROW 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| $ 15.00| $ 750.00| § 15.50| § 775.00 1265| $ 632.50 | $ 15.00| $ 750.00
SIGN FOR PEDESTRIAN STATION 5 X 7
WITH DOUBLE ARROW FOR MIDDLE OF

28 Ea |ROAD 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid| $§ 15.00| $ 375.00| $ 15.50( $ 387.50 1265| $ 316.25 | $ 15.00 | $ 375.00
SQUARE POLE BASE 4 1/2 HOLE

29 Ea ALUMINUM PB5335 50 $ 154.57| § 7,728.50| $ 122.00( § 6,100.00f $ 160.00| § 8,000.00| $ 171.00| $ 8,550.00 129.13 | $ 6,456.50 | $ 114.00 | § 5,700.00
Total Cost $82,865.95 $  85,195.00 $106,815.00 $120,068.75 $121,371.40 $ 129,850.00
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