
CITY OF FORT WORTH
13-0001 BID TABULATION SHEET

City of Fort Worth Bid Tabulation                                     
Bid No. 13-0001 Parking Meters and Credit Card 
Mechanisms

LINE 
ITEM TYPE OF MARKING

ANNUAL 
ESTIMATED 

QTY
UNIT 

PRICE
EXTENDED 

TOTAL
UNIT 

PRICE
EXTENDED  

TOTAL
UNIT 

PRICE
EXTENDED 

TOTAL

1. Parking Meter for Single Space, per specification 60 No Bid No Bid $477.60 $28,656.00 $505.00 $30,300.00

2.
Parking Meter for 2 Spaces, per specification

65 No Bid No Bid $603.20 $39,208.00 $1,440.000 $93,600.00

3.
Parking Meter for 3 Spaces, per specification

65 No Bid No Bid $684.16 $44,470.40 $2,340.00 $152,100.00

4.
Parking Meter for 4 Spaces, per specification

35 No Bid No Bid $746.29 $26,120.15 $3,130.00 $109,550.00

5. Parking Meter Handheld Data Wand, per specifications 3 No Bid No Bid $2,300.00 $6,900.00 No Bid No Bid

6. Credit Card Mechanism 200 $495.00 $99,000.00 $375.00 $75,000.00 $0.00 $0.00

7. Installation Cost Credit Card Mechannism 100 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $25.00 $2,500.00

8. Initial On-Site Training 1 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

9. Annual Fees 1 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $51,486.30 $51,486.30 $36,225.00 $36,225.00

10.
% Discounts from price sheet or catolog for parts, pieces 
and other related items 0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

GRAND TOTAL $106,700.00 $271,840.85 $424,275.00

Optional Spare Parts Total 2,222.00$    

$108,922.00

Duncan Solutions         
Milwaukee, WI 53203 
(816) 219-4917

POM Incorporated 
Russellville, Arkansas 
53203                             
(469) 968-2880

IPS Group, Inc.                  
San Diego, CA 92121          
(858) 404-0607
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