
Buyer: Teresa Lobacz

Description

Size 

(Inches) Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost 

CLAMP, 6" JOINT LEAK 6 5 each $90.68 $453.40 $71.46 $357.30 $89.28 $446.40 $92.03 $460.15 $95.00 $475.00

CLAMP, 8" JOINT LEAK 8 5 each $125.00 $625.00 $115.54 $577.70 $123.36 $616.80 $95.39 $476.95 $130.00 $650.00

CLAMP, 10" JOINT LEAK 10 5 each $157.00 $785.00 $165.00 $825.00 $155.00 $775.00 $130.49 $652.45 $165.00 $825.00

CLAMP, 12" JOINT LEAK 12 5 each $170.00 $850.00 $188.00 $940.00 $167.66 $838.30 $223.57 $1,117.85 $177.00 $885.00

CLAMP, 16" JOINT LEAK 16 5 each $264.53 $1,322.65 $551.90 $2,759.50 $259.14 $1,295.70 $276.68 $1,383.40 $275.00 $1,375.00

CLAMP, 18" JOINT LEAK 18 5 each $367.59 $1,837.95 $708.77 $3,543.85 $360.10 $1,800.50 $350.85 $1,754.25 $380.00 $1,900.00

CLAMP, 20" JOINT LEAK 20 5 each $426.87 $2,134.35 $720.29 $3,601.45 $418.17 $2,090.85 $369.69 $1,848.45 $448.00 $2,240.00

CLAMP, 24" JOINT LEAK 24 5 each $486.16 $2,430.80 $811.66 $4,058.30 $476.25 $2,381.25 $493.77 $2,468.85 $512.00 $2,560.00

CLAMP, 30" JOINT LEAK 30 5 each $857.39 $4,286.95 $1,166.66 $5,833.30 $839.90 $4,199.50 $685.81 $3,429.05 $865.00 $4,325.00

CLAMP, 36" JOINT LEAK 36 5 each $1,030.70 $5,153.50 $1,547.46 $7,737.30 $999.45 $4,997.25 $939.54 $4,697.70 $1,032.00 $5,160.00

Total   $3,975.92 $19,879.60 $6,046.74 $30,233.70 $3,888.31 $19,441.55 $3,657.82 $18,289.10 $4,079.00 $20,395.00

Description

Size 

(Inches) Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost 

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 4x3/4 50 each $26.54 $1,327.00 $26.95 $1,347.50 $31.20 $1,560.00 $28.93 $1,446.50 $27.00 $1,350.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 6x3/4 10 each $30.65 $306.46 $31.00 $310.00 $35.85 $358.50 $32.40 $324.00 $32.00 $320.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 8x3/4 10 each $35.65 $356.46 $36.00 $360.00 $42.38 $423.80 $35.62 $356.20 $38.00 $380.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 10x3/4 10 each $43.04 $430.42 $43.50 $435.00 $50.36 $503.60 $38.78 $387.80 $45.00 $450.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 12x3/4 10 each $50.10 $501.04 $51.00 $510.00 $58.61 $586.10 $45.31 $453.10 $52.00 $520.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 4x1 20 each $26.68 $533.54 $26.95 $539.00 $31.20 $624.00 $29.93 $598.60 $27.00 $540.00
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Water Pipe Repair Parts 

ITB # 12-0203 Bid Open Date: August 2, 2012

Size 

(Inches) Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost 

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 6x1 100 each $30.61 $3,061.40 $31.00 $3,100.00 $35.85 $3,585.00 $32.40 $3,240.00 $32.00 $3,200.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 8x1 100 each $35.60 $3,560.00 $36.00 $3,600.00 $42.38 $4,238.00 $35.62 $3,562.00 $38.00 $3,800.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 10x1 20 each $43.04 $860.84 $43.50 $870.00 $50.36 $1,007.20 $38.78 $775.60 $45.00 $900.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 12x1 40 each $50.10 $2,004.16 $51.00 $2,040.00 $58.61 $2,344.40 $45.31 $1,812.40 $52.00 $2,080.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 16x1 10 each $86.66 $866.56 $90.00 $900.00 $84.30 $843.00 $68.78 $687.80 $68.00 $680.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 4x1.5 20 each $29.05 $581.04 $29.50 $590.00 $33.95 $679.00 $36.69 $733.80 $33.00 $660.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 6x1.5 10 each $33.29 $332.92 $34.00 $340.00 $38.95 $389.50 $43.82 $438.20 $35.00 $350.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 8x1.5 10 each $37.99 $379.90 $40.00 $400.00 $45.85 $458.50 $53.19 $531.90 $39.00 $390.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 10x1.5 10 each $46.40 $463.96 $46.88 $468.80 $54.15 $541.50 $61.88 $618.80 $48.00 $480.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 12x1.5 10 each $53.66 $536.60 $54.22 $542.20 $62.75 $627.50 $62.76 $627.60 $55.00 $550.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 3x2 10 each - No bid - No Bid $36.90 $369.00 $33.58 $335.80 - No Bid

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 4x2 10 each $29.05 $290.50 $29.35 $293.50 $37.59 $375.90 $36.69 $366.90 $33.00 $330.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 6x2 10 each $33.29 $332.90 $33.65 $336.50 $42.95 $429.50 $43.82 $438.20 $36.00 $360.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 8x2 20 each $37.99 $759.80 $34.64 $692.80 $50.00 $1,000.00 $53.19 $1,063.80 $42.00 $840.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 10x2 10 each $46.40 $464.00 $46.88 $468.80 $58.40 $584.00 $61.88 $618.80 $48.00 $480.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 12x2 10 each $53.66 $536.60 $54.22 $542.20 $67.15 $671.50 $62.76 $627.60 $56.00 $560.00

Tap Saddles (cc thread) 16x2 10 each $73.39 $733.90 $75.00 $750.00 $90.15 $901.50 $74.93 $749.30 $75.00 $750.00

Tap Saddles (NPT Thread) 4x3/4 5 each $26.68 $133.40 $26.95 $134.75 $31.20 $156.00 $28.93 $144.65 $28.00 $140.00

Tap Saddles (NPT Thread) 4x1 10 each $26.68 $266.80 $26.95 $269.50 $31.20 $312.00 $28.93 $289.30 $29.00 $290.00

Tap Saddles (NPT Thread) 6x1 10 each $30.65 $306.50 $31.00 $310.00 $35.85 $358.50 $32.40 $324.00 $33.00 $330.00

Powerseal Pipeline Products Texas Water ProductsMorrison Supply Municipal Water Works SupplyFerguson



Buyer: Teresa Lobacz

Water Pipe Repair Parts 

ITB # 12-0203 Bid Open Date: August 2, 2012

Size 

(Inches) Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost 

Tap Saddles (NPT Thread) 12x1 20 each $50.10 $1,002.00 $51.00 $1,020.00 $58.61 $1,172.20 $45.31 $906.20 $54.00 $1,080.00

Tap Saddles (NPT Thread) 3x2 10 each $29.12 $291.20 $29.35 $293.50 $35.50 $355.00 $33.58 $335.80 $39.00 $390.00

Tap Saddles (NPT Thread) 4x2 10 each $29.05 $290.50 $29.35 $293.50 $37.59 $375.90 $34.35 $343.50 $33.00 $330.00

Tap Saddles (NPT Thread) 6x2 10 each $33.29 $332.90 $33.65 $336.50 $42.95 $429.50 $39.41 $394.10 $36.00 $360.00

Tap Saddles (NPT Thread) 16x2 10 each $73.39 $733.90 $75.00 $750.00 $90.15 $901.50 $74.93 $749.30 $76.00 $760.00

Total  $1,231.80 $22,577.20 $1,248.49 $22,844.05 $1,502.94 $27,161.60 $1,374.89 $24,281.55 $1,284.00 $23,650.00

Description

Size 

(Inches) Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost 

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE W/TAP, 4" X 7.5", 3/4" CC 4 50 each $47.39 $2,369.50 $49.00 $2,450.00 $54.10 $2,705.00 - No Bid $52.00 $2,600.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE W/TAP, 4" X 7.5", 1" CC 4 20 each $47.39 $947.80 $49.00 $980.00 $54.10 $1,082.00 - No Bid $52.00 $1,040.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE W/TAP, 6" X 7.5", 1" CC 6 50 each $52.95 $2,647.50 $54.90 $2,745.00 $59.20 $2,960.00 - No Bid $56.00 $2,800.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE W/TAP, 6" X 7.5", 3/4" CC 6 500 each $52.97 $26,485.00 $54.90 $27,450.00 $59.20 $29,600.00 - No Bid $56.00 $28,000.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE W/TAP, 8" X 12.5", 1" CC 8 350 each $86.00 $30,100.00 $89.45 $31,307.50 $94.95 $33,232.50 - No Bid $87.00 $30,450.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE W/TAP, 8"X 7.5", 1" CC 8 50 each $65.45 $3,272.50 $69.77 $3,488.50 $66.79 $3,339.50 - No Bid $70.00 $3,500.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE W/TAP, 8"X 7.5", 3/4" CC 8 100 each $65.45 $6,545.00 $69.77 $6,977.00 $66.79 $6,679.00 - No Bid $70.00 $7,000.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE W/TAP, 8" X 12.5", 3/4" CC 8 50 each $85.83 $4,291.50 $89.45 $4,472.50 $94.95 $4,747.50 - No Bid $88.00 $4,400.00

COUPLING FULL CIRCLE, 2" X 7.50" 2x7.5 60 each $24.86 $1,491.60 $25.37 $1,522.20 $33.17 $1,990.20 - No Bid $27.00 $1,620.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE, 3" X 7.5", 3x7.5 50 each $30.20 $1,510.00 $30.83 $1,541.50 $37.36 $1,868.00 - No Bid $32.00 $1,600.00

Powerseal Pipeline Products Texas Water ProductsFerguson Morrison Supply Municipal Water Works Supply

Powerseal Pipeline Products Texas Water Products

 Stainless Steel Full Circle Couplings (specification section 3.3 

through 3.5) Ferguson Morrison Supply Municipal Water Works Supply



Buyer: Teresa Lobacz

Water Pipe Repair Parts 

ITB # 12-0203 Bid Open Date: August 2, 2012

Size 

(Inches) Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost 

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE, 4" X 7.50", 4x7.5 50 each $32.57 $1,628.50 $33.25 $1,662.50 $39.54 $1,977.00 - No Bid $36.00 $1,800.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE, 6" X 7.50" 6x7.5 300 each $38.45 $11,535.00 $39.26 $11,778.00 $42.82 $12,846.00 - No Bid $38.00 $11,400.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE, 6" X 12.50" 6x12.5 650 each $61.48 $39,962.00 $62.77 $40,800.50 $68.52 $44,538.00 - No Bid $60.00 $39,000.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE, 8" X 7.50" 8x7.5 300 each $45.13 $13,540.20 $45.77 $13,731.00 $50.25 $15,075.00 - No Bid $45.00 $13,500.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE, 8" X 12.50" 8x12.5 600 each $72.19 $43,314.00 $73.78 $44,268.00 $80.50 $48,300.00 - No Bid $70.00 $42,000.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE, 10" X 15" 10x15 50 each $106.46 $5,323.00 $108.70 $5,435.00 $118.74 $5,937.00 - No Bid $105.00 $5,250.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE, 12"X 15" 12x15 150 each $98.37 $14,755.65 $100.44 $15,066.00 $135.62 $20,343.00 - No Bid $122.00 $18,300.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE, 16" X 30" 16x30 10 each $524.39 $5,243.90 $534.48 $5,344.80 $572.20 $5,722.00 - No Bid $530.00 $5,300.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE, 18" X 30" 18x30 10 each $601.59 $6,015.90 $598.00 $5,980.00 $603.00 $6,030.00 - No Bid $0.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE, 20" X 30" 20x30 10 each $615.00 $6,150.00 $613.62 $6,136.20 $652.00 $6,520.00 - No Bid $580.00 $5,800.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE, 24"X30" 24x30 10 each $999.06 $9,990.60 $101.90 $1,019.00 $1,093.00 $10,930.00 - No Bid $980.00 $9,800.00

COUPLING, FULL CIRCLE, 30" X 30", 30x30 5 each $1,045.95 $5,229.74 $1,066.86 $5,334.30 $1,147.50 $5,737.50 - No Bid $1,025.00 $5,125.00

Total  $4,799.13 $242,348.89 $3,961.27 $239,489.50 $5,224.30 $272,159.20 $0.00 $0.00 $4,181.00 $240,285.00

Description

Size 

(Inches) Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost 

SLEEVE, REPAIR, 4" (4.80-5.10) 4 5 each $39.60 $198.00 $47.97 $239.85 $39.39 $196.95 $42.00 $210.00 $43.00 $215.00

SLEEVE, REPAIR, 6" (6.90-7.22) 6 500 each $50.51 $25,255.00 $62.90 $31,450.00 $50.52 $25,260.00 $55.42 $27,710.00 $54.00 $27,000.00

SLEEVE, REPAIR , 8" (9.05-9.30) 8 200 each $63.85 $12,770.00 $77.69 $15,538.00 $63.86 $12,772.00 $77.62 $15,524.00 $66.00 $13,200.00

SLEEVE, REPAIR, 10" (11.10-11.60) 10 10 each $89.12 $891.19 $102.40 $1,024.00 $88.66 $886.60 $101.96 $1,019.60 $90.00 $900.00

Morrison Supply Municipal Water Works Supply Powerseal Pipeline Products Texas Water ProductsTransition /Telescopic Sleeves (specification section 3.6) Ferguson

Ferguson Morrison Supply Municipal Water Works Supply Powerseal Pipeline Products Texas Water Products



Buyer: Teresa Lobacz

Water Pipe Repair Parts 

ITB # 12-0203 Bid Open Date: August 2, 2012

Size 

(Inches) Quantity Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost Unit Cost Extended Cost 

SLEEVE, REPAIR, 12" (13.20-13.50) 12 10 each $107.00 $1,070.00 $123.13 $1,231.30 $106.76 $1,067.60 $147.03 $1,470.30 $110.00 $1,100.00

SLEEVE, REPAIR, 16" (17.40-17.80) 16 30 each $240.00 $7,200.00 $252.87 $7,586.10 $238.83 $7,164.90 $249.19 $7,475.70 $250.00 $7,500.00

SLEEVE, REPAIR, 18" (19.50-19.92) 18 5 each $336.00 $1,680.00 $373.25 $1,866.25 $334.32 $1,671.60 $286.10 $1,430.50 $345.00 $1,725.00

SLEEVE, REPAIR, 20" (21.60-22.06), 20 10 each $349.00 $3,490.00 $447.38 $4,473.80 $348.31 $3,483.10 $352.98 $3,529.80 $355.00 $3,550.00

SLEEVE, REPAIR, 24" (25.80-26.32) 24 10 each $429.00 $4,290.00 $760.44 $7,604.40 $428.24 $4,282.40 $522.25 $5,222.50 $440.00 $4,400.00

SLEEVE, REPAIR, 30" (32.00-32.40) 30 10 each $494.50 $4,945.00 $943.93 $9,439.30 $493.80 $4,938.00 $720.45 $7,204.50 $510.00 $5,100.00

SLEEVE, REPAIR, 36" (38.30-38.70) 36 1 each $589.00 $589.00 $1,206.68 $1,206.68 $588.26 $588.26 $2,263.00 $2,263.00 $600.00 $600.00

SLEEVE, REPAIR, 42" (44.50-45.10) 42 1 each $814.18 $814.18 $1,642.28 $1,642.28 $813.34 $813.34 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $820.00 $820.00

SLEEVE, REPAIR, 48" (50.80-51.40), CI 48 1 each $936.74 $936.74 $2,305.52 $2,305.52 $927.25 $927.25 $2,941.77 $2,941.77 $945.00 $945.00

SLEEVE, REPAIR, 54" (57.70) 54 1 each $999.18 $999.18 $2,337.11 $2,337.11 $977.99 $977.99 - No Bid $1,015.00 $1,015.00

SLEEVE, TELESCOPIC, 16" (17.40-19.00) 16 5 each $341.79 $1,708.95 $560.62 $2,803.10 $334.54 $1,672.70 - No Bid $360.00 $1,800.00

SLEEVE, TELESCOPIC, 18" (19.50-20.10) 18 5 each $239.07 $1,195.35 $373.25 $1,866.25 $414.75 $2,073.75 - No Bid $440.00 $2,200.00

SLEEVE, TELESCOPIC, 20" (21.60-22.25) 20 1 each $424.07 $424.07 $447.38 $447.38 $429.45 $429.45 - No Bid $445.00 $445.00

SLEEVE, TELESCOPIC, 24" (25.80-26.50) 24 1 each $523.00 $523.00 $760.44 $760.44 $518.35 $518.35 - No Bid $535.00 $535.00

SLEEVE, TELESCOPIC, 30" (32.00-32.50) 30 1 each $597.00 $597.00 $944.00 $944.00 $591.14 $591.14 - No Bid $610.00 $610.00

SLEEVE, TELESCOPIC, 36" (38.30-38.90) 36 1 each $710.00 $710.00  $704.00 $704.00 - No Bid $728.00 $728.00

Total  $8,372.61 $70,286.66 $13,769.24 $94,765.76 $8,491.76 $71,019.38 $10,259.77 $78,501.67 $8,761.00 $74,388.00

 

$355,092.35 $387,333.01 $389,781.73 $121,072.32 $358,718.00

Ferguson Morrison Supply Municipal Water Works Supply Powerseal Pipeline Products Texas Water Products


