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1 60# White Offset 8.5 X 11 100 $7.10 $710.00 $0.00 $8.80 $880.00 $0.00 12.93 $1,293.00 $0.00
2 60# White Offset 8.5 X 14 78 $10.82 $843.96 $0.00 $11.76 $917.28 $0.00 17.17 $1,339.26 $0.00
3 60# White Offset 11 X 17 20 $15.25 $305.00 $0.00 $19.00 $380.00 $0.00 41.45 $829.00 $0.00
4 70# White Offset 8.5 X 11 52 $9.30 $483.60 $0.00 $10.75 $559.00 $0.00 16.53 $859.56 $0.00
5 70# White Offset 8.5 X 14 6 $12.95 $77.70 $0.00 $14.73 $88.38 $0.00 35.6 $213.60 $0.00
6 70# White Offset 11 X 17 25 $19.85 $496.25 $0.00 $22.50 $562.50 $0.00 45.52 $1,138.00 $0.00
7 70# Color Offset 8.5 X 11 10 $10.65 $106.50 $0.00 $0.00 $13.42 $134.20 NO BID $0.00
8 70# Color Offset 8.5 X 14 30 $15.30 $459.00 $0.00 $0.00 $19.44 $583.20 NO BID $0.00
9 70# Color Offset 11 X 17 10 $22.50 $225.00 $0.00 $0.00 $27.84 $278.40 NO BID $0.00
10 70# Glossy Text 8.5 X 11 10 $0.00 $8.25 $82.50 $0.00 $22.00 $220.00 NO BID $0.00
11 70# Glossy Text 8.5 X 14 10 $0.00 $11.00 $110.00 $0.00 $45.50 $455.00 NO BID $0.00
12 70# Glossy Text 11 X 17 10 $0.00 $16.48 $164.80 $0.00 $47.00 $470.00 NO BID $0.00
13 100# Glossy Text 8.5 X 11 10 $0.00 $13.81 $138.10 $0.00 $23.26 $232.60 NO BID $0.00
14 100# Glossy Text 8.5 X 14 10 $0.00 $15.60 $156.00 $0.00 $46.00 $460.00 NO BID $0.00
15 100# Glossy Text 11 X 17 10 $0.00 $27.60 $276.00 $0.00 $47.68 $476.80 NO BID $0.00
16 80# Glossy Cover 8.5 X 11 10 $0.00 $21.52 $215.20 $0.00 $34.00 $340.00 NO BID $0.00
17 100# Glossy Cover 11 X 17 10 $0.00 $53.42 $534.20 $0.00 $86.32 $863.20 NO BID $0.00
18 100# Glossy Cover 8.5 X 11 10 $0.00 $26.72 $267.20 $0.00 $41.65 $416.50 NO BID $0.00
19 80# Glossy Cover 11 X 17 10 $0.00 $43.04 $430.40 $0.00 $68.50 $685.00 NO BID $0.00
20 20# White Bond (Rag Content/Watermark) 8.5 X 11 300 $0.00 $23.00 $6,900.00 $0.00 $19.50 $5,850.00 26.5 $7,950.00 $0.00
21 20/50# Color Bond 8.5 X 11 2,010 $0.00 $7.48 $15,034.80 $0.00 $9.00 $18,090.00 14.16 $28,461.60 $0.00
22 20/50# Color Bond 8.5 X 14 55 $0.00 $10.10 $555.50 $0.00 $16.95 $932.25 20.27 $1,114.85 $0.00
23 20/50# Color Bond 11 X 17 20 $0.00 $15.87 $317.40 $0.00 $19.10 $382.00 38.08 $761.60 $0.00
24 110# Color Index 8.5 X 11 80 $22.80 $1,824.00 $0.00 $0.00 $27.00 $2,160.00 NO BID $0.00
25 110# Color Index 11 X 17 2 $50.60 $101.20 $0.00 $0.00 $54.00 $108.00 NO BID $0.00
26 110# White Index 8.5 X 11 35 $21.60 $756.00 $0.00 $0.00 $26.30 $920.50 NO BID $0.00
27 110# White Index 9 X 11 15 $24.15 $362.25 $0.00 $0.00 $28.00 $420.00 NO BID $0.00
28 110# White Index 20.5 X 24.75 4 $166.85 $667.40 $0.00 $0.00 $320.00 $1,280.00 NO BID $0.00
29 110# Bright White Index 11 X 17 15 $45.60 $684.00 $0.00 $0.00 $54.00 $810.00 NO BID $0.00
30 20# White Xerographic Bond 8.5 X 11 23,100 $0.00 $6.00 $138,600.00 $6.00 $138,600.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
31 20# White Xerographic Bond (3-Hole Punched) 8.5 X 11 4,500 $0.00 $6.60 $29,700.00 $8.27 $37,215.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
32 20# White Xerographic Bond 8.5 X 14 400 $0.00 $8.34 $3,336.00 $10.84 $4,336.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
33 20# White Xerographic Bond 11 X 17 130 $0.00 $13.11 $1,704.30 $16.30 $2,119.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
34 17-20# CB White Rev. Carbonless 8.5 X 11 55 $14.25 $783.75 $0.00 $15.00 $825.00 $0.00 21.58 $1,186.90 $0.00
35 17-20# CB Color Carbonless 8.5 X 11 15 $14.43 $216.45 $0.00 $17.00 $255.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
36 17-20# CFB White Rev. Carbonless 8.5 X 11 15 $17.26 $258.90 $0.00 $18.30 $274.50 $0.00 32.69 $490.35 $0.00
37 17-20# CFB Color Rev. Carbonless 8.5 X 11 30 $17.45 $523.50 $0.00 $18.40 $552.00 $0.00 33.87 $1,016.10 $0.00
38 17-20# CF White Rev. Carbonless 8.5 X 11 7 $10.21 $71.47 $0.00 $12.00 $84.00 $0.00 25.64 $179.48 $0.00
39 17-20# CF Color Rev. Carbonless 8.5 X 11 55 $11.24 $618.20 $0.00 $12.10 $665.50 $0.00 19.54 $1,074.70 $0.00
40 17-20# 2-Part Rev. Coll. Carbonless 8.5 X 11 510 $12.77 $6,512.70 $0.00 $12.85 $6,553.50 $0.00 41.2 $21,012.00 $0.00
41 17-20# 2-Part Rev. Coll. Carbonless 8.5 X 14 15 $16.24 $243.60 $0.00 $16.45 $246.75 $0.00 78.97 $1,184.55 $0.00
42 17-20# 3-Part Rv/Fw Coll. Carbonless 8.5 X 11 170 $14.38 $2,444.60 $0.00 $14.35 $2,439.50 $0.00 67.9 $11,543.00 $0.00
43 17-20# 3-Part Rv/Fw Coll. Carbonless 8.5 X 14 15 $18.30 $274.50 $0.00 $18.55 $278.25 $0.00 110.47 $1,657.05 $0.00
44 17-20# 4-Part Rev. Coll. Carbonless 8.5 X 11 55 $15.40 $847.00 $0.00 $15.30 $841.50 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
45 17-20# 4-Part Rev. Coll. Carbonless 8.5 X 14 15 $19.56 $293.40 $0.00 $20.00 $300.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
46 17-20# 3-Part Rev. Coll. Carbonless 8.5 X 11 15 $14.38 $215.70 $0.00 $14.35 $215.25 $0.00 95.5 $1,432.50 $0.00
47 17-20# 3-Part Rev. Coll. Carbonless 8.5 X 14 15 $18.30 $274.50 $0.00 $18.55 $278.25 $0.00 110.41 $1,656.15 $0.00
48 17-20# 2-Part Coll. Carbonless/Copiers 8.5 X 11 7 $12.77 $89.39 $0.00 $49.00 $343.00 $0.00 102.86 $720.02 $0.00
49 17-20# 2-Part Coll. Carbonless/Copiers 8.5 X 14 15 $16.24 $243.60 $0.00 $62.00 $930.00 $0.00 121.25 $1,818.75 $0.00
50 17-20# 3-Part Coll. Carrbonless/Copiers 8.5 X 11 7 $14.38 $100.66 $0.00 $50.30 $352.10 $0.00 164.82 $1,153.74 $0.00
51 17-20# 3-Part Coll. Carrbonless/Copiers 8.5 X 14 15 $18.30 $274.50 $0.00 $64.00 $960.00 $0.00 193.78 $2,906.70 $0.00
52 17-20# 4-Part Coll. Carrbonless/Copiers 8.5 X 11 7 $15.40 $107.80 $0.00 $53.80 $376.60 $0.00 266.56 $1,865.92 $0.00
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53 17-20# 4-Part Coll. Carrbonless/Copiers 8.5 X 14 15 $19.56 $293.40 $0.00 $67.50 $1,012.50 $0.00 304.7 $4,570.50 $0.00
54 60# White Self-Adhesive (Removable Back) 8.5 X 11 20 $89.10 $1,782.00 $0.00 $128.00 $2,560.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
55 60# Fluorescent Colors Self-Adhesive (Removable 8.5 X 11 20 $142.42 $2,848.40 $0.00 $320.00 $6,400.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
56 67# White Vellum Bristol 8.5 X 11 40 $15.95 $638.00 $0.00 $0.00 $19.84 $793.60 33 $1,320.00 $0.00
57 67# Color Vellum Bristol 8.5 X 11 35 $16.84 $589.40 $0.00 $0.00 $20.92 $732.20 NO BID $0.00
58 80# Bright White Cover 8.5 X 11 25 $22.50 $562.50 $0.00 $0.00 $24.98 $624.50 NO BID $0.00
59 60# White Parchment 8.5 X 11 5 $0.00 $23.15 $115.75 $0.00 $23.75 $118.75 NO BID $0.00
60 60# White Parchment 11 X 17 5 $0.00 $46.25 $231.25 $0.00 $68.00 $340.00 NO BID $0.00
61 60# Color Parchment 8.5 X 11 5 $0.00 $23.41 $117.05 $0.00 $23.75 $118.75 NO BID $0.00
62 60# Color Parchment 11 X 17 5 $0.00 $46.60 $233.00 $0.00 $68.00 $340.00 NO BID $0.00
63 65# White Parchment Cover 8.5 X 11 5 $0.00 $47.00 $235.00 $0.00 $49.24 $246.20 NO BID $0.00
64 65# White Parchment Cover 11 X 17 5 $0.00 $92.35 $461.75 $0.00 $122.00 $610.00 NO BID $0.00
65 65# Color Parchment Cover 8.5 X 11 5 $0.00 $47.86 $239.30 $0.00 $49.24 $246.20 NO BID $0.00
66 65# Color Parchment Cover 11 X 17 5 $0.00 $95.15 $475.75 $0.00 $122.00 $610.00 NO BID $0.00
67 60# Vellum Text, Brights 8.5 X 11 35 $12.75 $446.25 $0.00 $0.00 $15.00 $525.00 NO BID $0.00
68 60# Vellum Text, Brights 11 X 17 5 $26.60 $133.00 $0.00 $0.00 $30.00 $150.00 NO BID $0.00
69 65# Vellum Brights Cover 8.5 X 11 8 $25.80 $206.40 $0.00 $0.00 $31.00 $248.00 NO BID $0.00
70 70# White Fiber/wood Text 8.5 X 11 35 $0.00 $29.97 $1,048.95 $0.00 $30.45 $1,065.75 NO BID $0.00
71 70# Color Fiber/Wood Text 11 X 17 50 $0.00 $64.89 $3,244.50 $0.00 $61.00 $3,050.00 NO BID $0.00
72 24# Laser White Bond 8.5 X 11 2,500 $7.10 $17,750.00 $0.00 $13.40 $33,500.00 $0.00 12.4 $31,000.00 $0.00
73 24# Laser White Bond 8.5 X 14 25 $10.82 $270.50 $0.00 $16.14 $403.50 $0.00 25.68 $642.00 $0.00
74 24# Laser White Bond 11 X 17 15 $15.25 $228.75 $0.00 $26.94 $404.10 $0.00 37.68 $565.20 $0.00
75 24# White Envelopes, Plain No. 10 500 $0.00 $14.50 $7,250.00 $17.50 $8,750.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
76 24# White Envelopes, Window No. 10 35 $0.00 $17.15 $600.25 $19.95 $698.25 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
77 24# Color Envelopes, Plain No. 10 35 $22.05 $771.75 $0.00 $28.50 $997.50 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
78 24# Color Envelopes, Windows No. 10 35 $24.96 $873.60 $0.00 $32.50 $1,137.50 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
79 24# White Envelopes, Plain No. 9 35 $0.00 $14.50 $507.50 $17.00 $595.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
80 24# White Envelopes, Window No. 9 35 $0.00 $17.15 $600.25 $22.65 $792.75 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
81 24# Color Envelopes, Plain No. 9 35 $22.05 $771.75 $0.00 $28.50 $997.50 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
82 24# Color Envelopes, Windows No. 9 35 $24.96 $873.71 $0.00 $40.00 $1,400.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
83 Netone Ivory Envelopes 6-Bar 15 $37.70 $565.50 $0.00 $43.85 $657.75 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
84 Netone Ivory Panel Folders 6-Bar 5 $46.50 $232.50 $0.00 $60.00 $300.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
85 A7 White envelopes A7 2 $42.45 $84.90 $0.00 $40.00 $80.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
86 A7 White Invitations A7 2 $48.15 $96.30 $0.00 $66.00 $132.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
87 Lee Polar White Envelopes Lee 2 $47.00 $94.00 $0.00 $55.20 $110.40 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
88 Lee Polar White Invitations Lee 2 $48.15 $96.30 $0.00 $53.50 $107.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

89 67/65# Pre Die Cut Door Hangers (2 Up/3Up, Soft 
And Bright Colors 8.5 X 11 40 $35.00 $1,400.00 $0.00 $170.00 $6,800.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

90 Manila Tag 7.5 Pt. CF 8.5 X 11 10 $33.20 $332.00 $0.00 $36.20 $362.00 $0.00 48.6 $486.00 $0.00
91 Fan-Apart Adhesive Quarts 25 $27.50 $687.50 $0.00 $24.00 $600.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
92 Padding Compound Quarts 20 $6.60 $132.00 $0.00 $9.00 $180.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
93 Kromekote Plus 10 Pt. 8.5 X 11 10 $52.10 $521.00 $0.00 $57.35 $573.50 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
94 Chipboard .022 8.5 X 11 10 $27.00 $270.00 $0.00 $34.00 $340.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
95 Chipboard .022 17.5X22.5 10 $26.00 $260.00 $0.00 $39.00 $390.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
96 70# Opaque Laser Smooth White 8.5 X 11 15 $10.50 $157.50 $0.00 $18.00 $270.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00
97 65# Opaque Laser Smooth White 8.5 X 11 25 $18.30 $457.50 $0.00 $20.30 $507.50 $0.00 NO BID $0.00

$56,922.49 $213,882.70 $273,486.61 $46,386.60 $133,442.08
$270,805.19 $319,873.21 $133,442.08Total Virgin and Recycled Prices
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