BID TABULATION FOR GRASS SEED AND SOD

\ [
Buyer: Cristina Camarillo BID NO. Z‘L2-0213 BID OPENING‘DATE: 09/13/2012
NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION North Texas Hypromulching and Services LLC King Ranch Turfgrass Justin Seed Company John Deere Landscapes
Haslet, Texas 76052 Benbrook, Texas 76126 Justin, Texas 76247 Cleveland, Ohio 44114
Unit of
Iltem # Quantity| Issue | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
2 |Common Bermuda Sod 8000 SQYD $1.55 $12,400.00 $1.89 $15,120.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
3 |Common Bermuda Sod, Installation A 9000 SQYD $2.23 $20,070.00 $2.54 $22,860.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
4 |Common Bermuda Sod, Installation B 50000 | SQYD $2.85 | $142,500.00 $2.74 $137,000.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
6 |St. Augustine Sod 8200 SQYD $2.78 $22,796.00 $2.69 $22,058.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
7 |St. Augustine Sod, Installation A 10000 | SQYD $3.40 $34,000.00 $3.54 $35,400.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
8 |St. Augustine Sod, Installation B 12000 | SQYD $4.02 $48,240.00 $3.74 $44,880.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
10 |Tiff 419 Bermuda (Tifway 419) Sod 1000 SQYD $1.55 $1,550.00 $1.89 $1,890.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
11 |Tiff 419 Bermuda (Tifway 419) Sod, Installation A 1000 SQYD $2.23 $2,230.00 $2.54 $2,540.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
12 |Tiff 419 Bermuda (Tifway 419) Sod, Installation B 1000 SQYD $2.85 $2,850.00 $2.74 $2,740.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
14 |Zoysia Sod 250 SQYD $4.10 $1,025.00 $3.98 $995.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
15 |Zoysia Sod, Installation A 56 SQYD $4.85 $271.60 $4.63 $259.28 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
16 |Zoysia Sod, Installation B 56 SQYD $4.85 $271.60 $4.83 $270.48 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
18 |Buffalo Grass 609 Sod 56 SQYD $3.95 $221.20 $3.10 $173.60 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
19 |Buffalo Grass 609 Sod, Installation A 10 SQYD $4.85 $48.50 $4.10 $41.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
20 |Buffalo Grass 609 Sod, Installation B 10 SQYD $4.85 $48.50 $4.30 $43.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
22 |BAGGED PRODUCTS: Common Bermuda Seed, 50# Bag 10 BAG $265.00 $2,650.00 $268.00 $2,680.00 $272.38 $2,723.80 No Bid $0.00
23 |Princess 77 Bermuda Seed, 25# Bag 5 BAG $545.00 $2,725.00 $575.00 $2,875.00 $523.25 $2,616.25 No Bid $0.00
24 |Winter Rye (Annual) Seed, 50# Bag 10 BAG $32.50 $325.00 $32.50 $325.00 $28.40 $284.00 $25.50 $255.00
25 |K-31 Fescue Seed, 50# Bag 10 BAG $60.00 $600.00 $68.95 $689.50 $61.60 $616.00 $55.00 $550.00
26 |Perennial Rye Seed, 50# Bag 20 BAG $70.00 $1,400.00 $61.25 $1,225.00 $71.70 $1,434.00 $50.50 $1,010.00
27 |TLC Tall Fescue Seed, 50# Bag 20 BAG $48.00 $960.00 $69.50 $1,390.00 $97.84 $1,956.80 $49.50 $990.00
28 |Rebel Fescue Seed - Certified, 50# Bag 10 BAG $48.00 $480.00 $119.00 $1,190.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
29 |Delivery charge for bagged products and sod 10 EACH $45.00 $450.00 $60.00 $600.00 $25.00 $250.00 No Bid $0.00
30 |Hydro-Mulching Services 90000 | SQYD $0.49 $44,100.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
31 |Minimum charge for work orders under 10 sq yd. 1000 EACH $35.00 $35,000.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
33 |Buffalo Grass Seed, 50# Bag 250 BAG $600.00 | $150,000.00 $820.20 $205,050.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
34 |Asian Jasmine 7000 SQFT $1.25 $8,750.00 $4.00 $28,000.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
35 |Mondo (Monkey) Grass 7000 SQFT $1.25 $8,750.00 $4.00 $28,000.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
36 |Additional sod watering 1000 SQFT $0.20 $200.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Estimated total: $544,912.40 $558,294.86 $9,880.85 $2,805.00
State the minimum order amount required to place a delivered order: $100.00 minimum order None 5 Bags None
All other grasfs seed and sod, services and supplies will be purchased 0%
at____ % discount. 5% 3% 0%
\ \ \ \ \

All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract information is posted.
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