BID TABULATION FOR VILLAGE CREEK WATER PLANT, PARKS AND CENTRAL DISTRICT GROUNDS MAINTENANCE

BID NO. 12-0075

BID OPENING DATE: 3-1-12

Buyer: Cristina Camarillo

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION HX4 Maintenance Liberty Proclaimed Ministry TruGreen Landcare Lawn Patrol Services, Inc Somerset Landscape
Krum, TX ‘76249 Arlington, TX 76003 Fort Worth, TX 76111 Fort Worth, TX 76163 Irving, TX 75220
Unit of
Iltem # Quantity| Issue | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total| | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 |10.1 Central District 1 YR No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $191,460.00 $191,460.00]| | $69,550.00 $69,550.00 $78,574.80 $78,574.80
2 |10.2 East District Parks 1 YR No Bid $0.00| | $156,150.00| $156,150.00 No Bid $86,600.00 $86,600.00 $96,456.60 $96,456.60
3 ]10.3 North and South District Parks 1 YR No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $42,000.00 $42,000.00 $67,071.53 $67,071.53
10.4 Village Creek Wastewater
4 |Treatment Plant 1 YR $86,100.00 $86,100.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Annual Estimated Cost: $86,100.00 $156,150.00 $191,460.00 $198,150.00 $242,102.93
Texas Lawn & Landscape
NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Whitmore & Sons, Inc Services Scott Landscape Maintenance
Bedford, T‘X 76095 Sugarland, TX 77479 Fort Worth, TX 76110
Unit of
Iltem # Quantity| Issue | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 |10.1 Central District 1 YR | $87,060.00 $87,060.00 $81,123.00 $81,123.00 $118,160.00 $118,160.00
2 |10.2 East District Parks 1 YR | $94,600.00 $94,600.00| | $103,714.00| $103,714.00 $94,940.00 $94,940.00
3 ]10.3 North and South District Parks 1 YR | $62,400.00 $62,400.00 $68,502.50 $68,502.50 $81,150.00 $81,150.00
10.4 Village Creek Wastewater
Treatment Plant 1 YR No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00
Annual Estimated Cost: $244,060.00 $253,339.50 $294,250.00

All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only‘and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract infor
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mation is posted.




