
BID TABULATION FOR IRRIGATION EQUIPMENT PARTS AND REPAIR SERVICES

 BID NO. 12-0068  BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 16, 2012

Buyer: E.J. Harbin

NAME OF BIDDERS & LOCATION Metro Irrigation Supply Co.  Longhorn, Inc. Professional Turf Products, LP
Fort Worth, TX 76107  Fort Worth, TX 76119 Euless, TX 76039

LABOR RATES - REPAIR SERVICES
 Quantity Unit Unit Price Total  Quantity Unit Unit Price/Month Total  Quantity Unit Unit Price/Month Total

1. TORO IRRIGATION CONTROLLER(S) REPAIR LABOR RATE - Vendor's 
business location. 500 HR $50.00 $25,000.00 500 HR No Bid No Bid 500 HR $65.00 $32,500.00

2. TORO IRRIGATION CONTROLLER(S) REPAIR LABOR RATE -
Performed at multiple City locations. 500 HR $100.00 $50,000.00 500 HR No Bid No Bid 500 HR $80.00 $40,000.00

3. TORO IRRIGATION CONTROLLER(S) REPAIR OVERTIME LABOR RATE - 
Vendor's business location. 200 HR $50.00 $10,000.00 200 HR No Bid No Bid 200 HR $90.00 $18,000.00

4. TORO IRRIGATION CONTROLLER(S) REPAIR OVERTIME LABOR RATE - 
Performed at multiple City locations. 200 HR $100.00 $20,000.00 200 HR No Bid No Bid 200 HR $105.00 $21,000.00

Sub-total - Toro Repair Labor Rates $105,000.00 $0.00 $111,500.00

5. HUNTER IRRIGATION CONTROLLER(S) REPAIR LABOR RATE - Vendor's 
business location. 500 HR $50.00 $25,000.00 500 HR No Bid No Bid 500 HR No Bid No Bid

6. HUNTER IRRIGATION CONTROLLER(S) REPAIR LABOR RATE - Performed 
at multiple City locations. 500 HR $100.00 $50,000.00 500 HR No Bid No Bid 500 HR No Bid No Bid

7. HUNTER IRRIGATION CONTROLLER(S) REPAIR OVERTIME LABOR RATE -
Vendor's business location. 200 HR $50.00 $10,000.00 200 HR No Bid No Bid 200 HR No Bid No Bid

8. HUNTER IRRIGATION CONTROLLER(S) REPAIR OVERTIME LABOR RATE -
Performed at multiple City locations. 200 HR $100.00 $20,000.00 200 HR No Bid No Bid 200 HR No Bid No Bid

Sub-total - Hunter Repair Labor Rates $105,000.00 $0.00 $0.00

9. RAINBIRD IRRIGATION CONTROLLER(S) REPAIR LABOR RATE - Vendor's 
business location. 500 HR $50.00 $25,000.00 500 HR No Bid No Bid 500 HR No Bid No Bid

10. RAINBIRD IRRIGATION CONTROLLER(S) REPAIR LABOR RATE - 
Performed at multiple City locations. 500 HR $100.00 $50,000.00 500 HR No Bid No Bid 500 HR No Bid No Bid

11. RAINBIRD IRRIGATION CONTROLLER(S) REPAIR OVERTIME LABOR 
RATE - Vendor's business location. 200 HR $50.00 $10,000.00 200 HR No Bid No Bid 200 HR No Bid No Bid

12. RAINBIRD IRRIGATION CONTROLLER(S) REPAIR OVERTIME LABOR 
RATE - Performed at multiple City locations. 200 HR $100.00 $20,000.00 200 HR No Bid No Bid 200 HR No Bid No Bid

Sub-total Rainbird Repair Labor Rates $105,000.00 $0.00 $0.00

Estimated Total $315,000.00 $0.00                  Partial Bid - Toro Products Only $111,500.00

PARTS AND SUPPLIES DISCOUNT
 Percent Discount  Percent Discount  Percent Discount

13. TORO LARGE TURF EQUIPMENT - 2012 YEAR CATALOG WHOLE 54% Off 45% Off 20% Off
GOODS - State percent discount off Manufacturer's List Price

14. TORO LARGE TURF EQUIPMENT - 2012 YEAR CATALOG PARTS - 54% Off 40% Off 10% Off
State percent discount off Manufacturer's List Price

15. TORO SMALL/MEDIUM TURF EQUIPMENT - 2012 YEAR CATALOG 54% Off 45% Off 20% Off
WHOLE GOODS - State percent discount off Manufacturer's List Price

16. TORO SMALL/MEDIUM TURF EQUIPMENT - 2012 YEAR CATALOG 54% Off 40% Off 10% Off
PARTS - State percent discount off Manufacturer's List Price

17. HUNTER LARGE TURF EQUIPMENT - 2012 YEAR CATALOG WHOLE 57% Off 50% Off No Bid
GOODS - State percent discount off Manufacturer's List Price

18. HUNTER LARGE TURF EQUIPMENT - 2012 YEAR CATALOG PARTS - 55% Off 45% Off No Bid
State percent discount off Manufacturer's List Price

19. HUNTER SMALL/MEDIUM TURF EQUIPMENT - 2012 YEAR CATALOG 57% Off 50% Off No Bid
WHOLE GOODS - State percent discount off Manufacturer's List Price

20. HUNTER SMALL/MEDIUM TURF EQUIPMENT - 2012 YEAR CATALOG 55% Off 45% Off No Bid
PARTS - State percent discount off Manufacturer's List Price

21. RAINBIRD LARGE TURF EQUIPMENT - 2012 YEAR CATALOG WHOLE 52% Off 45% Off No Bid
GOODS - State percent discount off Manufacturer's List Price

22. RAINBIRD LARGE TURF EQUIPMENT - 2012 YEAR CATALOG PARTS - 43% Off 45% Off No Bid
State percent discount off Manufacturer's List Price

23. RAINBIRD SMALL/MEDIUM TURF EQUIPMENT - 2012 YEAR CATALOG 53.5% Off 45% Off No Bid
WHOLE GOODS - State percent discount off Manufacturer's List Price

24. RAINBIRD SMALL/MEDIUM TURF EQUIPMENT - 2012 YEAR CATALOG 60% Off 45% Off No Bid
PARTS - State percent discount off Manufacturer's List Price
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