BID TABULATION FOR LABORATORY ANALYTICAL SERVICES

BID: 12-0071 BID OPENING DATE: 2/16/2012

Buyer: Cristina Camarillo
NAME OF BIDDER & TestAmerica Technical Testing
LOCATION Laboratories, International Pace Analytical TraceAnalysis, Inc. Accutest Laboratories Ana-Lab Corp
Corpus Christi, Texas Arlington, Texas Allen, Texas Lubbock, Texas Houston, Texas Kilgore, Texas
\ \
Unit of

Item

# |Description Quantity| Issue | Unit Price Total| |Unit Price Total| |Unit Price Total| |Unit Price Total | |Unit Price Total| |Unit Price| Total
Volatile Compounds (EPA 524.2 or .

3 |t couhenn 50 EA $65.00 $3,250.00/ |No Bid $0.00|| $100.00] $5,000.00|| $75.00 $3,750.00|| $115.00|  $5.750.00|| $125.00] $6,250.00
Semi-Volatile Compounds (EPA .

4 |oon o 50 EA | $180.00 $9,000.00/ |No Bid $0.00|| $200.00 $10,000.00|| $185.00 $9,250.00|| $295.00| $14,750.00|| $250.00] $12,500.00
Total Organic Carbon and/or .

5 | Doy O Copor (5 50 EA $20.00 $1,000.00/ |No Bid $0.00{| $20.00] $1,000.00|| $35.00 $1,750.00|| $20.00|  $1,000.00|| $73.00] $3.650.00
UV-254 (SM 5910B

6 ( ) 50 EA $25.00 $1,250.00| | $50.00| $2,500.00|| $15.00 $750.00| |  $66.50 $3,325.00|| $25.00]  $1.250.00|| $53.00] $2,650.00
Fecal Coliform (SM 9222D) )

7 200 | EA [NoBid $0.00| | $40.00] $8,000.00|| $45.00] $9,000.00| |Included $0.00|| $30.00|  $6,000.00|| $45.00| $9,000.00
Total Coliform (SM 9223B or method i

8 |eouvaent 200 | EA |NoBid $0.00| | $40.00] $8,000.00|| $45.00] $9,000.00|| $30.00 $6,000.00|| $20.00]  $4,000.00|| $25.00] $5,000.00
Heterotrophic Plate Count (SM 9215B) .

9 200 | EA |NoBid $0.00| | $40.00] $8,000.00|| $45.00] $9,000.00|| $40.00 $8,000.00|| $30.00]  $6,000.00|| $55.00] $11,000.00
Total Metals (EPA 200.8

T ) 50 | EA $73.00]  $3,650.00| |No Bid $0.00|| $12.00 $600.00 $8.00 $400.00|| $105.00]  $5250.00|| $232.00] $11,600.00
BOD, Total (SM 5210B

12 otal( ) 250 | EA $25.00 $6,250.00| | $30.00| $7,500.00|| $15.00] $3,750.00|| $30.00 $7,500.00|| $25.00]  $6,250.00|| $20.00] $5,000.00
COD (Hach 8000

13 (Hach 8000) 250 | EA $18.00 $4,500.00| | $20.00| $5,000.00|| $18.00] $4,500.00|| $30.00 $7,500.00|| $25.00]  $6,250.00|| $26.00] $6,500.00
C ide, Total (EPA 335.4

14 |yomde Towl( ) 400 | EA $20.00 $8,000.00| |  $30.00| $12,000.00{| $28.00] $11200.00]| $35.00] $14,000.00|| $35.00] $14,000.00|| $37.00] $14,800.00
Cyanide, Amenable (EPA 9010C or

15 | et et 400 | EA $20.00 $8,000.00 | $30.00| $12,000.00|| $30.00] $12,000.00/| $35.00]  $14,000.00|| $35.00] $14,000.00|| $77.00] $30,800.00
Qil& G , Gravimetric (EPA

16 | ones rease, Gravimetric ( 50 | EA $40.00]  $2,00000| | $40.00] $2,000.00]| $35.00] $1,750.00|| $42.00 $2,100.00|| $45.00]  $2,250.00|| $44.00] $2,200.00
Ph Is, Total (EPA 420.1

17 |Phenes Torl( ) 50 EA $30.00 $1,500.00 | $20.00| $1,000.00]| $35.00] $1,750.00|| $30.00 $1,500.00|| $30.00]  $1,500.00|| $37.00] $1,850.00
Solids, Total Suspended (SM 2540D)

18 50 EA $6.00 $300.00| | $20.00] $1,000.00|| $10.00 $500.00||  $12.00 $600.00||  $12.00 $600.00/| $20.00]  $1,000.00
Total Organic Carbon and/or .

19 | Discotvart Oraamic. Cotbon (SM 50 EA $20.00 $1,000.00| |  No Bid $0.00{| $20.00] $1,000.00|| $30.00 $1,500.00|| $25.00]  $1,250.00|| $73.00] $3,650.00
F | Colif SM 9222D

pq | cotform ( ) 25 EA No Bid $0.00| | $40.00| $1,000.00{| $35.00 $875.00/ | Included $0.00||  $30.00 $750.00|| $45.00]  $1,125.00
Total Coliform (SM 9223B) .

21 25 EA No Bid $0.00| | $40.00] $1,000.00| $35.00 $875.00/|  $30.00 $750.00||  $20.00 $500.00/|  $35.00 $875.00
Total Metals (EPA 200.8

op [T Metais( ) 100 | EA $78.00 $7,800.00] |No Bid $0.00 $8.00 $800.00 $8.00 $800.00|| $105.00] $10,500.00|| $232.00| $23,200.00
Volatile Compounds (EPA 624)

23 50 EA $65.00 $3,250.00| | $60.00| $3,000.00|| $65.00] $3,250.00|| $75.00 $3,750.00|| $65.00]  $3,250.00|| $125.00] $6,250.00
Pesticides/PCBs (EPA 608

oq |PESCIAESIPCBS( ) 50 EA $90.00 $4,500.00| | $125.00| $6,250.00|| $94.50] $4,725.00|| $90.00 $4,500.00|| $85.00]  $4,250.00|| $198.00] $9,900.00
Semi-Volatile Compounds (EPA 625)

25 50 EA | $150.00 $7,500.00| | $125.00| $6,250.00|| $175.00] $8,750.00|| $185.00 $9,250.00|| $135.00]  $6,750.00|| $250.00] $12,500.00
Pesticides, OP (EPA 1657A

P ) 50 EA |  $130.00 $6,500.00| | $175.00] $8,750.00|| $130.00] $6,500.00|| $187.00 $9,350.00|| $135.00]  $6,750.00|| $225.00| $11,250.00
Herbicides (EPA 615, 604, 632, or

27 |ociveionn 50 EA | $130.00 $6,500.00| | $180.00| $9,000.00|| $115.00] $5,750.00|| $198.50 $9,925.00|| $105.00  $5,250.00|| $135.00] $6,750.00
Pharmaceuticals Compounds (EPA X

28 |1e00n 12 EA |  $400.00 $4,800.00] |No Bid $0.00|| $400.00] $4,800.00|| $875.00]  $10,500.00|| $300.00]  $3,600.00|| $250.00] $3,000.00
Total Metals (EPA 200.8

O ) 50 EA $53.00 $2,650.00| |No Bid $0.00||  $12.00 $600.00 $8.00 $400.00|| $105.00]  $5,250.00|| $214.00| $10,700.00
Pesticid EPA 8081A

gy |Teotees ) 20 EA $90.00 $1,800.00| | $75.00| $1,500.00]| $94.50]  $1,890.00|| $90.00 $1,800.00|| $80.00]  $1,600.00|| $117.00] $2,340.00
PCBs (EPA 8082

32 |75 ) 20 EA $55.00 $1,100.00| | $75.00] $1,500.00{| $60.00] $1,200.00|| $50.00 $1,000.00||  $40.00 $800.00||  $99.00|  $1,980.00
Pesticides, OP (EPA 8140

33 |Teoteites OF( ) 20 EA | $130.00 $2,600.00| | $175.00] $3,500.00|| $150.00] $3,000.00|| $147.90 $2,958.00|| $135.00]  $2,700.00|| $225.00] $4,500.00
Volatile Compounds (EPA 8260)

34 20 EA $65.00 $1,300.00 |  $60.00| $1,200.00{| $75.00] $1,500.00/| $75.00 $1,500.00|] $65.00]  $1,300.00|| $125.00] $2,500.00




Semi-Volatile Compounds (EPA 8270)

35 20 EA $150.00 $3,000.00 $125.00 $2,500.00 $180.00 $3,600.00 $185.00 $3,700.00 $135.00 $2,700.00 $268.00 $5,360.00
TCLP Metals (EPA 200.8

36 et ( ) 2 EA $100.00 $200.00| |No Bid $0.00 $110.00 $220.00 $110.00 $220.00 $100.00 $200.00 $195.00 $390.00
TCLP Pesticides (EPA 8081)

37 2 EA $120.00 $240.00 $125.00 $250.00 $120.00 $240.00 $105.00 $210.00 $105.00 $210.00 $126.00 $252.00
TCLP Herbicides (EPA 8151)

38 2 EA $150.00 $300.00 $235.00 $470.00 $150.00 $300.00] |Included $0.00 $115.00 $230.00 $148.00 $296.00
TCLP Volatile Organic Compounds

39 |(Epa 8260) 2 EA $100.00 $200.00 $80.00 $160.00 $150.00 $300.00 $105.00 $210.00 $100.00 $200.00 $201.00 $402.00
TCLP Semi-Volatile Compounds (EPA

40 |go70 2 EA $165.00 $330.00 $145.00 $290.00 $225.00 $450.00 $200.00 $400.00 $150.00 $300.00 $313.00 $626.00
Pharmaceutical Compounds(EPA

41 |go60R) 30 EA $400.00 $12,000.00 $125.00 $3,750.00 $210.00 $6,300.00 $90.00 $2,700.00 $70.00 $2,100.00 $315.00 $9,450.00

Estimated Total: $116,270.00 $117,370.00 $136,725.00 $145,098.00 $149,290.00 $241,096.00

Other Water Analyte Group Testing
Purchased at Vendor's List Price Less

1 % Picrount 20% 20% 10% 30% 20%
Other Wastewater Analyte Group
Testing Purchased at Vendor's List

11 Price | ess 9% Discount 20% 20% 10% 30% 20%
Other Solid Analyte Group Testing
Purchased at Vendor's List Price Less

29 20% 20% 10% 30% 20%

9% Diseotint

All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract information is posted.




