BID TABULATION FOR HYDRATED LIME AND CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE

BID NO. 12-0055

BID OPENING DATE: 1/5/12

Buyer: Cristina Camarillo

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION

Chemrite, Inc

DCC, Inc.

F2 Industries, LLC

Buford, GA 30518

Dallas, TX 75220

Smyrna, TN 37167

Unit of Unit of Unit of
Item # Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Quantity Issue Unit Price Total
1 |Hydrated lime, per attached specifications. 6,738 TON No Bid $0.00 6,738 TON No Bid $0.00 6,738 TON No Bid $0.00
Calcium hypochlorite, 25Ib pail, per attached
2 |specifications. 160 Pail $49.50 $7,920.00 160 Pail $58.80 $9,408.00 160 Pall $60.25 $9,640.00
Annual Estimated Cost: $7,920.00 $9,408.00 $9,640.00
NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION GWTC, Inc Texas Lime Company Lhoist North America of Texas
Dallas, TX 75240 Fort Worth, TX 76107
Unit of Unit of Unit of
Item # Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Quantity Issue Unit Price Total
1 |Hydrated lime, per attached specifications. 6,738 TON No Bid $0.00 6,738 TON $128.65 $866,843.70 6,738 TON $137.09 $923,712.42
Calcium hypochlorite, 25Ib pail, per attached
2 |specifications. 160 Pail $85.50 $13,680.00 160 Pail No Bid $0.00 160 Pail No Bid $0.00
Annual Estimated Cost: $13,680.00 $866,843.70 $923,712.42
NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Stout Enterprises, Inc
Dallas, TX 75212
Unit of
Item # Quantity Issue Unit Price Total
1 |Hydrated lime, per attached specifications. 6,738 TON $282.59 | $1,904,091.42
Calcium hypochlorite, 25Ib pail, per attached
2 |specifications. 160 Pail No Bid $0.00
Annual Estimated Cost: $1,904,091.42

All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract information is posted.




