Page 1 BID TABULATION FOR EROSION BLANKETS AND TURF MATS ‘ ‘
BID NO. 12-0010 BID OPENING ‘DATEZ NOVE‘MBER 17, 201]‘.
Buyer: Lance Wright
NAME OF BIDDERS & LOCATION Hanes Geo Components Excel Garden Products American Exceision Company CDOW Wholesale Argo Innovators
Grapevine, TX 76051 Grand Praire, TX 75051 Arlington, TX 75051 Flower Mound, TX 75022 Arlington, TX 76012
Est. Quantity | Unit Price Total Est. Quantity Unit Price Total Est. Quantity| Unit Price Total Est. Quantity Unit Price Total Est. Quantity Unit Price Total
1. Single Net Straw 288 Rolls $16.00 | $4,608.00 288 Rolls $23.34 $5,368.20 288 Rolls $17.60 $5,068.80 288 Rolls $22.50 $6,480.00 288 Rolls $0.25 $5,736.96
2. Double Net Straw 188 Rolls $20.00 | $3,760.00 188 Rolls $25.57 $3,834.00 188 Rolls $20.00 $3,760.00 188 Rolls $26.10 $4,906.80 188 Rolls $0.30 $4,436.80
3. Green Single Net Excelsior 254 Rolls $30.00 | $7,620.00 254 Rolls $33.89 $9,682.54 254 Rolls $33.64 $8,544.56 254 Rolls $35.00 $8,890.00 254 Rolls $0.59 $13,487.40
4. Green Double Net Excelsior 167 Rolls $34.50 | $5,761.50 167 Rolls $36.67 $6,893.96 167 Rolls $37.69 $6,294.23 167 Rolls $38.50 $6,429.50 167 Rolls $0.85 $12,775.50
5. Extended Long Term Erosion Blankets 16 Rolls $40.00 $768.00 16 Rolls $44.61 $579.93 16 Rolls $41.26 $660.16 16 Rolls $43.40 $694.40 16 Rolls $0.57 $732.16
6. 100% Coconut Blanket 689 Rolls $48.00 | $33,072.00 689 Rolls $54.50 $30,029.50 689 Rolls $58.38 $40,223.82 689 Rolls $56.00 $38,584.00 689 Rolls $0.76 $41,891.20
7. Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats 9090 SQYD $2.10 | $19,089.00 9090 SQYD $1.94 $17,634.60 9090 SQYD $1.76 $15,998.40 9090 SQYD $195.00 $17,550.00 9090 SQYD $2.24 $20,361.60
Moderate Velocity Protection
8. Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats 2666 SQYD $2.35 | $6,265.10 2666 SQYD $1.94 $5,172.04 2666 SQYD $1.97 $5,358.40 2666 SQYD $207.00 $5,589.00 2666 SQYD $2.41 $6,425.06
High Velocity Protection
9. Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats 1280 SQYD $5.65 | $7,232.00 1280 SQYD $2.76 $3,532.80 1280 SQYD $1.97 $2,521.60 1280 SQYD $219.00 $2,847.00 1280 SQYD $2.75 $3,520.00
Extreme Velocity Protection
10. ScourStop Erosion Panel 1632 SQFT $4.30 | $7,017.60 1632 SQFT No Bid $0.00 1632 SQFT $796.91 $3,187.64 1632 SQFT No Bid $0.00 1632 SQFT $4.00 $6,528.00
11. Scour Stop Anchors 816 Each $2.60 | $2,121.60 816 Each No Bid $0.00 816 Each No Bid $0.00 816 Each No Bid $0.00 816 Each $3.06 $2,496.96
12. Blanket Accessories, Sod Staples 8 Gauge 40 Boxes $42.00 | $1,680.00 40 Boxes No Bid $0.00 40 Boxes No Bid $0.00 40 Boxes No Bid $0.00 40 Boxes No Bid $0.00
13. Blanket Accessories, Sod Staples 11 Gauge 15 Boxes $21.00 $315.00 15 Boxes $25.29 $379.35 15 Boxes $46.93 $1,877.20 15 Boxes $42.50 $637.00 15 Boxes $26.85 $402.75
14. Blanket Accessories, Sod Staples 12 Gauge 25 Boxes No bid $0.00 25 Boxes No Bid $0.00 25 Boxes $24.53 $367.95 25 Boxes No Bid $0.00 25 Boxes No Bid $0.00
15. Blanket Accessories, Fabric Pins with 25 Boxes $56.00 | $1,400.00 25 Boxes No Bid $0.00 25 Boxes No Bid $0.00 25 Boxes No Bid $0.00 25 Boxes No Bid $0.00
Washer Attached 8 Inch
16. Blanket Accessories, Fabric Pins with 10 Boxes $35.00 $350.00 10 Boxes No Bid $0.00 10 Boxes No Bid $0.00 10 Boxes No Bid $0.00 10 Boxes No Bid $0.00
Washer Attached 12 Inch
17. Blanket Accessories, Fabric Pins with 5 Boxes $42.00 $210.00 5 Boxes No Bid $0.00 5 Boxes No Bid $0.00 5 Boxes No Bid $0.00 5 Boxes No Bid $0.00
Washer Attached 18 Inch
18. Blanket Accessories, 8 Inch Zip Ties 20 Bags $16.50 $330.00 20 Bags No Bid $0.00 20 Bags No Bid $0.00 20 Bags No Bid $0.00 20 Bags No Bid $0.00
19. Blanket Accessories, Fabric Pins with 5 Boxes $42.00 $210.00 5 Boxes No Bid $0.00 5 Boxes No Bid $0.00 5 Boxes No Bid $0.00 5 Boxes No Bid $0.00
Washer Attached 18 Inch
20. Blanket Accessories, Bermwire 3 Rolls $72.00 $216.00 3 Rolls No Bid $0.00 3 Rolls No Bid $0.00 3 Rolls No Bid $0.00 3 Rolls No Bid $0.00
21. Aspen Fiber Logs, 18 Per Pallet 275 Rolls $23.75 | $6,531.25 275 Rolls $28.08 $7,722.00 275 Rolls $24.86 $6,836.50 275 Rolls $25.50 $7,012.50 275 Rolls $41.70 $11,467.50
22. Aspen Fiber Logs, 36 Per Pallet 175 Rolls $15.75 | $2,756.25 175 Rolls $16.86 $2,950.50 175 Rolls $16.94 $2,964.50 175 Rolls $22.00 $3,850.00 175 Rolls $25.00 $4,375.00
23. Aspen Fiber Logs, 18 Per Pallet 50 Rolls $29.25 | $1,462.50 50 Rolls $33.69 $1,684.50 50 Rolls $33.88 $1,694.20 50 Rolls $35.00 $1,750.00 50 Rolls $25.00 $1,250.00
24. Geo Hay 235 Rolls $48.75 | $11,456.25 235 Rolls $13.20 $3,102.00 235 Rolls $31.17 $7,324.95 235 Rolls $80.00 $18,800.00 235 Rolls $20.00 $4,700.00
Estimated Total $124,232.05 $98,565.92 $109,495.27 $124,020.20 $140,586.89




