
BID TABULATION FOR LIQUID AMMONIUM SULFATE AND SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE 

 BID NO. 11-0355 BID OPENING DATE: 10/27/11  
 

Buyer: Cristina Camarillo

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Petra Chemical Company  DPC Industries, Inc. Thatcher Company
Dallas, TX 75220  Cleburne, TX 76033 Salt Lake City, UT 84127

Unit of Unit of Unit of 
Item #  Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Quantity Issue Unit Price Total

1
Liquid Ammonium Sulfate, per attached 
specifications. 325,000.00 GAL No Bid $0.00 325,000.00 GAL No Bid $0.00 325,000.00 GAL 1.204 $391,300.00

3 Sodium Hypochlorite, per attached specifications. 1,350,000.00 GAL 0.719 $970,650.00 1,350,000.00 GAL 0.6389 $862,515.00 1,350,000.00 GAL No Bid $0.00

Estimated Total: $970,650.00 $862,515.00 $391,300.00

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Altivia Corporation General Chemical
Houston, TX 77002 Parsippany, NJ 07054

Unit of Unit of 
Item #  Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Quantity Issue Unit Price Total

1
Liquid Ammonium Sulfate, per attached 
specifications. 325,000.00 GAL 1.16 $377,000.00 325,000.00 GAL 1.04 $338,000.00

3 Sodium Hypochlorite, per attached specifications. 1,350,000.00 GAL 0.8738 $1,179,630.00 1,350,000.00 GAL No Bid $0.00

Estimated Total: $1,556,630.00 $338,000.00
 
 

 

 All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract information is posted.


