
 
Buyer: Cristina Camarillo

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION General Chemical Performance Products LLC Pencco DPC Industries, Inc Stout Enterprises, Inc.
Parsippany, NJ 07054 San Felipe, TX 77473 Cleburne, TX 76033 Dallas, TX 75212

Unit of Unit of Unit of Unit of 
 Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total

Item #

1
Liquid Ferric Sulfate - 60% Solution, per attached 
specifications. 7878 Ton $113.87 $897,067.86 Ton $93.00 $732,654.00 Ton No Bid $0.00 Ton No Bid $0.00

2 Anhydrous ammonia, per attached specifications. 360 Ton No Bid $0.00 Ton No Bid $0.00 Ton $1,029.00 $370,440.00 Ton $995.45 $358,362.00

3 Polymer, per attached specifications. 345 Ton No Bid $0.00 Ton No Bid $0.00 Ton No Bid $0.00 Ton No Bid $0.00

Total: $897,067.86 $732,654.00 $370,440.00 $358,362.00

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Airgas Specialty Products BASF Corporation Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. Polydyne, Inc
Lawrenceville, GA 30043 Suffolk, VA 23434 Lawrence, KS 66047 Riceboro, GA 31323

Unit of Unit of Unit of Unit of 
 Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total

Item #

1
Liquid Ferric Sulfate - 60% Solution, per attached 
specifications. 7878 Ton No Bid $0.00 Ton No Bid $0.00 Ton $164.69 $1,297,427.82 Ton No Bid $0.00

2 Anhydrous ammonia, per attached specifications. 360 Ton $1,040.00 $374,400.00 Ton No Bid $0.00 Ton No Bid $0.00 Ton No Bid $0.00

3 Polymer, per attached specifications. 345 Ton No Bid $0.00 Ton $1,400.00 $483,000.00 Ton No Bid $0.00 Ton $1,540.00 $531,300.00

Total: $374,400.00 $483,000.00 $1,297,427.82 $531,300.00

All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract information is posted.
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