
 
Buyer: Cristina Camarillo

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Lonestar Ranch & Outdoors CWC Chemical, Inc BWI Companies, Inc Target Specialty Products
Cleburne, TX 76033 Cloverdale, VA 24077 Dallas, TX 75229 Dallas, TX 75220

Unit of Unit of Unit of Unit of 
 Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total

Item #
2 Fire Ant Bait, Packaged in 25 lb bags. 400 LB $9.90 $3,960.00 LB $7.95 $3,180.00 LB $7.9980 $3,199.20 LB $10.29 $4,116.00
3 Barricade, Packaged in five (5) lb bags. 1000 LB $16.30 $16,300.00 LB $14.85 $14,850.00 LB $13.52 $13,520.00 LB $28.00 $28,000.00
4 Image, Packaged in one (1) gallon containers. 9 OZ No Bid $0.00 OZ No Bid $0.00 BTL $75.00 $675.00 OZ No Bid $0.00

5
Blue Spray Pattern Indicator, Packaged in 2.5 gallon 
containers. 500 GAL $30.60 $15,300.00 GAL $36.95 $18,475.00 GAL $26.38 $13,190.00 GAL $37.62 $18,810.00

6
MSAM Herbicide Plus Surfactant, Packaged in 2.5 gallon 
contaniers. 100 GAL $21.40 $2,140.00 GAL $19.90 $1,990.00 GAL $20.94 $2,094.00 GAL No Bid $0.00

7 Primo Maxx, Packaged in one (1) gallon containers. 26 GAL $242.95 $6,316.70 GAL No Bid $0.00 GAL $275.00 $7,150.00 GAL $275.00 $7,150.00

8 Rodeo, Packaged in 2.5 gallon containers. 135 GAL $16.40 $2,214.00 GAL $13.95 $1,883.25 GAL $20.20 $2,727.00 GAL $26.82 $3,620.70

9 Roundup-Pro, Packaged in 2.5 gallon containers. 510 GAL No Bid $0.00 GAL $10.95 $5,584.50 GAL $10.94 $5,579.40 GAL $44.07 $22,475.70
10 Rubigan A.S. Fungicide, Bid price per pound. 32 GAL $350.00 $11,200.00 LB No Bid $0.00 GAL $292.00 $9,344.00 GAL $350.21 $11,206.72

11
Sencor DF 75% (Dry Flowable), Packaged in five (5) lb 
resealable containers. 25 LB $81.30 $2,032.50 LB No Bid $0.00 LB $70.776 $1,769.40 LB $85.02 $2,125.50

12 Orthene Fire Ant Killer, Packaged in 12 oz containers. 456 OZ $0.60 $273.60 OZ No Bid $0.00 OZ $0.673 $306.89 CONT $21.51 $613.04

13
Hyvar X-L Soil Strerilant, (equivalent to 2 lbs bromacil per 
gallon). 50 GAL $92.40 $4,620.00 GAL $74.95 $3,747.50 GAL $80.95 $4,047.50 GAL $96.81 $4,840.50

14 Top Choice Fire Ant Killer, Packaged in 10 lb bags. 300 LB $4.10 $1,230.00 LB No Bid $0.00 LB $3.25 $975.00 LB $3.25 $975.00
15 Merit 5G, Packaged in 30 lb bags. 4560 LB $2.00 $9,120.00 LB $1.95 $8,892.00 LB $1.27 $5,791.20 LB $1.62 $7,387.20

16 Defoamer: Liquid, packaged in 32 oz containers. 64 OZ $0.11 $7.04 OZ $0.30 $19.20 OZ $0.140625 $9.00 OZ $0.35 $22.40

17 Revolver Herbicide. Packaged in one (1) quart containers. 15 QT $267.00 $4,005.00 QT No Bid $0.00 QT $179.95 $2,699.25 QT $255.44 $3,831.60

Total: $78,718.84 $58,621.45 $73,076.84 $115,174.36

All other agricultural pesticides and herbicides not listed 
will be purchased at Manufacturer's List Price Less 
______% Discount.

All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract information is posted.

BID TABULATION FOR AGRICULTURAL PESTICIDES AND HERBICIDES 

BID NO. 11-0268                              BID OPENING DATE: 8/18/2011

5% No discount given No discount givenNo discount given



NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION John Deere Landscapes Winfield Solutions Red River Specialties, Inc
Cleveland, OH 44114 Carrollton, TX 75006 Tyler, TX 75704

Unit of Unit of Unit of 
 Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total

Item #
2 Fire Ant Bait, Packaged in 25 lb bags. 400 LB $14.75 $5,900.00 LB $8.36 $3,344.00 LB $11.00 $4,400.00
3 Barricade, Packaged in five (5) lb bags. 1000 LB $15.57 $15,570.00 LB $13.30 $13,300.00 LB $13.00 $13,000.00
4 Image, Packaged in one (1) gallon containers. 9 BTL $128.78 $1,159.02 BTL $81.00 $729.00 OZ No Bid $0.00

5
Blue Spray Pattern Indicator, Packaged in 2.5 gallon 
containers. 500 GAL $19.46 $9,730.00 GAL $22.25 $11,125.00 GAL $16.25 $8,125.00

6
MSAM Herbicide Plus Surfactant, Packaged in 2.5 gallon 
contaniers. 100 GAL $28.68 $2,868.00 GAL $19.75 $1,975.00 GAL $22.00 $2,200.00

7 Primo Maxx, Packaged in one (1) gallon containers. 26 GAL $275.00 $7,150.00 GAL $275.00 $7,150.00 GAL $175.00 $4,550.00

8 Rodeo, Packaged in 2.5 gallon containers. 135 GAL $23.26 $3,140.10 GAL $12.50 $1,687.50 GAL $13.75 $1,856.25

9 Roundup-Pro, Packaged in 2.5 gallon containers. 510 GAL $16.46 $8,394.60 GAL $10.50 $5,355.00 GAL $15.50 $7,905.00
10 Rubigan A.S. Fungicide, Bid price per pound. 32 GAL $431.00 $13,792.00 GAL $295.00 $9,440.00 LB No Bid $0.00

11
Sencor DF 75% (Dry Flowable), Packaged in five (5) lb 
resealable containers. 25 LB $106.52 $2,663.00 LB $46.46 $1,161.50 LB No Bid $0.00

12 Orthene Fire Ant Killer, Packaged in 12 oz containers. 456 CONT $8.03 $3,661.68 OZ $0.50 $228.00 OZ No Bid $0.00

13
Hyvar X-L Soil Strerilant, (equivalent to 2 lbs bromacil per 
gallon). 50 LB $12.70 $635.00 GAL $76.65 $3,832.50 GAL $77.00 $3,850.00

14 Top Choice Fire Ant Killer, Packaged in 10 lb bags. 300 LB $3.25 $975.00 LB $3.25 $975.00 LB $3.25 $975.00
15 Merit 5G, Packaged in 30 lb bags. 4560 LB $0.99 $4,514.40 LB $0.73 $3,328.80 LB $0.90 $4,104.00

16 Defoamer: Liquid, packaged in 32 oz containers. 64 OZ $0.26 $16.64 OZ $0.45 $28.80 OZ $0.218750 $14.00

17 Revolver Herbicide. Packaged in one (1) quart containers. 15 QT $327.76 $4,916.40 QT $202.00 $3,030.00 QT $235.00 $3,525.00

Total: $85,085.84 $66,690.10 $54,504.25

All other agricultural pesticides and herbicides not listed 
will be purchased at Manufacturer's List Price Less 
______% Discount. No discount given No discount given No discount given

All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract information is posted.


