BID TABULATION FOR LABORATORY SUPPLIES AND CONSUMABLES

\
BID NO. 11-0179

\
BID OPENING DATE: 5/19/11

Buyer: Cristina Camarillo
NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Thomas Scientific Comade Inc. Interboro Packaging Corp Stout Enterprises, Inc.
Swedesboro, NJ 08085 Santa Ana, CA 92705 Montgomery, NY 12549 Dallas, TX 75212
Unit of Unit of Unit of Unit of
Quantity | Issue | Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total| | Issue Unit Price Total| | Issue Unit Price Total
Item #
1  |Acetone; Pesticide Grade (or better) 40 EA $35.00 $1,400.00 EA $75.00 $3,000.00 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $46.17 $1,846.80
2 Hexane; Pesticide Grade (or better) 104 EA $59.00 $6,136.00 EA $120.00 $12,480.00 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $51.21 $5,325.84
3 Nitric Acid; Ultra Pure Trace Metals 14 EA $365.00 $5,110.00 EA $700.00 $9,800.00 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $321.31 $4,498.34
Buffers; Buffer Pac Solutions, pH 4.00, pH 7.00,
4 pH 10.00 30 EA $20.00 $600.00 EA $75.00 $2,250.00 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $33.22 $996.60
Sodium Thiosulfate Solution; Sodium Thiosulfate
5 Pentahydrate Solution 15 EA $10.80 $162.00 EA $15.54 $233.10 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $21.02 $315.30
6 Sodium Hydroxide; Sodium Hydroxide Solution 10 EA $7.50 $75.00 EA $17.99 $179.90 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $7.67 $76.70
Disposable Filters; 0.45um PVDF Filter
7 Membrane 2 Cs $1,649.00 $3,298.00 Cs $3,000.00 $6,000.00 Cs No Bid $0.00 Cs $1,695.66 $3,391.32
8 Disposable Tubes;Falcon Tubes 8 (O] $215.00 $1,720.00 CS $340.00 $2,720.00 CS No Bid $0.00 CS $230.89 $1,847.12
Hydrophobic Membranes; Nonwoven Teflon/Zitex
9 |A100PTF 2 Cs $3,679.99 $7,359.98 Cs $4,800.00 $9,600.00 Cs No Bid $0.00 Cs $3,920.68 $7,841.36
10 |BOD Disposable Bottles 400 CS No Bid $0.00 CS No Bid $0.00 CS No Bid $0.00 CS $98.24 $39,296.00
11  |Disposable Filters; Proweigh Filters (prewieghed) 250 Cs $59.51 $14,877.50 Cs No Bid $0.00 Cs No Bid $0.00 Cs $93.68 $23,420.00
Disposable Pipets; Plastic Standard-Tip
12  |Serological Pipets 60 Ccs $65.80 $3,948.00 CS No Bid $0.00 CS No Bid $0.00 CS $81.14 $4,868.40
GC Inlet Seal Gold Plated Inlet Seal for Agilent
13 |6890/7890 GC 100 EA $36.00 $3,600.00 EA $43.00 $4,300.00 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $924.15 $92,415.00
GC Capillary GC Column; DB-5ms, 0.25mm x
14 |0.50pum x 30m w/Guard Column 4 EA $554.00 $2,216.00 EA $660.00 $2,640.00 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $622.42 $2,489.68
15 |TOX Columns; Pre-packed glass 2 PKT No Bid $0.00 PKT $180.00 $360.00 PKT No Bid $0.00 PKT $162.91 $325.82
Merlin Microseal (GC) ; Merlin Microseal, High
16  |Pressure, for Agilent 6890/7890 GC 6 EA $171.00 $1,026.00 EA $190.00 $1,140.00 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $147.22 $883.32
GC Inlet Liners ; Liner w/o Glass Wool for Agilent
17 |6890/7890 GC 8 PKT $520.00 $4,160.00 PKT $610.00 $4,880.00 PKT No Bid $0.00 PKT $349.83 $2,798.64
BOD Probe ; Self-Stirring BOD Probe for
18 |Dissolved Oxygen Meters 15 EA $523.00 $7,845.00 EA $641.56 $9,623.40 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $555.23 $8,328.45
pH Electrode Glass Body Combination pH
19 |Electrode; WPBNC Connector 10 EA $333.00 $3,330.00 EA $420.97 $4,209.70 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $351.51 $3,515.10
Vacuum Pump; Gast Oil-Less Diaphram-Type
20 |Pump 1 EA $450.00 $450.00 EA $577.16 $577.16 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $303.22 $303.22
21 |Wypalls; Wypalls, X60 6 CS $8,450.00 $50,700.00 Cs $117.72 $706.32 Cs No Bid $0.00 Cs $87.32 $523.92
Disposable Gloves; Powder-Free Nitrile
22 |Examination Gloves 50 Cs $158.00 $7,900.00 CS $316.33 $15,816.60 CS $51.90 $2,595.00 CS $101.71 $5,085.50
Benchtop Multiparameter Meter;
pH/ORP/ISE/Cond/DO Benchtop Multiparameter
23 |Meter 4 EA $2,220.00 $8,880.00 EA $2,809.73 $11,238.92 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $2,310.22 $9,240.88
Total: $134,793.48 $101,755.10 $2,595.00 $219,633.31

Discount given to other representative Laboratory
Reagents and Solvents Purchased at
Manufacturer's List Price

Varies depending on Manufacturer

5%

No discount given

40% Fisher Chemicals Only

Discount given to other representative Laboratory
Consumable & Supply Items Purchased at
Manufacturer's List Price

Varies depending on Manufacturer

5%

No discount given

40% Fisher Catalog Items Only

Discount given to other representative Instrument
Consumables & Supply ltems Purchased at
Manufacturer's List Price

Varies depending on Manufacturer

5%

No discount given

10%

Discount given to other representative
Miscellaneous Laboratory Items Purchased at
Manufacturer's List Price

Varies depending on Manufacturer

5%

No discount given

20%

All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the city until contract information is posted.




\ \
NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Products Unlimited, Inc Fox Scientific Environmental Express A. Daigger & Company
Justin, TX 76247 Alvarado, TX 76009 Charleston, SC 29492 Vernon Hills, IL 60061
Unit of Unit of Unit of Unit of
Quantity | Issue | Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total| | Issue Unit Price Total| | Issue Unit Price Total
Item #
1  |Acetone; Pesticide Grade (or better) 40 EA $35.00 $1,400.00 EA $26.96 $1,078.40 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $41.00 $1,640.00
2 Hexane; Pesticide Grade (or better) 104 EA $95.00 $9,880.00 EA $42.12 $4,380.48 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $93.00 $9,672.00
3 Nitric Acid; Ultra Pure Trace Metals 14 EA $619.00 $8,666.00 EA $307.23 $4,301.22 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $671.00 $9,394.00
Buffers; Buffer Pac Solutions, pH 4.00, pH 7.00,
4 pH 10.00 30 EA $32.50 $975.00 EA $60.00 $1,800.00 EA $57.16 $1,714.80 EA $25.00 $750.00
Sodium Thiosulfate Solution; Sodium Thiosulfate
5 Pentahydrate Solution 15 EA $22.00 $330.00 EA $11.03 $165.45 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $9.50 $142.50
6 Sodium Hydroxide; Sodium Hydroxide Solution 10 EA $14.00 $140.00 EA $5.80 $58.00 EA $26.83 $268.30 EA $7.85 $78.50
Disposable Filters; 0.45um PVDF Filter
7 Membrane 2 CS $1,776.00 $3,552.00 CS $1,695.76 $3,391.52 [&S] $1,693.63 $3,387.26 CS $1,594.00 $3,188.00
8 Disposable Tubes;Falcon Tubes 8 CS $226.00 $1,808.00 Cs $228.93 $1,831.44 Cs $161.45 $1,291.60 Cs $198.45 $1,587.60
Hydrophobic Membranes; Nonwoven Teflon/Zitex
9 |A100PTF 2 CS $3,900.50 $7,801.00 CS $3,534.78 $7,069.56 CS No Bid $0.00 Cs $3,559.00 $7,118.00
10 |BOD Disposable Bottles 400 (o] $80.80 $32,320.00 CS $68.62 $27,448.00 CS $78.63| $31,452.00 CS No Bid $0.00
11  |Disposable Filters; Proweigh Filters (prewieghed) 250 CS $90.60 $22,650.00 CS $61.77 $15,442.50 CS $77.74| $19,435.00 CsS $85.25 $21,312.50
Disposable Pipets; Plastic Standard-Tip
12  |Serological Pipets 60 CS $79.00 $4,740.00 CS $83.39 $5,003.40 CS No Bid $0.00 CS $57.00 $3,420.00
GC Inlet Seal Gold Plated Inlet Seal for Agilent
13 |6890/7890 GC 100 EA $40.33 $4,033.00 EA $32.00 $3,200.00 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $40.45 $4,045.00
GC Capillary GC Column; DB-5ms, 0.25mm x
14 /0.50pm x 30m w/Guard Column 4 EA $720.00 $2,880.00 EA $544.27 $2,177.08 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $674.00 $2,696.00
15 |TOX Columns; Pre-packed glass 2 PKT $275.00 $550.00 PKT $137.23 $274.46 PKT No Bid $0.00 PKT No Bid $0.00
Merlin Microseal (GC) ; Merlin Microseal, High
16 |Pressure, for Agilent 6890/7890 GC 6 EA $229.00 $1,374.00 EA $156.49 $938.94 EA No Bid $0.00 EA $196.00 $1,176.00
GC Inlet Liners ; Liner w/o Glass Wool for Agilent
17 |6890/7890 GC 8 PKT $640.00 $5,120.00 PKT $507.26 $4,058.08 PKT No Bid $0.00 PKT $635.00 $5,080.00
BOD Probe ; Self-Stirring BOD Probe for
18 |Dissolved Oxygen Meters 15 EA $586.00 $8,790.00 EA $482.15 $7,232.25 EA $659.53 $9,892.95 EA $528.00 $7,920.00
pH Electrode Glass Body Combination pH
19 |Electrode; WPBNC Connector 10 EA $361.20 $3,612.00 EA $307.15 $3,071.50 EA $390.56 $3,905.60 EA $317.75 $3,177.50
Vacuum Pump; Gast Oil-Less Diaphram-Type
20 |Pump 1 EA $429.00 $429.00 EA $460.00 $460.00 EA $670.40 $670.40 EA $408.00 $408.00
21 |Wypalls; Wypalls, X60 6 Ccs $85.00 $510.00 CS $87.29 $523.74 CS No Bid $0.00 CS $79.00 $474.00
Disposable Gloves; Powder-Free Nitrile
22  |Examination Gloves 50 CS $61.00 $3,050.00 CS $77.40 $3,870.00 CS $164.21 $8,210.50 CS $48.00 $2,400.00
Benchtop Multiparameter Meter;
pH/ORP/ISE/Cond/DO Benchtop Multiparameter
23 |Meter 4 EA $2,355.00 $9,420.00 EA $2,050.00 $8,200.00 EA $2,548.59| $10,194.36 EA $2,119.95 $8,479.80
Total: $134,030.00 $105,976.02 $90,422.77 $94,159.40

Discount given to other representative Laboratory
Reagents and Solvents Purchased at
Manufacturer's List Price

10%

Varies depending on Manufacturer

No discount given

17%

Discount given to other representative Laboratory
Consumable & Supply Items Purchased at
Manufacturer's List Price

10%

Varies depending on Manufacturer

No discount given

17%

Discount given to other representative Instrument
Consumables & Supply Items Purchased at
Manufacturer's List Price

No discount given

Varies depending on Manufacturer

No discount given

17%

Discount given to other representative
Miscellaneous Laboratory Items Purchased at
Manufacturer's List Price

10%

Varies depending on Manufacturer

No discount given

17%

All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the city until contract information is posted.




\ \
NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Fisher Scientific \ Buy Indian Medical BioExpress Corp.
Pittsburgh, PA 15275 Marietta, GA 30007 Kaysville, UT 84037
Unit of Unit of Unit of
Quantity | Issue | Unit Price Total Issue Unit Price Total| | Issue | Unit Price Total
Item #
1 Acetone; Pesticide Grade (or better) 40 EA $39.37 $1,574.80 EA $41.24 $1,649.60 EA No Bid $0.00
2 Hexane; Pesticide Grade (or better) 104 EA $31.19 $3,243.76 EA $135.72 $14,114.88 EA No Bid $0.00
3 Nitric Acid; Ultra Pure Trace Metals 14 EA $398.41 $5,577.74 EA $279.41 $3,911.74 EA $90.61 $1,268.54
Buffers; Buffer Pac Solutions, pH 4.00, pH 7.00,
4 pH 10.00 30 EA $32.78 $983.40 EA $35.96 $1,078.80 EA $10.51 $315.30
Sodium Thiosulfate Solution; Sodium Thiosulfate
5 Pentahydrate Solution 15 EA $35.53 $532.95 EA $28.21 $423.15 EA No Bid $0.00
6 Sodium Hydroxide; Sodium Hydroxide Solution 10 EA $9.45 $94.50 EA $6.30 $63.00 EA $20.65 $206.50
Disposable Filters; 0.45um PVDF Filter
7 Membrane 2 CS $1,610.88 $3,221.76 Cs $1,863.70 $3,727.40 Cs No Bid $0.00
8 Disposable Tubes;Falcon Tubes 8 CS $220.00 $1,760.00 CS $226.68 $1,813.44 CS $69.26 $554.08
Hydrophobic Membranes; Nonwoven Teflon/Zitex
9 |A100PTF 2 CS $3,724.50 $7,449.00 Cs $3,923.40 $7,846.80 Cs $3,599.00 $7,198.00
10 |BOD Disposable Bottles 400 Ccs $105.00 $42,000.00 CS $180.96 $72,384.00 CS No Bid $0.00
11  |Disposable Filters; Proweigh Filters (prewieghed) 250 Cs $89.00 $22,250.00 Cs $128.14 $32,035.00 Cs No Bid $0.00
Disposable Pipets; Plastic Standard-Tip
12  |Serological Pipets 60 Ccs $71.40 $4,284.00 CS $118.62 $7,117.20 CS $70.24 $4,214.40
GC Inlet Seal Gold Plated Inlet Seal for Agilent
13 |6890/7890 GC 100 EA $33.62 $3,362.00 EA $37.19 $3,719.00 EA No Bid $0.00
GC Capillary GC Column; DB-5ms, 0.25mm x
14 |0.50pm x 30m w/Guard Column 4 EA $568.47 $2,273.88 EA $617.20 $2,468.80 EA No Bid $0.00
15 |TOX Columns; Pre-packed glass PKT $150.98 $301.96 PKT $161.40 $322.80 PKT No Bid $0.00
Merlin Microseal (GC) ; Merlin Microseal, High
16  |Pressure, for Agilent 6890/7890 GC 6 EA $209.68 $1,258.08 EA $221.80 $1,330.80 EA No Bid $0.00
GC Inlet Liners ; Liner w/o Glass Wool for Agilent
17 6890/7890 GC 8 PKT $338.47 $2,707.76 PKT $359.30 $2,874.40 PKT No Bid $0.00
BOD Probe ; Self-Stirring BOD Probe for
18 |Dissolved Oxygen Meters 15 EA $527.47 $7,912.05 EA $559.60 $8,394.00 EA No Bid $0.00
pH Electrode Glass Body Combination pH
19 |Electrode; WPBNC Connector 10 EA $333.93 $3,339.30 EA $348.69 $3,486.90 EA No Bid $0.00
Vacuum Pump; Gast Oil-Less Diaphram-Type
20 |Pump 1 EA $288.06 $288.06 EA $359.60 $359.60 EA No Bid $0.00
21 |Wypalls; Wypalls, X60 6 [ $96.62 $579.72 CS $84.30 $505.80 CS $57.98 $347.88
Disposable Gloves; Powder-Free Nitrile
22 |Examination Gloves 50 Cs $78.60 $3,930.00 CS $69.40 $3,470.00 CS No Bid $0.00
Benchtop Multiparameter Meter;
pH/ORP/ISE/Cond/DO Benchtop Multiparameter
23 |Meter 4 EA $2,194.71 $8,778.84 EA $2,342.80 $9,371.20 EA No Bid $0.00
Total: $127,703.56 $182,468.31 $14,104.70

Discount given to other representative Laboratory
Reagents and Solvents Purchased at
Manufacturer's List Price

35% Excludes Acros and all "NC" catalogue items

15%

No discount given

Discount given to other representative Laboratory
Consumable & Supply Items Purchased at
Manufacturer's List Price

30%

15%

No discount given

Discount given to other representative Instrument
Consumables & Supply Items Purchased at
Manufacturer's List Price

15%

15%

No discount given

Discount given to other representative
Miscellaneous Laboratory Items Purchased at
Manufacturer's List Price

15%

15%

No discount given

All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the city until contract information is posted.




