
Buyer: Cristina Camarillo

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION John Deere Landscapes Justin Seed Company
Cleveland, OH 44114 Justin, Texas 76247

Unit of Unit of 
Item # Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Quantity Issue Unit Price Total

1 Bagged Professional Turf Fertilizer 15-5-10 (50%SCU) 12000 LB $0.289 $3,468.00 12000 LB $0.239 $2,868.00
2 Bagged Sulfur-Coated Urea Turf Fertilizer 38-0-0 (100% SCU) 38000 LB $0.399 $15,162.00 38000 LB $0.471 $17,898.00
3 Bagged 21-3-16 Par-Ex IBDU Greens Turf Fertilizer 86000 LB $0.964 $82,904.00 86000 LB No Bid $0.00
4 Bagged Professional Turf Fertilizer 0-0-50 8000 LB $0.524 $4,192.00 8000 LB $0.325 $2,600.00
5 Bagged Professional Turf Fertilizer 21-0-0 12000 LB $0.268 $3,216.00 12000 LB $0.236 $2,835.60
6 Bulk Fertilizers - Professional Turf Fertilizer 0-0-50 92000 LB No Bid $0.00 92000 LB $0.320 $29,440.00
7 Bulk Fertilizers - Sulfur-Coated Urea Turf Fertilizer 38-0-0 (100% SCU) 92000 LB No Bid $0.00 92000 LB $0.470 $43,240.00
8 Bulk Fertilizer - 6-12-24 72000 LB No Bid $0.00 72000 LB $0.287 $20,664.00
9 Bulk Fertilizer - Par-Ex IBDU Greens Turf Fertilizer 21-0-0 86000 LB No Bid $0.00 86000 LB No Bid $0.00

10 Bulk Fertilizer - Professional Turf Fertilizer 15-5-10 (50% PCSCU) 40000 LB No Bid $0.00 40000 LB $0.239 $9,560.00
11 Bulk Fertilizer - Professional Turf Fertilizer 38-0-0 (100% SCU) 48000 LB No Bid $0.00 48000 LB $0.470 $22,560.00
12 Bulk Fertilizer - 15-5-10 50% PCSCU 92000 LB No Bid $0.00 92000 LB $0.239 $21,988.00

$108,942.00 $173,653.60

Discount given to other fertilizers not listed:
State the minimum order amount required to place a delivered order:

 All tabulations shown here are for informational purposes only and are subject to evaluation. Entries may contain transcription errors and do not reflect an actual award by the City until contract 
information is posted.

BID NO. 11-0034                                 BID OPENING DATE: 5/19/11 

BID TABULATION FOR AGRICULTURAL FERTILIZERS

No discout offered 
None

3% Discount
8,000 lbs


