BID TABULATION FOR WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

BID NO. 11-0102

BID OPENING DATE: May 5, 2011

Senior Buyer: Lance Wright

NAME OF BIDDERS & LOCATION

Lhoist North America

Calabrian Corporation

DPC Industries, Co.

DPC Industries, Inc

Fort Worth, TX 76107 Port Neches, TX 77651 Cleburne, TX 75013 Cleburne, TX 75013

Quantity Unit Price |Total Quantity Unit Price |Total Quantity |Unit Price |Total Quantity  |Unit Price |Total
1. Liquid Chlorine Supplied In 90 Tom Railcars 450 Tons|  No Bid $0.00 450 Tons|  No Bid $0.00 450 Tons| $438.00 $197,100.00 450 Tons|  No Bid $0.00
2. Liquid Caustic Soda, 50 Percent Sodium Hydroxide 850 Tons| No Bid $0.00 850 Tons|  No Bid $0.00 850 Tons| No Bid $0.00 850 Tons| $605.00 $514,250.00
3. Liquid Caustic Soda, 25 Percent Sodium Hydroxide 250 Tons| No Bid $0.00 250 Tons|  No Bid $0.00 250 Tons| No Bid $0.00 250 Tons| $710.00 $177,500.00
4. Sulfur Dioxide 500 Tons| No Bid $0.00 500 Tons $475.00 | $237,500.00 500 Tons| $449.95 $224,975.00 500 Tons No Bid $0.00
5. Liquid Lime Slurry 800 Tons| $151.00 $120,800.00 800 Tons| No Bid $0.00 800 Tons| No Bid $0.00 800 Tons| No Bid $0.00
Estimated Total $120,800.00 $237,500.00 $422,075.00 $691,250.00
NAME OF BIDDERS & LOCATION K.A. Steel Chemicals Altivia Corporation Valley Solvents

Lemont, IL 60439 Houston, TX 77002 Fort Worth, TX 76111

Quantity Unit Price |Total Quantity Unit Price |Total Quantity |Unit Price |Total
1. Liquid Chlorine Supplied In 90 Tom Railcars 450 Tons|  No Bid $0.00 450 Tons| $359.00 $161,550.00 450 Tons|  No Bid $0.00
2. Liquid Caustic Soda, 50 Percent Sodium Hydroxide 850 Tons| $671.29 $570,597.00 850 Tons| $602.00 $511,700.00 850 Tons| $614.00 $521,900.00
3. Liquid Caustic Soda, 25 Percent Sodium Hydroxide 250 Tons| $773.56 $193,389.00 250 Tons| $725.00 $181,250.00 250 Tons| $717.00 $179,250.00
4. Sulfur Dioxide 500 Tons| No Bid $0.00 500 Tons|  No Bid $0.00 500 Tons| No Bid $0.00
5. Liquid Lime Slurry 800 Tons| No Bid $0.00 800 Tons| No Bid $0.00 800 Tons| $182.00 $145,600.00
Estimated Total $763,986.50 $854,500.00 $846,600.00




