
Page 1 BID TABULATION FOR WATER METERS

 BID NO. 11-0113 BID OPENING DATE: MARCH 31, 2011  
 

Buyer: Lance Wright

NAME OF BIDDERS & LOCATION Master Merter, Inc.  Badger Meter  Inc. Aqua Metric Sales Company Mueller Systems, LLC  Elser AMCO Water, LLC
Mansfield, TX 76063  Milwaukee, WI 53223 Schertz, TX 78154 Cleveland, NC 27013  Ocala, FL 34474

  
Est.  Quantity Unit Price Total Est. Quantity Unit Price Total Est. Quantity Unit Price Total Est. Quantity Unit Price Total Est. Quantity Unit Price Total

1. 1 1/2" Displacement Meter  65 Each $275.00 $17,875.00 65 Each $205.00 $13,325.00 65 Each $263.70 $17,140.29 65 Each $189.00 $12,285.00  65 Each $148.00 $9,620.00
         

2. 5/8" x 3/4" Muliti Jet Meters 12,500 Each $35.50 $443,750.00 12,500 Each $43.75 $546,875.00 12,500 Each $30.79 $384,868.42 12,500 Each $31.00 $387,500.00 12,500 Each $52.00 $650,000.00
          
3. 3/4" x 3/4" Multi Jet meters 85 Each $39.25 $3,336.25 85 Each $52.00 $4,420.00 85 Each $34.96 $2,971.38 85 Each $54.00 $4,590.00 85 Each $58.00 $4,930.00

         
4. 1" Multi Jet Meter 100 Each $61.50 $6,150.00 100 Each $82.00 $8,200.00 100 Each $65.73 $6,572.63 100 Each $77.00 $7,700.00 100 Each $69.00 $6,900.00
          
5. 2" Displacement Meter 550 Each $343.75 $189,062.50 550 Each $299.00 $164,450.00 550 Each $356.88 $196,286.32 550 Each $249.00 $136,950.00 550 Each $289.00 $158,950.00

          
6. 3" Cold Combination Meter with Strainer 18 Each $1,450.00 $26,100.00  18 Each $1,399.00 $25,182.00 18 Each $1,151.40 $20,725.20 18 Each $728.00 $13,104.00 18 Each $1,300.00 $23,400.00
            
7. 4" Cold Combination Meter with Strainer 18 Each $1,905.00 $34,290.00 18 Each $1,999.00 $35,982.00 18 Each $1,999.80 $35,996.40 18 Each $934.00 $16,812.00 18 Each $1,475.00 $26,550.00
            
8. 6" Cold Combination Meter with Strainer 10 Each $3,310.00 $3,310.00 10 Each $3,200.00 $32,000.00 10 Each $3,454.20 $34,542.00 10 Each $1,839.00 $18,390.00 10 Each $2,475.00 $24,750.00

          
9. 8" Cold Combination with Strainer 5 Each $7,525.00 $37,625.00 5 Each $4,390.00 $21,950.00 5 Each $9,170.29 $45,851.45 5 Each No Bid $0.00 5 Each $4,600.00 $23,000.00

          
10. 3" Turbine with Strainer 4 Each $771.50 $3,086.00 4 Each $840.00 $3,360.00 4 Each $796.91 $3,187.64 4 Each $699.00 $2,796.00 4 Each $752.00 $3,008.00
           
11. 2" Multi Jet 10 Each $260.00 $2,600.00 10 Each No Bid $0.00 10 Each $266.12 $2,661.22 10 Each $249.00 $2,490.00 10 Each $178.00 $1,780.00

          
12. 4" Turbine Meter with Strainers 16 Each $1,185.00 $18,960.00 16 Each $1,085.00 $17,360.00 16 Each $1,551.41 $24,822.56 16 Each $1,278.00 $20,448.00 16 Each $1,235.00 $19,760.00

          
13. 6" Turbine Meter with Strainer 7 Each $2,060.00 $14,420.00 7 Each $2,190.00 $15,330.00 7 Each $2,793.05 $19,551.35 7 Each $2,299.00 $16,093.00 7 Each $1,262.00 $8,834.00
                
14. 8" Turbine Meter with Strainer 15 Each $3,050.00 $45,750.00 15 Each $3,066.00 $45,990.00 15 Each $5,141.76 $77,126.37 15 Each $3,675.00 $55,125.00 15 Each $2,000.00 $30,000.00

           
15. 8" x 2" Turbine with Strainer 1 Each $7,525.00 $7,525.00  1 Each $7,250.00 $7,250.00 1 Each $9,170.28 $9,170.28 1 Each $6,499.00 $6,499.00 1 Each No Bid $0.00
                
16. 10" x 2" Meter with Strainer 2 Each No Bid $0.00 2 Each $9,820.00 $19,640.00 2 Each $12,292.53 $24,585.06 2 Each $11,127.00 $22,254.00 2 Each No Bid $0.00
                
17. 10" Turbine With Strainer 2 Each $3,635.00 $7,270.00 2 Each $4,600.00 $9,200.00 2 Each $5,641.06 $11,282.12 2 Each $4,965.00 $9,930.00 2 Each $2,975.00 $5,950.00

          
18. 3" Fire Hydrant meter 3 Each No Bid $0.00 3 Each $550.00 $1,650.00 3 Each $1,319.61 $3,958.83 3 Each $550.00 $1,650.00 3 Each $598.00 $1,794.00

          
19. 4" Fire Hydrant Meter 3 Each No Bid $0.00 3 Each No Bid $0.00 3 Each $3,339.56 $10,018.67 3 Each No Bid $0.00 3 Each No Bid $0.00
           
20. 2" strainers 4 Each $151.00 $604.00 4 Each $250.00 $1,000.00 4 Each $243.46 $973.85 4 Each $197.00 $788.00 4 Each $142.00 $568.00
               
21. 6" strainers 4 Each $671.00 $2,684.00 4 Each $595.00 $2,380.00 4 Each $571.95 $2,287.79 4 Each $1,150.00 $4,600.00 4 Each $670.00 $2,680.00

         
22. 8" strainers 4 Each $1,025.00 $4,100.00 4 Each $1,050.00 $4,200.00 4 Each $1,077.97 $4,311.87 4 Each $1,221.00 $4,884.00 4 Each $745.00 $2,980.00
              
23. 10" Strainers 4 Each $1,350.00 $5,400.00 4 Each $1,790.00 $7,160.00 4 Each $1,203.85 $4,815.41 4 Each $1,484.00 $5,936.00 4 Each $902.00 $3,608.00
                
Estimated Total  $903,687.75   $986,904.00   $943,707.12   $750,828.00   $1,009,062.00
           
      
      

      


