BID TABULATION FOR SAND AND GREASE TRAP SERVICES

BID NO. 11-0146

BID OPENING DATE: MARCH 31, 2011

Buyer: Lance Wright

NAME OF BIDDERS & LOCATION

PSC Recovery Sy:

stems, LLC

Southwaste Disposal LLC

Sand Trap Services, Inc.

Sand Trap Services, Inc.

Dallas, TX 75212

Mansfield, TX 76063

Fort Worth, TX 76101 Pel

r Location and Tank Size

Fort Worth, TX 76101

Quantity Unit Price Total Quantity Unit Price Total Quantity Unit Price Total Type Tank Size  |Price
1. Sand Trap Removal Services Per Gallon 30,000 Gal $0.33 $9,900.00 30,000 Gal No Bid $0.00 30,000 Gal $.40 to $2.70 $19,942.00 | |Grit Trap 6000, $0.45
2. Grease Trap Removal Services Per Gallon 30,000 Gal $0.26 $7,800.00 30,000 Gal $0.17 $5,100.00 30,000 Gal $.40 to $2.70 $0.00 | |Grit Trap 3000, $0.45
3. After Hours Sand Trap Removal Services Per Gallon 100 Gal $3.10 $310.00 100 Gal No Bid $0.00 100 Gal No Bid $0.00 | |Grit Trap 1500 $0.45
4. After Hours Grease Trap Removal Services Per Gallon 100 Gal $3.10 $310.00 100 Gal $0.20 $20.00 100 Gal No Bid $0.00 | |Grit Trap 1200 $0.40
5. Removal From East and West Fuel Grit Trap 1000 $0.40
Tank Separators Per Gallon 500,000 Gal $0.60 $300,000.00 500,000 Gal $0.25 $125,000.00 500,000 Gal $.35/$.82 $310,360.00
Grit Trap 800, $0.46
6. Hydro Jetting of Water Lines Per Hour 10 Hours $300.00 $3,000.00 10 Hours $150.00 $1,500.00 10 Hours No Bid $0.00
Grit Trap 600, $0.48
7. State Response Time From Receipt of Service Requested Hour 48 Hours 48 Hours Hour 30 Days 30 Days Hour N/A N/A
Grit Trap 500, $0.55
8. Must State Name and Address of Sludge Disposal Site Location PCS PCS Location Mansfield, TX Mansfield, TX Location Cold Springs/BF1|Cold Springs/BFI
Grit Trap 100, $1.65
9. Trip Charge or Minimum Charge if Rquired 1 Each $250.00 $250.00 1 Each $150.00 $150.00 1 Each No Bid $0.00
Grease Trap| 75| $2.70
Total $321,570.00 $131,770.00 $20,270.00
NAME OF BIDDERS & LOCATION Cactus Environmental Services Liquid Environmental Solutions Liquid Environmental Solutions Sand Trap Services, Inc.
Dallas, TX 75212 Irving, TX 75063 Bid 2 Irving, TX 75063 Bid 1 ‘ Fort Worth, TX 76101
Prices Based On Quarterly Frequency Prices Based On Call Frequency
Quantity Unit Price Total Quantity Unit Price Total Quantity Unit Price Total Type Tank Size  |Price
1. Sand Trap Removal Services Per Gallon 30,000 Gal $0.32 $9,600.00 30,000 Gal $0.32 $9,600.00 30,000 Gal $0.38 $11,400.00 | |Grit Trap 6000, $0.45
2. Grease Trap Removal Services Per Gallon 30,000 Gal No Bid $0.00 30,000 Gal $0.22 $6,570.00 30,000 Gal $0.26 $7,800.00 | |Grit Trap 3000, $0.45
3. After Hours Sand Trap Removal Services Per Gallon 100 Gal $0.64 $64.00 100 Gal $0.96 $96.00 100 Gal $1.15 $115.00 | |Grit Trap 1500 $0.45
4. After Hours Grease Trap Removal Services Per Gallon 100 Gal No Bid $0.00 100 Gal $0.46 $46.00 100 Gal $0.55 $55.00 | |Grit Trap 1200 $0.40
5. Removal From East and West Fuel Grit Trap 1000 $0.40
Tank Separators Per Gallon 500,000 Gal No Bid $0.00 500,000 Gal No Bid $0.00 500,000 Gal No Bid $0.00
Grit Trap 800, $0.46
6. Hydro Jetting of Water Lines Per Hour 10 Hours $140.00 $1,400.00 10 Hours $75.00 $750.00 10 Hours $75.00 $750.00
Grit Trap 600, $0.48
7. State Response Time From Receipt of Service Requested Hour 4 Hours 4 Hours Hour 48 Hours 48 Hours Hour 48 Hours 48 Hours
Grit Trap 500, $0.55
8. Must State Name and Address of Sludge Disposal Site Location Cold Springs Cold Springs Location LES LES Location LES LES
Grit Trap 100| $1.65
9. Trip Charge or Minimum Charge if Rquired 1 Each $425.00 $425.00 1 Each $150.00 $150.00 1 Each $150.00 $150.00
Per Load Minimum Minimum Grease Trap| 75, $2.70
Total $11,489.00 $17,212.00 $20,270.00




