
Page 4 of 4 BID TABULATION FOR UNARMED SECURITY GUARD SERVICES

 BID NO. 10-428  BID OPENING DATE: AUGUST 26, 2010  
 

Buyer: Lance Wright

NAME OF BIDDERS & LOCATION MPI Protective Service Corp.  Flashlite Security
Fort Worth, TX 76155  Fort Worth, TX 76185

Est. Quantity Unit Price Total Est. Quantity Unit Price Total
1. Security Guard Services for Public Library Locations 10,000 HR No Bid $0.00 10,000 HR No Bid $0.00

2. Security Guard Services for Guinn Complex, 10,000 HR No Bid $0.00 10,000 HR $15.00 $150,000.00
    Business Assistance Center

3. Security Guard Services for Botanic Gardens 10,000 HR $21.05 $210,500.00 10,000 HR No Bid $0.00

4. Security Guard Services for Rolling Hills, 10,000 HR No Bid $0.00 10,000 HR No Bid $0.00
    Soccer Complex 

5. Security Guard Services for Hazel Harvey Peace 5,000 HR No Bid $0.00  5,000 HR No Bid $0.00
    Center    

6. Security Guard Services for Community Center 5,000 HR No Bid $0.00 5,000 HR No Bid $0.00
    Locations       

7. Security Guard Services for Downtown Area Buildings 2,000 HR No Bid $0.00 2,000 HR No Bid $0.00

8. Security Guard Services for Water Department 10,000 HR $20.85 $208,500.00 10,000 HR No Bid $0.00
    Locations 
    Estimated Total $419,000.00 $150,000.00

   
    

   


