
 BID NO. 11-0084  BID OPENING DATE: 02/24/2011
 

Buyer: Cristina Camarillo

NAME OF BIDDER & LOCATION Turfgrass of Texas  North Texas Hypromulching and Services LLC King Ranch Turfgrass Grey Construction
Granbury, Texas 76048  Argyle, Texas 76226 Benbrook, Texas 76126 Arlington, Texas 76018

Unit of Unit of Unit of Unit of 
 Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Quantity Issue Unit Price Total  Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Quantity Issue Unit Price Total

Common Bermuda Grass Sod, installed. 50000 SQYD $1.98 $99,000.00 50000 SQYD $1.90 $95,000.00 50000 SQYD $2.49 $124,500.00 50000 SQYD $2.70 $135,000.00
Common Bermuda Grass Sod, loose, installed. 8000 SQYD $1.98 $15,840.00 8000 SQYD $2.25 $18,000.00 8000 SQYD $2.49 $19,920.00 8000 SQYD $2.74 $21,920.00
Common Bermuda Grass Sod, loose, not installed. 8000 SQYD $1.25 $10,000.00 8000 SQYD $1.40 $11,200.00 8000 SQYD $1.89 $15,120.00 8000 SQYD $2.25 $18,000.00
Raleigh St. Augustine Sod, installed 50000 SQYD $2.35 $117,500.00 50000 SQYD $2.90 $145,000.00 50000 SQYD $2.79 $139,500.00 50000 SQYD $3.10 $155,000.00
Raleigh St. Augustine Sod, loose, installed. 8200 SQYD $2.35 $19,270.00 8200 SQYD $3.20 $26,240.00 8200 SQYD $2.79 $22,878.00 8200 SQYD $3.15 $25,830.00
Raleigh St. Augustine Sod, loose, not installed. 8200 SQYD $1.95 $15,990.00 8200 SQYD $2.78 $22,796.00 8200 SQYD $2.25 $18,450.00 8200 SQYD $2.55 $20,910.00
Bermuda Tifway 419 Sod, loose, installed. 10000 SQYD $2.10 $21,000.00 10000 SQYD $2.20 $22,000.00 10000 SQYD $2.49 $24,900.00 10000 SQYD $2.74 $27,400.00
Bermuda Tifway 419 Sod, loose, not installed. 7200 SQYD $1.25 $9,000.00 7200 SQYD $1.40 $10,080.00 7200 SQYD $1.89 $13,608.00 7200 SQYD $2.25 $16,200.00
Hydro Mulch Grass Seeding 100000 SQYD $0.25 $25,000.00 100000 SQYD $0.34 $34,000.00 100000 SQYD $0.54 $54,000.00 100000 SQYD $0.35 $35,000.00
Zoysia sod, loose, installed. 1000 SQYD $2.95 $2,950.00 1000 SQYD $4.85 $4,850.00 1000 SQYD $4.15 $4,150.00 1000 SQYD $4.85 $4,850.00
Zoysia sod, loose, not installed. 1000 SQYD $2.60 $2,600.00 1000 SQYD $4.10 $4,100.00 1000 SQYD $3.50 $3,500.00 1000 SQYD $3.95 $3,950.00
Buffalo grass 609 sod, installed. 250 SQYD $4.00 $1,000.00 250 SQYD $4.75 $1,187.50 250 SQYD $3.75 $937.50 250 SQYD $4.80 $1,200.00
Buffalo grass 609 sod, not installed. 250 SQYD $3.00 $750.00 250 SQYD $4.00 $1,000.00 250 SQYD $3.00 $750.00 250 SQYD $4.00 $1,000.00
Annual Rye Grass Seed - 95% purity, 85% germination. Packaged in 50 
pound bags. 25 BAG $27.50 $687.50 25 BAG $32.50 $812.50 25 BAG $25.90 $647.50 25 BAG $45.00 $1,125.00
K-31 Fescue Grass Seed - 97% purity, 90% germination. Packaged in 
50 pound bags. 25 BAG $48.50 $1,212.50 25 BAG $51.75 $1,293.75 25 BAG $75.00 $1,875.00 25 BAG $65.00 $1,625.00
Common Bermuda Grass Seed - 95% purity, 90% germination, hulled. 
Packaged in 50 pound bags. 40 BAG $195.00 $7,800.00 40 BAG $185.00 $7,400.00 40 BAG $185.00 $7,400.00 40 BAG $220.00 $8,800.00

Certified "Rebel" Turf Type Fescue Seed. Packaged in 50 pound bags. 56 BAG $48.50 $2,716.00 56 BAG $68.50 $3,836.00 56 BAG $75.00 $4,200.00 56 BAG $250.00 $14,000.00
Delivery charge for bagged products and loose sod items. 10 EACH $40.00 $400.00 10 EACH $35.00 $350.00 10 EACH $55.00 $550.00 10 EACH $350.00 $3,500.00

Estimated total: $352,716.00 $409,145.75 $456,886.00 $495,310.00

State the minimum order amount required to place a delivered order: 

BID TABULATION FOR GRASS SEED AND SOD

NONE 1 SY$50.00 minimum order NONE

*Non-Responsive: Did not submit required 
documentation. 
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Killiam Farms Inc Trublue Services LLC Winfield Solutions Justin Seed Company
Rockwell, Texas 75087 Fort Worth, Texas 76179 Carrollton, Texas 75006 Justin, Texas 76247

Unit of Unit of Unit of Unit of 
 Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Quantity Issue Unit Price Total  Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Quantity Issue Unit Price Total

Common Bermuda Grass Sod, installed. 50000 SQYD $2.35 $117,500.00 50000 SQYD $2.80 $140,000.00 50000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 50000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Common Bermuda Grass Sod, loose, installed. 8000 SQYD $2.35 $18,800.00 8000 SQYD $2.80 $22,400.00 8000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 8000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Common Bermuda Grass Sod, loose, not installed. 8000 SQYD $1.77 $14,160.00 8000 SQYD $2.40 $19,200.00 8000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 8000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Raleigh St. Augustine Sod, installed 50000 SQYD $4.18 $209,000.00 50000 SQYD $4.65 $232,500.00 50000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 50000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Raleigh St. Augustine Sod, loose, installed. 8200 SQYD $4.18 $34,276.00 8200 SQYD $4.65 $38,130.00 8200 SQYD No Bid $0.00 8200 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Raleigh St. Augustine Sod, loose, not installed. 8200 SQYD $3.61 $29,602.00 8200 SQYD $4.25 $34,850.00 8200 SQYD No Bid $0.00 8200 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Bermuda Tifway 419 Sod, loose, installed. 10000 SQYD $2.35 $23,500.00 10000 SQYD $2.80 $28,000.00 10000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 10000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Bermuda Tifway 419 Sod, loose, not installed. 7200 SQYD $1.77 $12,744.00 7200 SQYD $2.80 $20,160.00 7200 SQYD No Bid $0.00 7200 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Hydro Mulch Grass Seeding 100000 SQYD $0.81 $81,000.00 100000 SQYD $0.50 $50,000.00 100000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 100000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Zoysia sod, loose, installed. 1000 SQYD $4.18 $4,180.00 1000 SQYD $5.65 $5,650.00 1000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 1000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Zoysia sod, loose, not installed. 1000 SQYD $3.61 $3,610.00 1000 SQYD $5.25 $5,250.00 1000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 1000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Buffalo grass 609 sod, installed. 250 SQYD $4.04 $1,010.00 250 SQYD $7.10 $1,775.00 250 SQYD No Bid $0.00 250 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Buffalo grass 609 sod, not installed. 250 SQYD $3.46 $865.00 250 SQYD $6.75 $1,687.50 250 SQYD No Bid $0.00 250 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Annual Rye Grass Seed - 95% purity, 85% germination. Packaged in
50 pound bags. 25 BAG $26.74 $668.50 25 BAG $29.00 $725.00 25 BAG No Bid $0.00 25 BAG $24.50 $612.50
K-31 Fescue Grass Seed - 97% purity, 90% germination. Packaged 
in 50 pound bags. 25 BAG $58.34 $1,458.50 25 BAG $33.00 $825.00 25 BAG No Bid $0.00 25 BAG $43.50 $1,087.50
Common Bermuda Grass Seed - 95% purity, 90% germination, 
hulled. Packaged in 50 pound bags. 40 BAG $212.71 $8,508.40 40 BAG $260.00 $10,400.00 40 BAG $155.55 $6,222.00 40 BAG $178.50 $7,140.00
Certified "Rebel" Turf Type Fescue Seed. Packaged in 50 pound 
bags. 56 BAG $60.78 $3,403.68 56 BAG $35.00 $1,960.00 56 BAG No Bid $0.00 56 BAG $58.60 $3,281.60
Delivery charge for bagged products and loose sod items. 10 EACH $500.00 $5,000.00 10 EACH $120.00 $1,200.00 10 EACH No Bid $0.00 10 EACH $75.00 $750.00

Estimated total: $569,286.08 $614,712.50 $6,222.00 $12,871.60

State the minimum order amount required to place a delivered order

*Non-Responsive: Did not bid on all items. *Non-Responsive: Did not bid on all items.

NONE NONE 1 BagNONE
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Pennington Seed, Inc
Excel Garden Products John Deere Landscapes
Grand Prairie, Texas 75051 Cleveland, Ohio 44114

Unit of Unit of 
 Quantity Issue Unit Price Total Quantity Issue Unit Price Total

Common Bermuda Grass Sod, installed. 50000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 50000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Common Bermuda Grass Sod, loose, installed. 8000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 8000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Common Bermuda Grass Sod, loose, not installed. 8000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 8000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Raleigh St. Augustine Sod, installed 50000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 50000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Raleigh St. Augustine Sod, loose, installed. 8200 SQYD No Bid $0.00 8200 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Raleigh St. Augustine Sod, loose, not installed. 8200 SQYD No Bid $0.00 8200 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Bermuda Tifway 419 Sod, loose, installed. 10000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 10000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Bermuda Tifway 419 Sod, loose, not installed. 7200 SQYD No Bid $0.00 7200 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Hydro Mulch Grass Seeding 100000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 100000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Zoysia sod, loose, installed. 1000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 1000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Zoysia sod, loose, not installed. 1000 SQYD No Bid $0.00 1000 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Buffalo grass 609 sod, installed. 250 SQYD No Bid $0.00 250 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Buffalo grass 609 sod, not installed. 250 SQYD No Bid $0.00 250 SQYD No Bid $0.00
Annual Rye Grass Seed - 95% purity, 85% germination. Packaged 
in 50 pound bags. 25 BAG $23.17 $579.25 25 BAG $22.50 $562.50
K-31 Fescue Grass Seed - 97% purity, 90% germination. Packaged 
in 50 pound bags. 25 BAG $29.95 $748.75 25 BAG $27.00 $675.00
Common Bermuda Grass Seed - 95% purity, 90% germination, 
hulled. Packaged in 50 pound bags. 40 BAG $159.00 $6,360.00 40 BAG $168.50 $6,740.00
Certified "Rebel" Turf Type Fescue Seed. Packaged in 50 pound 
bags. 56 BAG $34.92 $1,955.52 56 BAG $38.50 $2,156.00
Delivery charge for bagged products and loose sod items. 10 EACH $0.00 $0.00 10 EACH $40.00 $400.00

Estimated total: $9,643.52 $10,533.50

State the minimum order amount required to place a delivered order

*Non-Responsive: Did not bid on all items. *Non-Responsive: Did not bid on all items.

NONE 1000 Lbs on custom blend seed only. No 
minimum on "in-stock items.
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